
DGK 02.001SUPP2 Part C_Attachment CONFIDENTIAL 
Page 26 of 50IAWC Exhibit 15.01SR - Public Redacted 

Page 340 of 447



DGK 02.001SUPP2 Part C_Attachment CONFIDENTIAL 
Page 27 of 50IAWC Exhibit 15.01SR - Public Redacted 

Page 341 of 447



DGK 02.001SUPP2 Part C_Attachment CONFIDENTIAL 
Page 28 of 50IAWC Exhibit 15.01SR - Public Redacted 

Page 342 of 447



DGK 02.001SUPP2 Part C_Attachment CONFIDENTIAL 
Page 29 of 50IAWC Exhibit 15.01SR - Public Redacted 

Page 343 of 447



Timesheet Comments By Project Combined

060697 - IL Amc Water Co - 2016 Rate Case

13671  Constance E. Heppenstall Co - Org:   003 - 330250

Period End Date

04/15/2016

Project.Phase.Task Timesheet Comment Work Date Reg Hours OT Hours

060697.200.**** 04/04/2016  -   2.00

060697.200.**** 04/08/2016  -   0.50

060697.200.**** 04/13/2016  -   1.50

Assisting with drafting  AG DR's 
Assisting with AG DR's 
Assisting with AG data requests

Period End Date

04/29/2016

Project.Phase.Task Timesheet Comment Work Date Reg Hours OT Hours

060697.200.**** 04/25/2016  -   0.50

060697.200.**** 04/27/2016  -   2.00

Assist with AG Set 3 DR

Drafting responses to IIWC-FEA data requests
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Timesheet Comments By Project Combined

060697 - IL Amc Water Co - 2016 Rate Case

05718  Paul R. Herbert Co - Org:   003 - 331050

Period End Date

04/15/2016

Project.Phase.Task Timesheet Comment Work Date Reg Hours OT Hours

060697.200.**** 04/03/2016  4.00 -  DR Responses

060697.200.**** 04/04/2016  -   1.00DR Responses

060697.200.**** 04/05/2016  -   1.00DR Responses

060697.200.**** 04/06/2016  -   2.00DR Responses

060697.200.**** 04/12/2016  -   1.00DR Responses

060697.200.**** 04/13/2016  -   1.00DR Responses

Period End Date

04/29/2016

Project.Phase.Task Timesheet Comment Work Date Reg Hours OT Hours

060697.200.**** 04/18/2016  -   1.00DR Responses

060697.200.**** 04/19/2016  -   2.00DR Responses

060697.200.**** 04/20/2016  -   3.00DR Responses

060697.200.**** 04/21/2016  -   1.00DR Responses

060697.200.**** 04/27/2016  -   1.00DR Responses
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Timesheet Comments By Project Combined

060697 - IL Amc Water Co - 2016 Rate Case

05294  Support Staff Co - Org:   003 - 331001

Period End Date

04/15/2016

Project.Phase.Task Timesheet Comment Work Date Reg Hours OT Hours

060697.200.**** 04/13/2016  -   1.00Administrative

Period End Date

04/29/2016

Project.Phase.Task Timesheet Comment Work Date Reg Hours OT Hours

060697.200.**** 04/25/2016  -   0.50Administrative

060697.200.**** 04/27/2016  -   0.50Administrative
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June 10, 2016 
 
 
 
Mr. Rich Kerckhove 
Manager, Rates and Regulation 
Illinois-American Water Company 
727 Craig Road 
Saint Louis, MO  63141 
 
Dear Mr. Kerckhove: 
 

Enclosed please find my initial invoice for the cost of equity testimony in your Virginia-
American Water Company rate case.  This invoice covers my time for the preparation of direct 
cost of equity testimony including a first draft provided December 1, 2015, a second draft 
provided on January 4, 2016, a third draft provided on January 12, 2016, and for the testimony 
that was finalized on January 15, 2016 and for conference calls on October 30, 2015, November 
16, 2015, and December 10, 2015. 

I believe this invoice is self-explanatory, and would appreciate it if you would place the 
enclosed in line for payment.  Please note that as of January 1, 2001 we changed the form of our 
business organization.  Therefore, I have enclosed Form W-9 which you can pass along to your 
accounts payable department.   

 

      Sincerely, 

    
  Paul R. Moul 

 

/mt 
Enclosure 

P. MOUL & ASSOCIATES 
251 HOPKINS ROAD 

HADDONFIELD, NJ 08033 
TELEPHONE: 856.428.7515 • E-MAIL: prmoul@verizon.net 
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EIN# 22-3282661 
 

June 10, 2016 
Case No. 1603 

 
 

ILLINOIS-AMERICAN WATER COMPANY 
 
 

For professional services rendered by Paul R. Moul, 
Managing Consultant, for the preparation of direct 
cost of equity testimony including a first draft 
provided December 1, 2015, a second draft provided 
on January 4, 2016, a third draft provided on January 
12, 2016, and for the testimony that was finalized on 
January 15, 2016 and for conference calls on 
October 30, 2015, November 16, 2015, and 
December 10, 2015 

 

Consultant Hours Rate Amount

P. Moul 88

Clerical 25.00        

Reimbursement of out-of-pocket costs  
 consisting of and telephone charges 7.00               

           TOTAL 27,327.00$    

 

P. MOUL & ASSOCIATES 
251 HOPKINS ROAD 

HADDONFIELD, NJ 08033 
TELEPHONE: 856.428.7515 • E-MAIL: prmoul@verizon.net 
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INVOICE FOR LEGAL SERVICES TO 
ILLINOIS-AMERICAN WATER CO. 

  

REMIT TO: 

WHITT STURTEVANT LLP 
THE KEYBANK BUILDING 
88 E. BROAD STREET, SUITE 1590 
COLUMBUS, OHIO 43215 
 
TAX ID: 45-4307472 

MATTER: 2016 RATE CASE 
INVOICE DATE: APRIL 11, 2016 

INVOICE NUMBER: 11786 
TOTAL DUE: $39,186.25 

 
Services rendered for the period: 
March 1, 2016 – March 31, 2016 

 
Date Timekeeper Description Hours Amount 

  3/1/2016 K.E.R. Review/edit list of municipalities for filing 5.00   
 

  3/1/2016 K.E.R. Review prior DRs regarding . 1.30   
 

  3/1/2016 A.M.Z. Review/edit errata items. 0.50   
 

  3/1/2016 A.M.Z. Review/analyze updated rate design schedules. 0.10  
 

  3/1/2016 A.M.Z. Exchange emails with Staff counsel and client re 
DRs. 

0.70   
 

  3/1/2016 A.M.Z. Internal conferences re errata, instanter motion, 
discovery. 

0.60   
 

  3/1/2016 A.M.Z. Review/edit filing with municipalities list. 0.30   
 

  3/1/2016 H.C. Review/edit errata. 0.90   
 

  3/1/2016 H.C. Review/edit data request responses. 1.30   
 

  3/1/2016 A.D.S. Review /edit data responses. 1.50   
 

  3/1/2016 A.D.S. Review staff data requests. 0.30   
 

  3/1/2016 A.D.S. Confs w/ client and legal team re data responses. 0.30   
 

  3/1/2016 M.A.W. Review/edit draft DR responses 1.00   
 

  3/1/2016 M.A.W. Confer internally re: status of outstanding DRs and 
work assignments 

0.60   
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  3/2/2016 K.E.R. Draft/revise Errata. 2.00   
 

  3/2/2016 K.E.R. Review/update DR log. 2.40   
 

  3/2/2016 M.A.W. Review/edit draft DR responses 0.75   
 

  3/2/2016 A.M.Z. Review/edit DR responses. 2.90   
 

  3/2/2016 A.M.Z. Draft/revise agreed case schedule; exchange emails 
with Staff counsel re same. 

0.40   
 

  3/2/2016 A.M.Z. Call with Mr. Kerckhove re DRs. 0.20  
 

  3/2/2016 A.M.Z. Internal conferences/emails re strategy for DRs, 
revised Part 285 schedules, instanter motion. 

0.70   
 

  3/2/2016 A.M.Z. Review/edit instanter motion. 0.90   
 

  3/2/2016 A.M.Z. Review/analyze Staff DRs. 0.30   
 

  3/2/2016 H.C. Draft/revise motion to enter Exhibit 11.03. 1.60   
 

  3/2/2016 H.C. Review/edit data request responses. 0.20  
 

  3/2/2016 H.C. Confsw/ client and legal teams re discovery 
responses. 

1.10   
 

  3/2/2016 A.D.S. Email corres w/ legal team re data responses. 0.50   
 

  3/2/2016 A.D.S. Review staff data requests. 0.80   
 

  3/2/2016 A.D.S. Review /edit motion for leave to file rate design 
exhibit. 

0.50   
 

  3/3/2016 K.E.R. Review/update DR log. 0.40  
 

  3/3/2016 M.A.W. Conference call with client re: outstanding DRs 0.50   
 

  3/3/2016 A.M.Z. Internal conference re status of 
 

0.20  
 

  3/3/2016 A.M.Z. Exchange emails with legal team re 
. 

0.10  
 

  3/3/2016 A.M.Z. Review/edit instanter motion and errata. 1.10   
 

  3/3/2016 H.C. Draft/revise motion to enter Exhibit 11.03. 0.60   
 

  3/3/2016 H.C. Participate in call w/ client re data request 
responses. 

0.50   
 

  3/3/2016 A.D.S. Email corres w/ legal team re data responses. 0.50   
 

  3/3/2016 A.D.S. Internal confs re status of discovery. 0.20  
 

  3/3/2016 A.D.S. Review /edit motion for leave to file rate design 
exhibit. 

0.40   
 

  3/4/2016 M.A.W. Draft/revise DR responses re: 2.00   
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  3/4/2016 K.E.R. Review  work papers. 0.50  

 
  3/4/2016 K.E.R. Review/update DR log. 0.10  

 
  3/4/2016 A.M.Z. Research for DR responses. 0.20  

 
  3/4/2016 A.M.Z. Exchange emails with legal team re 

. 
0.10  

 
  3/4/2016 A.M.Z. Review/analyze Peoria notice of appearance. 0.10  

 
  3/4/2016 H.C. Correspondence w/ client re motion to enter Exhibit 

11.03. 
0.30  

 
  3/4/2016 H.C. Research re  0.60   

 
  3/4/2016 A.D.S. Research for data responses. 1.00   

 
  3/4/2016 A.D.S. Review /edit data responses. 0.50   

 
  3/7/2016 K.E.R. Review/edit draft instanter motion and 

corresponding exhibits. 
1.80   

 
  3/7/2016 A.M.Z. Review/edit instanter motion and errata. 0.30   

 
  3/7/2016 A.M.Z. Draft/revise email to Staff counsel re instanter 

motion. 
0.10  

 
  3/7/2016 H.C. Draft/revise motion to enter Exhibit 11.03. 0.70   

 
  3/7/2016 H.C. Correspondence w/ legal team re data request 

responses. 
0.20  

 
  3/7/2016 A.D.S. Conf w/ K. Jones re 

 
0.30   

 
  3/8/2016 A.M.Z. Review/edit protective order motion per client 

comments. 
0.20  

 
  3/8/2016 A.M.Z. Review/analyze notice of prehearing conference. 0.10  

 
  3/8/2016 A.M.Z. Review/edit DR responses. 1.90   

 
  3/8/2016 A.M.Z. Review/analyze Staff DRs. 0.10  

 
  3/8/2016 H.C. Review/edit data request responses. 0.60   

 
  3/8/2016 H.C. Participate in call w/ client re data request 

responses. 
0.50   

 
  3/8/2016 A.D.S. Research re

 
0.40   

 
  3/8/2016 A.D.S. Review /edit data responses. 0.50   

 
  3/9/2016 M.A.W. Review/edit DR responses 0.50   

 
  3/9/2016 A.M.Z. Review/analyze Staff DRs. 0.20  
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  3/9/2016 A.M.Z. Review/edit DR responses. 0.70   
 

  3/9/2016 A.M.Z. Attend DR review call. 0.20  
 

  3/9/2016 A.M.Z. Exchange emails with Staff counsel re case 
schedule. 

0.10  
 

  3/9/2016 A.M.Z. Internal conference re case schedule. 0.20  
 

  3/9/2016 A.M.Z. Research re DR strategy. 0.70   
 

  3/9/2016 A.M.Z. Exchange emails with witnesses re DRs. 0.20  
 

  3/9/2016 A.D.S. Review / edit data responses. 0.50   
 

  3/9/2016 A.D.S. Confs w/ client re data responses. 0.40   
 

  3/9/2016 A.D.S. Conf w/ A. Zehr re case scheduling. 0.20  
 

  3/10/2016 A.M.Z. Review/analyze IIWC petition to intervene and 
DRs. 

0.10  
 

  3/10/2016 A.M.Z. Review/edit DR responses. 1.90   
 

  3/10/2016 A.M.Z. Call with R. Kerckhove re DRs. 0.40   
 

  3/10/2016 A.D.S. Conf w/ client team re data responses. 0.50   
 

  3/10/2016 A.D.S. Review /edit data responses. 0.30   
 

  3/11/2016 A.D.S. Conf w/ client team re data responses. 0.20  
 

  3/11/2016 A.D.S. Review /edit data responses. 0.30   
 

  3/14/2016 K.E.R. Review/update DR log. 1.30   
 

  3/14/2016 K.E.R. Review/edit draft errata. 0.30  
 

  3/14/2016 A.M.Z. Review/analyze errata and DR responses. 0.30   
 

  3/15/2016 K.E.R. Review/update DR log. 0.60  
 

  3/15/2016 K.E.R. Draft instanter motion for leave to file supplemental 
direct testimony and corresponding testimony. 

1.20   
 

  3/15/2016 A.D.S. Review /edit data responses. 0.50   
 

  3/15/2016 A.D.S. Communications w/ client re data responses. 0.30   
 

  3/15/2016 A.M.Z. Call with R. Kerckhove re DRs. 0.20  
 

  3/15/2016 A.M.Z. Review/analyze Staff DRs. 0.10  
 

  3/15/2016 A.M.Z. Internal email exchange re status of discovery. 0.20  
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  3/15/2016 A.M.Z. Review/analyze public comments on eDocket. 0.20  

 
  3/16/2016 K.E.R. Review/update DR log. 0.50  

 
  3/16/2016 K.E.R. Review/edit draft errata. 0.30  

 
  3/16/2016 K.E.R. Draft/revise verification for Motion for Entry of 

Protective Order. 
0.20  

 
  3/16/2016 M.A.W. Review/analyze supporting documentation re: 0.40   

 
  3/16/2016 A.D.S. Review /edit data responses. 0.50   

 
  3/16/2016 A.D.S. Confs w/ client team re data responses. 0.40   

 
  3/16/2016 A.D.S. Review / edit supplemental direct testimony. 1.00   

 
  3/16/2016 A.M.Z. Review/analyze Staff DRs. 0.30   

 
  3/16/2016 A.M.Z. Exchange emails with legal team re DRs. 0.10  

 
  3/16/2016 A.M.Z. Review/edit errata. 0.70   

 
  3/16/2016 A.M.Z. Exchange emails with K. Jones re protective order 

motion. 
0.20  

 
  3/17/2016 M.A.W. Phone conference with client re: draft data 

responses. 
0.50   

 
  3/17/2016 K.E.R. Review/research prior DRs. 0.40  

 
  3/17/2016 K.E.R. Review/update DR log. 0.70   

 
  3/17/2016 A.D.S. Review /edit data responses. 0.50   

 
  3/17/2016 A.D.S. Attend weekly case update call. 0.30   

 
  3/17/2016 A.D.S. Review Staff data requests. 0.40   

 
  3/17/2016 A.M.Z. Draft/revise email to R. Kerckhove re errata. 0.10  

 
  3/17/2016 A.M.Z. Review/analyze Staff DRs. 0.10  

 
  3/18/2016 K.E.R. Review/update DR log. 0.20  

 
  3/18/2016 M.A.W. Confer internally re: 

 
0.50   

 
  3/18/2016 H.C. Review/edit data request responses. 1.80   

 
  3/18/2016 A.D.S. Email corres w/ legal team re data responses. 0.50   

 
  3/18/2016 A.D.S. Conf w/ R. Kerkchove re data responses. 0.20  
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  3/18/2016 A.D.S. Review /edit data responses. 0.50   
 

  3/18/2016 A.M.Z. Exchange emails with legal team re 
. 

0.70   
 

  3/18/2016 A.M.Z. Review/edit protective order motion. 0.80   
 

  3/18/2016 A.M.Z. Review/edit DR responses. 0.30   
 

  3/18/2016 A.M.Z. Exchange emails with client and legal team re DRs. 1.60   
 

  3/20/2016 A.D.S. Review /edit data responses. 0.50   
 

  3/20/2016 A.D.S. Review /edit supplemental direct testimony. 0.30   
 

  3/20/2016 A.D.S. Revew /edit protective order. 0.40   
 

  3/21/2016 K.E.R. Review/edit motion for protective order. 2.00   
 

  3/21/2016 K.E.R. Review/edit motion to file supplemental direct 
testimony. 

0.20  
 

  3/21/2016 M.A.W. Review/edit DR responses re:  0.50   
 

  3/21/2016 H.C. Review/edit data request responses. 1.40   
 

  3/21/2016 H.C. Participate in call w/ client re data request 
responses. 

0.80   
 

  3/21/2016 A.D.S. Email corres w/ legal team re discovery responses. 0.30   
 

  3/21/2016 A.M.Z. Review/analyze municipal notices of appearance. 0.10  
 

  3/21/2016 A.M.Z. Exchange emails with counsel re case schedule, 
prehearing conference. 

0.20  
 

  3/21/2016 A.M.Z. Review/edit DR responses. 2.60   
 

  3/21/2016 A.M.Z. Exchange emails with legal team and Staff counsel 
re DR turnaround times. 

0.20  
 

  3/21/2016 A.M.Z. Review/edit protective order motion. 0.40   
 

  3/22/2016 K.E.R. Review/update DR log. 1.40   
 

  3/22/2016 K.E.R. Review/edit draft DR response. 0.40  
 

  3/22/2016 H.C. Review/edit data request responses. 0.80   
 

  3/22/2016 H.C. Attend pre-hearing conference. 1.50   
 

  3/22/2016 A.D.S. Email corres w/ legal team re discovery responses. 0.40   
 

  3/22/2016 A.M.Z. Prepare for/attend prehearing conference. 1.80   
 

  3/22/2016 A.M.Z. Review/edit DR responses. 3.80   
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  3/22/2016 A.M.Z. Attend DR review call. 1.40   

 
  3/22/2016 A.M.Z. Draft/revise email to client re prehearing 

conference. 
0.40   

 
  3/23/2016 M.A.W. Review/analyze DR responses re: 0.50   

 
  3/23/2016 H.C. Draft/revise Kerckhove supplemental direct. 0.70   

 
  3/23/2016 H.C. Review data request response attachments. 0.20  

 
  3/23/2016 A.D.S. Email corres w/ legal team re discovery responses. 0.20  

 
  3/23/2016 C.W.F. Review/edit data request responses. 0.30   

 
  3/23/2016 A.M.Z. Research for DR response. 0.20  

 
  3/23/2016 A.M.Z. Review/analyze Staff DRs. 0.10  

 
  3/23/2016 A.M.Z. Exchange emails with Staff counsel and client re 

DR responses. 
0.10  

 
  3/23/2016 A.M.Z. Review/edit DR responses. 5.10   

 
  3/23/2016 A.M.Z. Prepare for/attend DR review call. 1.90   

 
  3/23/2016 A.M.Z. Review/edit supplemental direct testimony filing. 0.60   

 
  3/24/2016 K.E.R. Review/edit draft supplemental testimony. 0.30  

 
  3/24/2016 K.E.R. Review/update DR log. 0.30  

 
  3/24/2016 A.M.Z. Exchange emails with Staff counsel and client team 

re DR responses. 
0.10  

 
  3/24/2016 A.M.Z. Review/analyze Staff DRs. 0.10  

 
  3/24/2016 A.M.Z. Review/edit supplemental direct testimony filing 

and errata. 
0.90   

 
  3/24/2016 A.M.Z. Review/edit DR response. 0.10  

 
  3/25/2016 K.E.R. Review/update DR log. 1.00   

 
  3/25/2016 A.D.S. Review data requests. 0.40   

 
  3/25/2016 A.M.Z. Review/analyze . 0.20  

 
  3/25/2016 A.M.Z. Exchange emails with client re DR responses. 0.10  

 
  3/25/2016 A.M.Z. Review/analyze Staff DRs. 0.10  

 
  3/28/2016 K.E.R. Review/update DR log. 0.90   
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  3/28/2016 A.D.S. Review data requests. 0.40   
 

  3/28/2016 A.M.Z. Exchange emails with legal team and client re DR 
responses. 

0.40   
 

  3/28/2016 A.M.Z. Review/analyze AG DRs. 0.20  
 

  3/28/2016 A.M.Z. Exchange emails with AG counsel and client re AG 
DRs. 

0.30   
 

  3/29/2016 K.E.R. Review/update DR log. 1.20   
 

  3/29/2016 H.C. Review/edit data request responses. 0.40   
 

  3/29/2016 C.W.F. Review/edit data request responses. 0.30   
 

  3/29/2016 A.M.Z. Exchange emails with client and AG counsel re 
DRs. 

0.10  
 

  3/29/2016 A.M.Z. Review/edit DR responses. 1.00   
 

  3/29/2016 A.M.Z. Attend DR review call. 1.60   
 

  3/29/2016 A.M.Z. Exchange emails with client re DR responses. 1.00   
 

  3/29/2016 A.M.Z. Review/analyze CUB petition to intervene. 0.10  
 

  3/29/2016 A.M.Z. Review/analyze municipalities DRs. 0.10  
 

  3/30/2016 K.E.R. Review/update DR log. 1.10   
 

  3/30/2016 K.E.R. Review/edit Motion for Leave to File Supplemental 
Direct Instanter (Herbert and Kerckhove). 

0.80   
 

  3/30/2016 C.W.F. Review/edit data request responses. 0.20  
 

  3/30/2016 A.M.Z. Attend DR review call. 0.40   
 

  3/30/2016 A.M.Z. Review/edit DR responses. 1.30   
 

  3/30/2016 A.M.Z. Call with S. Rungren re DR response. 0.20  
 

  3/30/2016 A.M.Z. Review/edit supplemental direct filing. 0.70   
 

  3/30/2016 A.M.Z. Call with R. Kerckhove re supplemental direct 
filing. 

0.20  
 

  3/30/2016 A.M.Z. Review/analyze Staff DRs. 0.10  
 

  3/31/2016 K.E.R. Review/update DR log. 0.30  
 

  3/31/2016 A.M.Z. Call with client re AG DR. 0.90   
 

  3/31/2016 A.M.Z. Exchange emails with client re DR responses. 0.20  
 

  3/31/2016 A.M.Z. Review/edit DR responses. 1.20   
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  3/31/2016 A.M.Z. Draft/revise email to witness re . 0.10  

 
  3/31/2016 A.M.Z. Review/analyze CUB DRs. 0.10  

 
  3/31/2016 A.M.Z. Draft/revise DR objections. 0.40   

 
 
 
TOTAL DUE: $39,186.25 
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INVOICE FOR LEGAL SERVICES TO 
ILLINOIS-AMERICAN WATER CO. 

  

REMIT TO: 

WHITT STURTEVANT LLP 
THE KEYBANK BUILDING 
88 E. BROAD STREET, SUITE 1590 
COLUMBUS, OHIO 43215 
 
TAX ID: 45-4307472 

MATTER: 2016 RATE CASE - 16-0093 
INVOICE DATE: MAY 10, 2016 

INVOICE NUMBER: 11807 
TOTAL DUE: $38,845.00 

 
Services rendered for the period: 
April 1, 2016 – April 30, 2016 
 

 
Date Timekeeper Description Hours Amount 

  4/1/2016 A.M.Z. Review/analyze AG DRs. 0.20  
 

  4/1/2016 A.D.S. Review / analyze AG data requests. 1.20   
 

  4/4/2016 K.E.R. Review/ analyze data responses. 0.50  
 

  4/4/2016 A.M.Z. Review/analyze  materials. 0.30   
 

  4/4/2016 A.M.Z. Review/analyze AG DRs. 0.10  
 

  4/4/2016 A.M.Z. Calls with Mr. Kerckhove and legal team re DR 
responses. 

1.00   
 

  4/4/2016 A.M.Z. Review/edit DR responses. 0.60   
 

  4/4/2016 A.M.Z. Review/analyze . 0.20  
 

  4/4/2016 A.D.S. Review /edit data responses. 0.50   
 

  4/4/2016 A.D.S. Confs w/ A. Zehr re discovery responses. 0.50   
 

  4/5/2016 K.E.R. Review/ analyze data responses. 0.50  
 

  4/5/2016 K.E.R. Review/edit draft DR responses to Staff. 0.50  
 

  4/5/2016 K.E.R. Review/analyze  
per Ms. Zehr. 

1.40   
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  4/5/2016 A.M.Z. Call with AG counsel re DRs. 0.10  
 

  4/5/2016 A.M.Z. Review/analyze AG DRs. 0.10  
 

  4/5/2016 A.M.Z. Review/edit DR responses. 0.60   
 

  4/5/2016 A.M.Z. Call with legal team re DR responses. 0.20  
 

  4/5/2016 A.M.Z. Review/analyze Staff DRs. 0.10  
 

  4/5/2016 A.M.Z. Internal conference re exhibit. 0.20  
 

  4/5/2016 A.D.S. Review /edit data responses. 0.50   
 

  4/6/2016 K.E.R. Review/ analyze data responses. 0.70   
 

  4/6/2016 K.E.R. Review/edit draft DR responses to Staff. 0.20  
 

  4/6/2016 A.M.Z. Review/analyze public comments. 0.20  
 

  4/6/2016 A.M.Z. Review/analyze  materials. 0.50   
 

  4/6/2016 A.M.Z. Attend DR review call. 0.20  
 

  4/6/2016 A.M.Z. Review/analyze status of protective order motion. 0.30   
 

  4/6/2016 A.M.Z. Review/edit/draft objections for DR responses. 1.60   
 

  4/6/2016 A.M.Z. Attend weekly strategy call. 0.50   
 

  4/6/2016 A.M.Z. Review/analyze prehearing conference transcript. 0.20  
 

  4/6/2016 A.M.Z. Call with Mr. Kerckhove re DR responses. 0.20  
 

  4/6/2016 A.D.S. Attend weekly case status call. 0.50   
 

  4/6/2016 A.D.S. Review /edit data responses. 0.30   
 

  4/7/2016 K.E.R. Review/ analyze data responses. 0.40  
 

  4/7/2016 A.M.Z. Review/analyze AG DRs. 0.90   
 

  4/7/2016 A.M.Z. Internal conference re hearing and witness prep. 0.30   
 

  4/7/2016 A.M.Z. Call with Mr. Kerckhove re witness meetings. 0.40   
 

  4/7/2016 A.M.Z. Internal conference re errata. 0.20  
 

  4/7/2016 A.M.Z. Review/edit DR responses. 0.70   
 

  4/7/2016 A.M.Z. Attend DR review call. 0.40   
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  4/7/2016 A.M.Z. Review/edit errata. 0.20  

 
  4/7/2016 A.M.Z. Draft/revise email to client re public comments. 0.20  

 
  4/7/2016 A.D.S. Confs w/ A. Zehr re discovery responses. 0.40   

 
  4/8/2016 K.E.R. Review/ analyze data responses. 0.30  

 
  4/8/2016 M.A.W. Review information for supplemental DR responses 0.50   

 
  4/8/2016 A.M.Z. Review/edit DR responses. 0.40   

 
  4/8/2016 A.M.Z. Call with Mr. Kerckhove re DR responses. 0.30   

 
  4/8/2016 A.M.Z. Review/analyze . 0.60   

 
  4/8/2016 A.D.S. Review /edit data responses. 1.00   

 
  4/11/2016 K.E.R. Review/ analyze data responses. 0.50  

 
  4/11/2016 K.E.R. Compare proposed protective order to the ALJ 

protective order. 
0.10  

 
  4/11/2016 A.M.Z. Review/analyze IIWC DRs. 0.30   

 
  4/11/2016 A.M.Z. Review/edit data responses. 0.20  

 
  4/11/2016 A.M.Z. Review/analyze ALJ notice re protective. 0.20  

 
  4/11/2016 A.M.Z. Exchange emails with Mr. Kerckhove re DR 

responses. 
0.10  

 
  4/12/2016 K.E.R. Review/ analyze data responses. 0.10  

 
  4/12/2016 H.C. Review/edit data request responses. 0.50   

 
  4/12/2016 A.D.S. Review / edit data responses. 2.00   

 
  4/12/2016 A.M.Z. Review/edit DR responses. 3.30   

 
  4/13/2016 K.E.R. Review/ analyze data responses. 0.70   

 
  4/13/2016 K.E.R. Review/edit DR responses. 1.00   

 
  4/13/2016 H.C. Review/edit data request responses. 0.50   

 
  4/13/2016 A.D.S. Review / edit data responses. 0.80   

 
  4/13/2016 A.D.S. Conf calls w/ client team re data responses. 1.80   

 
  4/13/2016 A.M.Z. Calls with client re AG DRs. 0.90   
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  4/13/2016 A.M.Z. Exchange emails with client and Staff counsel re 
DRs. 

0.20  
 

  4/13/2016 A.M.Z. Review/edit DR responses. 2.30   
 

  4/13/2016 A.M.Z. Review/analyze Staff DRs. 0.10  
 

  4/13/2016 A.M.Z. Review/analyze Bolingbrook petition to intervene. 0.10  
 

  4/13/2016 A.M.Z. Attend DR review call. 0.90   
 

  4/14/2016 K.E.R. Review/edit draft errata. 0.60  
 

  4/14/2016 A.D.S. Review /edit data responses. 1.00   
 

  4/14/2016 A.M.Z. Review/edit DR responses. 3.00   
 

  4/14/2016 A.M.Z. Review/analyze Staff DRs. 0.10  
 

  4/14/2016 A.M.Z. Review/edit errata. 0.20  
 

  4/15/2016 K.E.R. Review/edit draft DR attachments. 1.50   
 

  4/15/2016 H.C. Participate in call w Mr. Kerckhove re data request 
responses. 

0.80   
 

  4/15/2016 A.D.S. Conf w/ client team re data responses. 0.80   
 

  4/15/2016 A.D.S. Conf w/ S. Rungren re errata. 0.20  
 

  4/15/2016 A.M.Z. Call with Ms. Krohn re DR responses. 0.20  
 

  4/15/2016 A.M.Z. Exchange emails with client re DR responses. 0.50   
 

  4/16/2016 K.E.R. Review/ analyze data responses. 0.30  
 

  4/16/2016 K.E.R. Edit/review draft errata. 0.30  
 

  4/17/2016 A.M.Z. Exchange emails with client re DR response. 0.20  
 

  4/18/2016 K.E.R. Review/ analyze data responses. 0.90   
 

  4/18/2016 H.C. Review/edit data request responses. 0.60   
 

  4/18/2016 H.C. Research re . 0.50   
 

  4/18/2016 A.D.S. Internal confs re data responses. 0.50   
 

  4/18/2016 A.D.S. Review /edit data responses. 0.30   
 

  4/18/2016 A.M.Z. Review/edit DR responses. 3.60   
 

  4/18/2016 A.M.Z. Review/edit supplemental DR response. 0.70   
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  4/18/2016 A.M.Z. Attend DR review call. 1.00   

 
  4/18/2016 A.M.Z. Call with client re supplemental DR response. 0.20  

 
  4/19/2016 K.E.R. Review/ analyze data responses. 1.00   

 
  4/19/2016 K.E.R. Review/edit Errata and corresponding testimony and 

exhibits. 
1.30   

 
  4/19/2016 K.E.R. Confer with A. Sturtevant and A. Zehr regarding 

errata. 
0.30  

 
  4/19/2016 A.D.S. Review FEA petition to intervene. 0.20  

 
  4/19/2016 A.D.S. Review / analyze IIWC - CUB DRs. 0.30   

 
  4/19/2016 A.M.Z. Review/analyze Staff DRs. 1.00   

 
  4/19/2016 A.M.Z. Call with Towers Watson re data response 

information. 
0.20  

 
  4/19/2016 A.M.Z. Review/analyze revised direct testimony and 

exhibit. 
0.50   

 
  4/19/2016 A.M.Z. Review/edit DR responses. 0.40   

 
  4/19/2016 A.M.Z. Review/analyze Intervenor DRs. 0.10  

 
  4/19/2016 A.M.Z. Review/edit errata; draft email to client re same. 1.10   

 
  4/19/2016 A.M.Z. Conferences with client re DR responses. 0.80   

 
  4/20/2016 K.E.R. Review/update errata and corresponding testimony 

and exhibits. 
2.30   

 
  4/20/2016 K.E.R. Review/analyze data responses. 0.40  

 
  4/20/2016 K.E.R. Review / analyze data response documents. 1.30   

 
  4/20/2016 H.C. Review/edit errata. 0.30  

 
  4/20/2016 H.C. Review/analyze data responses. 0.40   

 
  4/20/2016 H.C. Attend weekly strategy call w client team. 1.00   

 
  4/20/2016 A.D.S. Confs w/ client team re data responses. 1.20   

 
  4/20/2016 A.D.S. Confs w/ client team re errata. 0.50   

 
  4/20/2016 A.D.S. Review /edit errata. 0.50   

 
  4/20/2016 A.D.S. Attend weekly case status call. 1.00   

 
  4/20/2016 A.D.S. Review/edit data responses. 1.00   
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  4/20/2016 A.M.Z. Review/analyze Staff and Intervenor DRs. 0.30   
 

  4/20/2016 A.M.Z. Exchange emails with client re DRs. 0.10  
 

  4/21/2016 K.E.R. Review/edit Errata and corresponding testimony and 
exhibits. 

3.20   
 

  4/21/2016 K.E.R. Review/edit attachments to DR response. 0.40  
 

  4/21/2016 K.E.R. Confer with Mr. Sturtevant about . 0.20  
 

  4/21/2016 H.C. Review/edit data request responses. 0.50   
 

  4/21/2016 A.D.S. Confs w/ R. Kerckhove re discovery, errata. 0.60   
 

  4/21/2016 A.D.S. Review /edit errata and attached exhibits. 2.30   
 

  4/21/2016 A.D.S. Review / edit data responses. 1.50   
 

  4/21/2016 A.D.S. Conf call w/ client team re data responses. 0.50   
 

  4/22/2016 H.C. Review/edit data request responses. 0.80   
 

  4/22/2016 H.C. Participate in call w client team re data request 
responses. 

1.40   
 

  4/22/2016 A.D.S. Confs w/ R. Kerkchove re discovery, errata. 0.20  
 

  4/22/2016 A.D.S. Review / edit data responses. 2.00   
 

  4/22/2016 A.D.S. Conf call w/ client team re data responses. 1.40   
 

  4/22/2016 A.M.Z. Review/analyze IIWC/FEA DRs. 0.10  
 

  4/22/2016 A.M.Z. Review/analyze ALJ notices. 0.10  
 

  4/25/2016 H.C. Review/edit data request responses. 0.20  
 

  4/25/2016 A.M.Z. Review/edit DR responses. 4.10   
 

  4/25/2016 A.M.Z. Review/analyze Staff motion re public forum. 0.10  
 

  4/25/2016 A.M.Z. Research re DRs. 0.20  
 

  4/25/2016 A.M.Z. Attend DR review call. 3.00   
 

  4/25/2016 A.M.Z. Review/analyze Staff DRs. 0.10  
 

  4/26/2016 A.D.S. Review / edit data responses. 1.90   
 

  4/26/2016 A.D.S. Review . 0.30   
 

  4/26/2016 A.M.Z. Review/edit DR responses. 3.80   
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  4/26/2016 A.M.Z. Attend DR review call. 2.50   

 
  4/26/2016 A.M.Z. Call with client re AG DR. 0.30   

 
  4/26/2016 A.M.Z. Call with Ms. Hawn re AG DRs. 0.30   

 
  4/27/2016 H.C. Attend weekly strategy call w client team. 0.50   

 
  4/27/2016 A.D.S. Review / edit data responses. 0.40   

 
  4/27/2016 A.D.S. Confs w/ A. Zehr re data responses. 0.50   

 
  4/27/2016 A.D.S. Attend weekly strategy call. 0.50   

 
  4/27/2016 A.D.S. Review / analyze data requests. 0.80   

 
  4/27/2016 A.M.Z. Review/edit DR responses. 2.00   

 
  4/27/2016 A.M.Z. Calls with client re AG DRs. 3.10   

 
  4/27/2016 A.M.Z. Attend weekly strategy call. 0.50   

 
  4/27/2016 A.M.Z. Review/analyze Staff/Intervenor DRs. 0.30   

 
  4/28/2016 A.D.S. Review / edit data responses. 0.80   

 
  4/28/2016 A.M.Z. Review/edit DR responses. 1.60   

 
  4/29/2016 K.E.R. Review/analyze data responses. 1.10   

 
  4/29/2016 K.E.R. Review revisions to . 0.80   

 
  4/29/2016 A.D.S. Conf w/ R. Kerckhove re  0.30   

 
  4/29/2016 A.M.Z. Exchange emails with client re DR responses. 0.20  

 
 
TOTAL DUE: $38,845.00 

DGK 02.001SUPP2 Part C_Attachment CONFIDENTIAL 
Page 50 of 50

Work Descriptions Redacted for Privilege

IAWC Exhibit 15.01SR - Public Redacted 
Page 364 of 447



ILLINOIS-AMERICAN WATER COMPANY  

RESPONSE TO ILLINOIS COMMERCE COMMISSION  

DATA REQUEST NUMBER DGK 02.001  
 
Witness Responsible:   Rich Kerckhove       
Title:      Manager, Rates & Regulation, Illinois American Water  
Phone No.:     (618) 239-3209        
Date Received:    February 26, 2016       
Docket No.:     16-0093         
 
  
DGK 02.001 

Referring to the outside consultants’ fees and expenses on Schedule C-10, please provide:  
a. Supporting documentation, including engagement letters, contracts, etc., that 

specify, for each consultant (1) the services to be performed; (2) the name and 
titles of the person who will perform the services; (3) the estimated time to be 
expended; and (4) the hourly rate to be charged;  

 
b. All analyses and assessments including all requests for proposals, bids and other 

supporting documentation that led to the selection of each outside consultant; and  
 
c.  All invoices received from outside consultants through February 2016. Please 

provide future invoices received through the end of December 2016 as they 
become available.  

 
RESPONSE 

a.  Please refer to DGK 02.001 Part A Attachment Confidential. Please see also the 
response to subpart c. 

 
b.  Please refer to DGK 02.001 Part B Attachment. Please see also IAWC Exhibit 4.0 

(Kerckhove Direct) at pages 29-45 (Section IV, Rate Case Expense). 
 
c.  Please refer to DGK 02.001 Part C Attachment Confidential. The attachment 

includes consultant invoices through February 2016. IAWC will supplement this 
response on a monthly basis, as invoices become available. Please note, work 
descriptions in the attorney invoices that reflect the substance of attorney-client 
communications and/or legal counsel’s theories, mental impressions, and/or 
litigation plans have been redacted to protect the privileged nature of that 
information. 

 
Attachments 
DGK 02.001 Part A_Attachment Confidential.pdf 
DGK 02.001 Part B_Attachment.pdf 
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DGK 02.001 Part C_Attachment Confidential.pdf 
 
Date Response Provided: March 23, 2016 
 
 
REVISED SUPPLEMENTAL RESPONSE  
 

a.  Please refer to DGK 02.001SUPP (Rev.) Part A Attachment Confidential. Please 
see also the response to subpart c. 

 
b.  Please see the response to subpart a. 
 
c.  Please refer to DGK 02.001SUPP (Rev.) Part C Attachment Confidential. 

 
Attachments 
DGK 02.001SUPP (Rev.) Part A_Attachment Confidential.pdf 
DGK 02.001SUPP (Rev.) Part C_Attachment Confidential.pdf 
 
Date Response Provided: May 3, 2016 
 
 

SECOND SUPPLEMENTAL RESPONSE:  

c.  Please see DGK 02.001SUPP2 Part C Attachment Confidential.  
  
Attachments 
DGK 02.001SUPP2 Part C_Attachment Confidential.pdf   

Date Response Provided:  June 14, 2016 
 
 
THIRD SUPPLEMENTAL RESPONSE:  

c.  Please see DGK 02.001SUPP3 Part C_Attachment 
Confidential.pdf 

Attachments 
 
DGK 02.001SUPP3 Part C_Attachment Confidential.pdf  

Date Response Provided:  July 15, 2016 
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