DOT/AFE

NUMBER
534419L
F-02122

STATUS OF WORK:
DEPT. 52 - SIGNALS:

1200 PEACHTREE ST NE, BOX 123

ORDER NUMBER /
DATE
T15-0039

NORFOLK SOUTHERN CORPORATION
ICC ORDER STATUS REPORT
STATE OF ILLINOIS

PROJECT TYPE

ROAD NAME

RAILROAD LOCATION CITY
FLASHERS W/ GATES UNION HILL
1700S

KS-118.34, DEARBORN DIV

ENGINEERING completed 6/3/15. Preparation for state submittal.

CONTACT: G.B. BANKIERIS
MANAGER HIGHWAY CROSSING ENGINEERING
NORFOLK SOUTHERN CORPORATION

ATLANTA, GA 30309
TEL: 404-527-2866; FAX: 404-527-2901

DEPT. 66 - M/W:

CONTACT: L.E.BREWER
DIVISION ENGINEER
NORFOLK SOUTHERN CORPORATION
17301 MICHIGAN AVE
DEARBORN, M| 48126
TEL: (313) 323-5101

BILLING:  As of 9/30/15; Invoiced Total = $SO; Unbilled = $9,261.62
CONTACT: ROBERT J. HARRIS
ASST MANAGER - MISCELLANEOUS BILLING
NORFOLK SOUTHERN CORPORATION
110 FRANKLIN RD SE
ROANOKE, VA 24042-0034
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ESTIMATED COMPLETION

STATE AUTHORIZED DATE

04-22-2016

9/30/2015
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Toliver, Aaron

From: Logan, Roger D. <Roger.Logan@nscorp.com>

Sent: Tuesday, October 20, 2015 9:05 AM

To: Toliver, Aaron

Cc: Bankieris, Gus B; Klinger, Stephen J.; 'RR Rail Highway Crossing (rr-railxing@att.net)’;
Shaun Luedtke

Subject: RE:- RE: 04.1038 - Engineering Sent - DOT#: 534419L State#: SA-1824 ILST0515 Order#:
T15-0039

Aaron,

| am waiting for an estimate for the culvert work on this project from MWS for field B&B work to be done and WILL have
to submit a revised estimate pac.
Sorry for the delay.

Thanx,

RDL

From: Toliver, Aaron [mailto:atoliver@icc.illinois.gov]

Sent: Tuesday, October 20, 2015 9:50 AM

To: Logan, Roger D.

Cc: Bankieris, Gus B; Klinger, Stephen J.; 'RR Rail Highway Crossing (rr-railxing@att.net)'; Shaun Luedtke

Subject: [EXTERNAL] RE: RE: 04.1038 - Engineering Sent - DOT#: 534419L State#: SA-1824 ILST0515 Order#: T15-
0039

Roger,

If the detailed estimate hasn’t changed, | will just go ahead and replace the sheet in the estimate pac you already
submitted.

Rick,
You are ok to file the Form 3. Please file with today’s date. Thanks.

Aaron Toliver

From: Logan, Roger D. [mailto:Roger.Logan@nscorp.com]

Sent: Tuesday, October 20, 2015 7:46 AM

To: Toliver, Aaron <atoliver@icc.illinois.gov>

Cc: Bankieris, Gus B <Gus.Bankieris@nscorp.com>; Klinger, Stephen J. <Stephen.Klinger@nscorp.com>; 'RR Rail Highway
Crossing (rr-railxing@att.net)' <rr-railxing@att.net>; Shaun Luedtke <sluedtke@co.kankakee.il.us>

Subject: RE: RE: 04.1038 - Engineering Sent - DOT#: 534419L State#: SA-1824 ILST0515 Order#: T15-0039

Aaron,
| have attached a revised sheet 1 of 22 per your instructions. Please review and let me know if satisfactory and if you
would like a complete new estimate pac or just insert this sheet into existing.

Thanx,
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From: Toliver, Aaron [mailto:atoliver@icc.illinois.gov]

Sent: Monday, October 19, 2015 5:56 PM

To: Logan, Roger D.

Cc: Bankieris, Gus B; Klinger, Stephen J.; 'RR Rail Highway Crossing (rr-railxing@att.net)'; Shaun Luedtke

Subject: [EXTERNAL] RE: 04.1038 - Engineering Sent - DOT#: 534419L State#: SA-1824 ILST0515 Order#: T15-0039
Importance: High

All,
Please provide the status of the requested revisions below and attached. Thanks.

Aaron T. Toliver, P.E.

Railroad Safety Specialist
[llinois Commerce Commission
527 East Capitol Avenue
Springfield, lllinois 62701
Phone: 217/785-8420

E-mail: atoliver@icc.illinois.gov

From: Toliver, Aaron

Sent: Monday, September 28, 2015 11:46 AM

To: 'Logan, Roger D.' <Roger.Logan@nscorp.com>

Cc: Bankieris, Gus B <Gus.Bankieris@nscorp.com>; Klinger, Stephen J. <Stephen.Klinger@nscorp.com>; 'RR Rail Highway
Crossing (rr-railxing@att.net)' <rr-railxing@att.net>; 'Shaun Luedtke' <sluedtke@co.kankakee.il.us>

Subject: RE: 04.1038 - Engineering Sent - DOT#: 534419L State#: SA-1824 ILST0515 Order#: T15-0039

Roger,

The Kankakee County Hwy Dept (Shaun Luedtke copied on this e-mail; 815-933-1731) and Norton Township Road
District (Wayne Forneris; 815-426-6428) will be coordinating with Norfolk Southern to complete some roadway
approach grade improvements at this location, as required by the ICC Order T15-0039.

In conjunction with that work, the existing narrowing of the traveled way at the crossing from 17’ down to 13’ on the
south and 15’ on the north should be corrected by the highway authorities so that the traveled way is a consistent 17’
on NS’s ROW. | would recommend showing the traveled way as 17’ and showing the existing narrowed edges as dashed
lines. The County/Township road work will not require any modifications to the existing NS crossing surface.

The warning device masts should be centered 10’ off the 17’ traveled way edge, and the signal cabin should go 30’ off
the 17’ traveled way edge instead of the existing edge.

A note is recommended to the signal installation crew to coordinate with the road authorities (at their respective phone
numbers above) to locate the proposed roadway edges before installing the signals is recommended. Thanks.

Aaron T. Toliver, P.E.

Railroad Safety Specialist
[llinois Commerce Commission
527 East Capitol Avenue
Springfield, lllinois 62701
Phone: 217/785-8420

E-mail: atoliver@icc.illinois.gov
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Toliver, Aaron

From: Logan, Roger D. <Roger.Logan@nscorp.com>

Sent: Monday, September 21, 2015 3:12 PM

To: Toliver, Aaron

Cc: Bankieris, Gus B; Klinger, Stephen J.; 'RR Rail Highway Crossing (rr-railxing@att.net)'

Subject: 04.1038 - Engineering Sent - DOT#: 534419L State#: SA-1824 ILST0515 Order#:
T15-0039

File #: CX1111108

3k 3k 3k 3k 3k 3k 3k 3k 3k 3k 3k 3k 3k %k %k %k %k %k %k 3k >k 3k 3k 3k 3k %k %k >k k kK k

Project #: 04.1038

Road: 1700 S
City: UNION HILL
State: IL

DOT: 534419L
MilePost: KS 118.34

3k 3k 3k 3k 3k sk 3k 3k 3k 3k %k 3k 3k 3k %k %k 3k 3k %k %k %k 5k 3k %k %k %k 3k %k k k ok k

This is to notify you that our plans and estimate for modification of grade crossing warning devices at the
above referenced location are attached.

After you have received this material, please return this email as acknowledgement.
RHR,

Please use attached per GBB email dated 4-21-2015.
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=m"m 21-Sep-15
—
Detailed Estimate for Grade Crossing Warning Devices
City/State: UNION HILL, IL Road: 1700 S
MilePost: KS-118.34 DOT/AAR: 534419L
State Proj. No.: SA-1824 County: KANKAKEE
S&E Proj. No.: 04.1038 File Number:
Man Days: 198
***Purchases - Others**

Meals and Lodging: $26,611.20

Rental of Equipment: $27,720.00

(2 Trucks, 1 Backhoe w/ Trailer

and 1 Pipe-Pusher for 33 Days)

Construction Supervision Vehicle: $4,953.45

Purchases - Other Total: $59,284.65

**Material And Additives***

Material Cost: $105,380.00

Sales and Use Tax: $5,269.00

Material Handling Freight: $5,268.99

Material Total: $115,917.99

***Labor And Additives***

Labor Cost: $55,440.00

(6 man crew at $1,680.00 a day for: 33 days)

Payroll Tax & Overheads: $73,646.50

Preliminary Engineering: $14,152.15

Construction Supervision: $15,650.71

Labor Total: $158,889.36
Project Cost: $334,092.00
Scrap / Salvage Credit: $0.00
Project Total: $334,092.00

Estimated on: 21-Sep-15

Estimate valid for 1 year from date of estimate

Estimated by: ndney
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