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From: Fleming, Frances R:(ComEd)
To: Marquez, Michelle:(BSC)
Subject: FW: Copy of Invoice 4688 (14-0312 Exp W)
Date: Wednesday, August 13, 2014 3:16:00 PM

10601-08522-515060-14RPDFR13

Same question – do you have a copy of the underlying invoice from Black & Veatch?

From: Marquez, Michelle:(BSC) 
Sent: Wednesday, August 13, 2014 2:40 PM
To: Fleming, Frances R:(ComEd)
Subject: FW: Copy of Invoice 4688

Can you please provide code block?

Thank you

From: michelle.marquez@exeloncorp.com [mailto:michelle.marquez@exeloncorp.com]
Sent: Wednesday, August 13, 2014 2:34 PM
To: Marquez, Michelle:(BSC)
Subject: Copy of Invoice 4688

Invoice Header Details

Vendor Details Vendor ID ROONEY

Client Details

Invoice Header Details

Vendor Name Rooney Rippie &
 Ratnaswamy LLP

Primary Address 350 West Hubbard St. Suite 430
 Chicago, Illin 60654 Vendor ID ROONEY

Invoice Matter Invoice Totals

Invoice No 4688 Matter Name 2014 Formula Rate
 Case - Experts Fees 0.00 USD

Invoice
 Date 7/11/2014 Matter No 2013-003788 Fee

 Discount .00 % 0.00 USD

Invoice
 Start /
 End

7/3/2014 - 7/11/2014 Expenses 8,257.50 USD

Received 7/11/2014 Expense
 Discount .00 % 0.00 USD

Allocated
 to Fiscal
 Period

7/2014 Invoice
 Total 8,257.50 USD

Invoice
 Type Invoice Adjustments .00 % 0.00 USD

Currency USD

Invoice Net 8,257.50 USD
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Firm Billing
 Arrangement Exelon Team Rate

Firm Actual
 (YTD) 143918.83

Firm Actual
 (LOM) 143918.83

Invoice
 Description

Workflow Details / Comments

Reviewer Start Date Due Date Action
Action
 Date Comment

ShareDoc Warning invoice start date 7/3/2014
 must be the first day of the
 month, invoice end date
 7/11/2014 must be the last
 day of the same month.

Guide Warning There is no budget associated
 with this matter(YTD).

Bernet, Richard 7/11/2014 7/21/2014 Expired 7/23/2014

O'Neill, Thomas 7/23/2014 7/29/2014 Expired 7/30/2014

Marquez,
 Michelle

7/30/2014 8/4/2014 Routed by
 Marquez,
 Michelle

7/30/2014

Bernet, Richard 7/30/2014 8/4/2014 Approved 8/1/2014

Marquez,
 Michelle

8/1/2014 8/6/2014 Approved 8/13/2014

All Line Item Details

Currency = USD

Type Date TK Task Act Description Hrs/Units Rate Disc
Cash
 Adj Net

Exp 7/3/2014 E119 Black Veatch - Invoice 1183040 - Billed
 thru June 27, 2014

1.00 8,257.50 0.00 0.00 8,257.50

Tax Summary

Currency = USD

Tax Code Tax Rate Pretax Total Tax Total Total Including Taxes

(no taxes found)
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From: Fleming, Frances R:(ComEd)
To: Marquez, Michelle:(BSC)
Subject: FW: Copy of Invoice 5115 (14-0312)
Date: Friday, September 12, 2014 9:32:00 AM

Please charge 10601-08522-515060-14RPDFR13

From: Marquez, Michelle:(BSC) 
Sent: Thursday, September 11, 2014 3:50 PM
To: Fleming, Frances R:(ComEd)
Subject: FW: Copy of Invoice 5115

Fran,

Please provide code block

From: michelle.marquez@exeloncorp.com [mailto:michelle.marquez@exeloncorp.com]
Sent: Thursday, September 11, 2014 3:45 PM
To: Marquez, Michelle:(BSC)
Subject: Copy of Invoice 5115

Invoice Header Details

Vendor Details Vendor ID ROONEY

Client Details

Invoice Header Details

Vendor Name Rooney Rippie &
 Ratnaswamy LLP

Primary Address 350 West Hubbard St. Suite 430
 Chicago, Illin 60654 Vendor ID ROONEY

Invoice Matter Invoice Totals

Invoice No 5115 Matter Name 2014 Formula Rate
 Case - Experts Fees 0.00 USD

Invoice
 Date 8/23/2014 Matter No 2013-003788 Fee

 Discount .00 % 0.00 USD

Invoice
 Start /
 End

8/7/2014 - 8/23/2014 Expenses 35,980.00 USD

Received 8/23/2014 Expense
 Discount .00 % 0.00 USD

Allocated
 to Fiscal
 Period

8/2014 Invoice
 Total 35,980.00 USD

Invoice
 Type Invoice Adjustments .00 % 0.00 USD

Currency USD

Invoice Net 35,980.00 USD

Firm Billing
 Arrangement Exelon Team Rate

Firm Actual
 (YTD) 152176.33
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Firm Actual
 (LOM) 152176.33

Invoice
 Description

Workflow Details / Comments

Reviewer Start Date Due Date Action
Action
 Date Comment

ShareDoc Warning invoice start date 8/7/2014
 must be the first day of the
 month, invoice end date
 8/23/2014 must be the last
 day of the same month.

Guide Warning There is no budget associated
 with this matter(YTD).

Bernet, Richard 8/23/2014 9/1/2014 Approved 9/2/2014

O'Neill, Thomas 9/2/2014 9/8/2014 Expired 9/10/2014

Marquez,
 Michelle

9/10/2014 9/15/2014 Approved 9/10/2014

All Line Item Details

Currency = USD

Type Date TK Task Act Description Hrs/Units Rate Disc
Cash
 Adj Net

Exp 8/7/2014 E119 Black Veatch - Invoice 1184887 -
 Billed Thru August 1, 2014

1.00 35,980.00 0.00 0.00 35,980.00

Tax Summary

Currency = USD

Tax Code Tax Rate Pretax Total Tax Total Total Including Taxes

(no taxes found)
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Rate @
3 4 5 6 7 10 11 12 13 14 17 18 19 20 21 24 25 26 27 28 Total $165/hr Project

14-0312 Formula Rate Case 2014 0.0 0.0 0.0 0.0 0.0 0.0 0.0 0.0 0.0 0.0 1.4 0.0 0.9 0.0 0.8 0.0 0.6 0.0 0.0 0.0 3.7 610.50 14RPDFR13

3 4 5 6 7 10 11 12 13 14 17 18 19 20 21 24 25 26 27 28 31 Total
DOCKET Case Name

14-0312 Formula Rate Case 2014 0.5 0.6 0.0 0.0 0.0 0.0 0.0 0.8 0.0 0.3 0.5 0.0 0.0 0.0 0.0 0.0 0.0 0.0 0.0 1.8 7.0 11.5 1,897.50 14RPDFR13

1 2 3 4 7 8 9 10 11 14 15 16 17 18 21 22 23 24 25 28 29 30 Total
DOCKET Case Name

14-0312 Formula Rate Case 2014 2.2 3.6 0.7 0.0 1.0 2.0 3.4 0.0 2.0 3.1 7.0 5.9 4.4 3.1 2.4 2.7 1.6 1.9 4.0 3.0 5.8 4.3 64.1 10,576.50 14RPDFR13

1 2 5 6 7 8 9 12 13 14 15 16 19 20 21 22 23 26 27 28 29 30 Total
DOCKET Case Name

14-0312 Formula Rate Case 2014 4.5 7.2 3.8 6.8 8.3 8.1 5.4 5.8 5.8 7.7 8.2 7.5 6.7 1.7 4.4 3.4 3.1 0.0 3.9 2.6 2.4 7.3 114.6 18,909.00 14RPDFR13

14-0312 Formula Rate Case 2014 8.0 6.8 7.0 6.3 6.2 4.0 6.2 2.8 4.3 3.5 5.6 7.2 8.1 4.0 5.8 6.2 7.6 4.4 5.2 8.0 3.4 120.6 19,899.00 14RPDFR13

1 2 3 4 7 8 9 10 11 14 15 16 17 18 21 22 23 24 25 28 29 30 31 Total
14-0312 Formula Rate Case 2014 3.2 5.0 3.7 0.0 4.6 3.0 4.5 5.4 2.3 8.1 3.8 1.3 5.0 4.6 2.2 4.9 2.5 3.0 3.9 5.5 5.2 4.8 5.8 92.3 15,229.50 14RPDFR13

1 4 5 6 7 8 11 12 13 14 15 18 19 20 21 22 25 26 27 28 29 30 31 Total
14-0312 Formula Rate Case 2014 4.2 6.1 4.1 4.1 0.8 2.4 4.8 2.7 1.7 0.5 2.8 1.2 4.1 2.1 2.7 3.8 7.4 0.4 6.5 0.4 0.0 0.0 0.0 62.8 10,362.00 14RPDFR13

1 2 3 4 5 8 9 10 11 12 15 16 17 18 19 22 23 24 25 26 29 30
14-0312 Formula Rate Case 2014 0.0 0.0 0.0 0.0 0.0 0.0 0.0 0.0 0.0 0.0 0.0 0.0 0.0 0.4 0.0 0.0 0.0 0.0 0.0 0.0 0.0 0.0 0.4 66.00 14RPDFR13

1 2 3 6 7 8 9 10 13 14 15 16 17 20 21 22 23 24 27 28 29 30 31 Total
14-0312 Formula Rate Case 2014 0.0 0.0 0.0 0.0 0.0 0.0 0.0 0.0 0.0 0.0 0.0 0.4 0.0 0.0 0.0 0.0 0.0 0.0 0.0 0.0 0.0 0.0 0.0 0.4 66.00 14RPDFR13

77,616.00$

February 2014

Time Sheet for Daniel Kowalewski
P.O. Box 123
Wayne, IL 60184

ComEd Discovery

Discovery Activity

June 2014

May 2014

Discovery Activity

March 2014

Discovery Activity

July 2014

Discovery Activity

April 2014
Discovery Activity

Discovery Activity

March

February

April

May

June

July

August

September

October

Discovery Activity
September 2014

October 2014

Discovery Activity

Discovery Activity
August 2014
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INVOICE
Hengtgen Consulting, LLC Date: 1/30/2014
1708 Freedom Court Invoice No: 1008
Mount Prospect, IL 60056

Bill To: For:
Eimer Stahl Hengtgen Consulting, LLC
224 South Michigan Aveenue c/o John Hengtgen
Suite 1100 1708 Freedom Court
Chicago, IL 60604 2516 Mount Prospect, IL 60056
Attn: David Stahl Cell 847 345 2262
(email: dstahl@eimerstahl.com email johnhengtgen@yahoo.com

Professional services provided by John Hengtgen during December, 2013 regarding 2014 Formula Rate Update Proceeding

Hours 63.75

Rate 250.00$

Amount 15,937.50$

Expenses 0

Total Amount 15,937.50$

Mail Payment Information:
To Hengtgen Consulting LLC

c/o John Hengtgen
Adress 1708 Freedom Court

Mount Prospect, IL 60056
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Page 1 of 1

HENGTGEN CONSULTING TIMESHEET

Name: John Hengtgen Month Ending: December, 2013

Date Hours Day Total ICC Reference Project # Description
Pending 2014 Formula Rate Update

12/1/13 4.00 4.00 Email to MF regarding status, work on updating lead lag model based on files received to date from FF and MF
12/2/13 0.00
12/3/13 0.25 0.25 Emails, phone message with FF
12/4/13 0.50 0.50 CC with FF regarding status of requests and upcoming meetings
12/5/13 0.00
12/6/13 0.25 0.25 Review emails from FF
12/7/13 2.00 2.00 Work on updating lead lag model based on files received to date
12/8/13 2.50 2.50 Work on updating lead lag model based on files received to date
12/9/13 0.00
12/10/13 1.00 1.00 Research A/P requirements and email to FF
12/11/13 4.00 4.00 Work on updating lead lag model, email to FF, MF and CB with revenue lag information, meetings with HT, JW, FF, MF and CB
12/12/13 2.00 2.00 Work on updating lead lag model
12/13/13 0.50 0.50 CC with FF, CC with FF and MF, CC with CD
12/14/13 3.00 3.00 Work on updating lead lag model
12/15/13 3.75 3.75 Work on updating lead lag model
12/16/13 1.00 1.00 Review various emails/files, send emails to CD and FF
12/17/13 0.75 0.75 CC with LK re bank float data, review various emails/files and send emails to FF
12/18/13 1.25 1.25 Review various emails/files, send emails to FF and JW
12/19/13 5.00 5.00 Work on lead lag model, review various emails/files from FF and send emails to FF
12/20/13 0.25 0.25 Review various emails/files, send emails to FF and BH
12/21/13 4.00 4.00 Work on updating lead lag model
12/22/13 5.00 5.00 Work on updating lead lag model, send email to CB, MF and FF regarding CC on Monday
12/23/13 0.50 0.50 CC with MF and FF, review emails from FF, send emails to FF and CB
12/24/13 2.50 2.50 Work on updating lead lag model
12/25/13 0.00
12/26/13 4.00 4.00 Travel to and from ComEd office for meetings with ComEd (BH and CD), work on updating lead lag model, review email from BH
12/27/13 4.50 4.50
12/28/13 1.25 1.25 Work on updating lead lag model, send email to CD, FF and BH
12/29/13 3.50 3.50 Work on updating lead lag model, send email to CD, FF and BH
12/30/13 3.50 3.50 CC with CD, CC with CB, continue work on lead lag model, review emails from and send emails to CB, CD and FF
12/31/13 3.00 3.00 Continue work on lead lag model, review emails from and send emails to CD and FF

SUBTOTAL 63.75 250.00$ 15,937.50$

Abbreviation Key:
CC conference call, WPs workpapers, DRR Data Request Response

Totals CWC cash working capital
Hours 63.75
Rate 250.00 MF Marty Fruehe, CB Chris Brinkmann, FF Fran Fleming, DS David Stahl, BH Bill Hayden, ST Susan Tracy, JW Jim Weibel, HT Hau Thach

Totals 15,937.50 BH Bill Hayden, CD Chris Dunn, LC Lakeeta Colon

Expenses incurred NONE

Total 0

Monthly Total 15,937.50

Review email from CD, send emails to CD, FF and BH, work on updating lead lag model
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From: Fleming, Frances R:(ComEd)
To: Marquez, Michelle:(BSC)
Subject: FW: Copy of Invoice 1012312 (14-0312 - Exp)
Date: Wednesday, May 28, 2014 1:30:00 PM
Attachments: exclsmall.gif

Aims.gif

10601-08522-515060-14RPDFR13

From: Marquez, Michelle:(BSC) 
Sent: Wednesday, May 28, 2014 12:36 PM
To: Fleming, Frances R:(ComEd)
Subject: FW: Copy of Invoice 1012312

Can you please provide code block?

Thank you

From: michelle.marquez@exeloncorp.com [mailto:michelle.marquez@exeloncorp.com]
Sent: Wednesday, May 28, 2014 12:23 PM
To: Marquez, Michelle:(BSC)
Subject: Copy of Invoice 1012312

Invoice Header Details

Vendor Details Vendor ID EIMER

Client Details

Invoice Header Details

Vendor Name Eimer Stahl,
 LLP

Primary Address 224 S. Michagan Avenue Chicago, IL
 60604 Vendor ID EIMER

Invoice Matter Invoice Totals

Invoice No 1012312 Matter Name 2014 Formula Rate
 Case - Experts Fees 0.00 USD

Invoice
 Date 4/14/2014 Matter No 2013-003788 Fee

 Discount .00 % 0.00 USD

Invoice
 Start /
 End

3/1/2014 - 3/31/2014 Expenses 12,937.50 USD

Received 4/14/2014 Expense
 Discount .00 % 0.00 USD

Allocated
 to Fiscal
 Period

4/2014 Invoice
 Total 12,937.50 USD

Invoice
 Type Invoice Adjustments .00 % 0.00 USD

Currency USD

Invoice Net 12,937.50 USD

Firm Billing
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Arrangement Exelon Team Rate

Firm Actual
 (YTD) 0.00

Firm Actual
 (LOM) 8812.50

Invoice
Description 2014 Formula Rate Case - Experts

Workflow Details / Comments

Reviewer Start Date Due Date Action
Action
 Date Comment

Guide Warning There is no budget associated
 with this matter(YTD).

Bernet, Richard 4/14/2014 4/22/2014 Expired 4/24/2014

O'Neill, Thomas 4/24/2014 4/30/2014 Expired 5/2/2014

Marquez,
 Michelle

5/2/2014 5/7/2014 Routed by
 Marquez,
 Michelle

5/9/2014

Bernet, Richard 5/9/2014 5/14/2014 Approved 5/20/2014

Marquez,
 Michelle

5/20/2014 5/23/2014 Approved 5/28/2014

All Line Item Details

Currency = USD

Type Date TK Task Act Description Hrs/Units Rate Disc
Cash
 Adj Net

Exp 3/31/2014 E119 Expert Fees Expenses (Jan Fees)-
 Hengtgen Consulting, LLC

1.00 12,937.50 0.00 0.00 12,937.50

Tax Summary

Currency = USD

Tax Code Tax Rate Pretax Total Tax Total Total Including Taxes

(no taxes found)
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INVOICE
Hengtgen Consulting, LLC Date: 4/11/2014
1708 Freedom Court Invoice No: 1012
Mount Prospect, IL 60056

Bill To: For:
Eimer Stahl Hengtgen Consulting, LLC
224 South Michigan Aveenue c/o John Hengtgen
Suite 1100 1708 Freedom Court
Chicago, IL 60604-2516 Mount Prospect, IL  60056
Attn: David Stahl Cell - 847-345-2262
(email: dstahl@eimerstahl.com email - johnhengtgen@yahoo.com

Professional services provided by John Hengtgen during January, 2014 regarding 2014 Formula Rate Update Proceeding

Hours 51.75

Rate 250.00$             

Amount 12,937.50$       

Expenses 0

Total Amount 12,937.50$       

Mail Payment Information:
To Hengtgen Consulting LLC

c/o John Hengtgen
Adress 1708 Freedom Court

Mount Prospect, IL 60056
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Page 1 of 1

HENGTGEN CONSULTING TIMESHEET

Name: John Hengtgen Month Ending: January, 2014

Date Hours Day Total ICC Reference Project # Description
Pending 2014 Formula Rate Update

1/1/14 3.00 3.00 Continue work on lead lag model, email to FF re: payroll lead question
1/2/14 4.25 4.25 Coninue work on lead lag model, numerous emails to/from various ComEd personnel (BH, CD, AM, FF,JJ)
1/3/14 6.00 6.00 Coninue work on lead lag model, numerous emails to/from various ComEd personnel (FF, CD)
1/4/14 3.00 3.00 Coninue work on lead lag model, email to CD - re O&M data
1/5/14 3.50 3.50 Continue work on lead lag model, emails to CD and FF - re lease data
1/6/14 1.50 1.50 Continue work on lead lag model, emails to/from ComEd personnel (BH, CB, FF)
1/7/14 1.50 1.50 Continue work on lead lag model, numerous emails to/from ComEd personnel (LC, PP, CD)
1/8/14 1.00 1.00 Continue work on lead lag model, emails to ComEd personnel (FF, TD)
1/9/14 6.00 6.00 Travel to/from ComEd for several meetings with CD, BH, FF, CB and MF, emails to AM, CB and CD, MF

1/10/14 2.00 2.00 Continue work on lead lag model, emails to CB, BH - re lease data and O&M data
1/11/14 0.50 0.50 CC with CD, emails to BH, CD - re O&M data
1/12/14 5.00 5.00 Continued work on lead lag model
1/13/14 1.00 1.00 CC with CB, MF, BH and CD, emaill to CB, MF, BH and CD - re O&M data
1/14/14 1.00 1.00 Various emails to/from CD, MF, CB - re O&M data
1/15/14 0.25 0.25 Email - CB re O&M data
1/16/14 0.50 0.50 Emails - FF re Form 21
1/17/14 0.25 0.25 Emails - FF and BH re Form 21 and WP3
1/18/14 0.00
1/19/14 3.00 3.00 Continue work on lead lag model
1/20/14 3.50 3.50 Continue work on lead lag model, email to CB, MF, CD and BH
1/21/14 0.00 0.00
1/22/14 0.75 0.75 Numerous email - BH, email - FF
1/23/14 0.25 0.25 Numerous emails - FF - re pass throughs, I/C, other taxes
1/24/14 0.50 0.50 Numerous emails - FF - re pass throughs, I/C, other taxes
1/25/14 0.25 0.25 Email - FF  re float data
1/26/14 1.50 1.50 Continue work on lead lag model, email to FF re LT debt outstanding
1/27/14 0.25 0.25
1/28/14 1.25 1.25 Email - BH, numerouls emails - FF re lease data
1/29/14 0.00 0.00
1/30/14 0.25 0.25 Email - FF re lease data
1/31/14 0.00 0.00

SUBTOTAL 51.75 250.00$          12,937.50$  

Abbreviation Key:
CC-conference call, WPs- workpapers, DRR-Data Request Response

Totals CWC-cash working capital
Hours 51.75

Rate 250.00 MF-Marty Fruehe, CB-Chris Brinkmann, FF-Fran Fleming, DS-David Stahl, BH-Bill Hayden, ST-Susan Tracy, JW-Jim Weibel, HT-Hau Thach
Totals 12,937.50       BH-Bill Hayden, CD-Chris Dunn, LC-Lakeeta Colon, AM-Anne Mathews, JJ-Jay Joyce, TD-Theresa Devine, PT-Priya Patel

Expenses incurred NONE

Total 0

Monthly Total 12,937.50           

Emails - BH, re float data, emails - FF re lease data
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From: Fleming, Frances R:(ComEd)
To: Marquez, Michelle:(BSC)
Subject: FW: Copy of Invoice 1012536 (14-0312 Exp W)
Date: Wednesday, August 13, 2014 3:14:00 PM

Please charge this one to:  10601-08522-515060-14RPDFR13

Do you have copies of Mr. Hengtgen’s invoices referenced below?  I will need those.
Thanks,
Fran

From: Marquez, Michelle:(BSC) 
Sent: Wednesday, August 13, 2014 2:40 PM
To: Fleming, Frances R:(ComEd)
Subject: FW: Copy of Invoice 1012536

Can you please provide code block?

Thank you

From: michelle.marquez@exeloncorp.com [mailto:michelle.marquez@exeloncorp.com]
Sent: Wednesday, August 13, 2014 2:33 PM
To: Marquez, Michelle:(BSC)
Subject: Copy of Invoice 1012536

Invoice Header Details

Vendor Details Vendor ID EIMER

Client Details

Invoice Header Details

Vendor Name Eimer Stahl,
 LLP

Primary Address 224 S. Michagan Avenue Chicago, IL
 60604 Vendor ID EIMER

Invoice Matter Invoice Totals

Invoice No 1012536 Matter Name 2014 Formula Rate
 Case - Experts Fees 0.00 USD

Invoice
 Date 7/22/2014 Matter No 2013-003788 Fee

 Discount .00 % 0.00 USD

Invoice
 Start /
 End

6/30/2014 - 6/30/2014 Expenses 26,125.00 USD

Received 7/22/2014 Expense
 Discount .00 % 0.00 USD

Allocated
 to Fiscal
 Period

7/2014 Invoice
 Total 26,125.00 USD

Invoice
 Type Invoice Adjustments .00 % 0.00 USD

Currency USD

Invoice Net 26,125.00 USD
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Firm Billing
 Arrangement Exelon Team Rate

Firm Actual
 (YTD) 28875.00

Firm Actual
 (LOM) 37687.50

Invoice
 Description

Workflow Details / Comments

Reviewer Start Date Due Date Action
Action
 Date Comment

ShareDoc Warning invoice start date 6/30/2014
 must be the first day of the
 month, invoice end date
 6/30/2014 must be the last
 day of the same month.

ShareDoc Warning invoice start date 6/30/2014
 must be earlier than invoice
 end date 6/30/2014

Bernet, Richard 7/22/2014 7/30/2014 Approved 7/24/2014

O'Neill, Thomas 7/24/2014 7/30/2014 Expired 8/1/2014

Marquez,
 Michelle

8/1/2014 8/6/2014 Approved 8/13/2014

All Line Item Details

Currency = USD

Type Date TK Task Act Description Hrs/Units Rate Disc
Cash
 Adj Net

Exp 6/30/2014 DMS E119 Expert Fees Expenses - Hengtgen
 Consulting, LLC (Feb 2014)

1.00 13,500.00 0.00 0.00 13,500.00

Exp 6/30/2014 DMS E119 Expert Fees Expenses - Hengtgen
 Consulting, LLC (March 2014)

1.00 12,625.00 0.00 0.00 12,625.00

Tax Summary

Currency = USD

Tax Code Tax Rate Pretax Total Tax Total Total Including Taxes

(no taxes found)
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INVOICE
Hengtgen Consulting, LLC Date: 7/6/2014
1708 Freedom Court Invoice No: 1015
Mount Prospect, IL 60056

Bill To: For:
Eimer Stahl Hengtgen Consulting, LLC
224 South Michigan Aveenue c/o John Hengtgen
Suite 1100 1708 Freedom Court
Chicago, IL 60604 2516 Mount Prospect, IL 60056
Attn: David Stahl Cell 847 345 2262
(email: dstahl@eimerstahl.com email johnhengtgen@yahoo.com

Professional services provided by John Hengtgen during February, 2014 regarding 2014 Formula Rate Update Proceeding

Hours 54.00

Rate 250.00$

Amount 13,500.00$

Expenses 0

Total Amount 13,500.00$

Mail Payment Information:
To Hengtgen Consulting LLC

c/o John Hengtgen
Adress 1708 Freedom Court

Mount Prospect, IL 60056
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Page 1 of 1

HENGTGEN CONSULTING TIMESHEET

Name: John Hengtgen Month Ending: February, 2014

Date Hours Day Total ICC Reference Project # Description
Pending 2014 Formula Rate Update

2/1/14 2.00 2.00 Continue work on lead lag study and various emails to FF regarding additional data
2/2/14 2.00 2.00 Continue work on lead lag study email to FF regarding O&M data
2/3/14 0.00
2/4/14 0.50 0.50 Emails to/from FF
2/5/14 0.00
2/6/14 0.00
2/7/14 0.00
2/8/14 0.00
2/9/14 0.75 0.75 Continue work on lead lag study

2/10/14 3.75 3.75 Continue work on lead lag stduy, emails to/from FF regarding intercompany settlements
2/11/14 0.50 0.50 Emails to/from FF and emails to/from CD regarding O&M data
2/12/14 0.75 0.75 Emails to/from CD regarding pass through taxes
2/13/14 0.50 0.50 Emails to/from CD regarding pass through taxes
2/14/14 1.75 1.75 Email from BH regarding kickoff meeting, continue working on lead lag study
2/15/14 0.00
2/16/14 6.75 6.75 Continue work on lead lag study, email to FF regarding VEBA information
2/17/14 0.00
2/18/14 1.25 1.25 Emails to/from CD regarding , email FF regarding VEBA information and BH regarding kickoff meeting
2/19/14 1.50 1.50 CC with ComEd regarding kickoff meeting, review of kickoff meeting documents, emails to/from CD regarding
2/20/14 4.00 4.00 Continue work on lead lag study
2/21/14 0.25 0.25 Email from CD regarding various tax payments
2/22/14 3.25 3.25 Continue work on lead lag study
2/23/14 6.50 6.50 Continue work on lead lag study, various email to BH, AM and CD
2/24/14 3.00 3.00 Continue work on lead lag study, various emails to/from BH, FF and AM
2/25/14 0.50 0.50 Emails to/from BH regarding formula update information
2/26/14 1.00 1.00 Work on direct testimony outline
2/27/14 8.00 8.00

2/28/14 5.50 5.50 Continue work on lead lag study, emails to/from CD and BH

SUBTOTAL 54.00 250.00$ 13,500.00$

Abbreviation Key:
CC conference call, WPs workpapers, DRR Data Request Response

Totals CWC cash working capital
Hours 54.00
Rate 250.00 MF Marty Fruehe, CB Chris Brinkmann, FF Fran Fleming, DS David Stahl, BH Bill Hayden, ST Susan Tracy, JW Jim Weibel, HT Hau Thach

Totals 13,500.00 BH Bill Hayden, CD Chris Dunn, LC Lakeeta Colon; AM Anne Mathews; SM Sandeep Menon; ML Michael Lee

Expenses incurred NONE

Total 0

Monthly Total 13,500.00

CC with CD regarding pass through tax question, emails to/from ML regarding testimony process and testimony outline, emails to/from FF and CD and contunue work on lead lag
study
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INVOICE
Hengtgen Consulting, LLC Date: 7/6/2014
1708 Freedom Court Invoice No: 1016
Mount Prospect, IL 60056

Bill To: For:
Eimer Stahl Hengtgen Consulting, LLC
224 South Michigan Aveenue c/o John Hengtgen
Suite 1100 1708 Freedom Court
Chicago, IL 60604 2516 Mount Prospect, IL 60056
Attn: David Stahl Cell 847 345 2262
(email: dstahl@eimerstahl.com email johnhengtgen@yahoo.com

Professional services provided by John Hengtgen during March, 2014 regarding 2014 Formula Rate Update Proceeding

Hours 50.50

Rate 250.00$

Amount 12,625.00$

Expenses 0

Total Amount 12,625.00$

Mail Payment Information:
To Hengtgen Consulting LLC

c/o John Hengtgen
Adress 1708 Freedom Court

Mount Prospect, IL 60056

Docket No. 15-0287 
ComEd Ex. 1.03 APO-09 REV 

Page 177 of 228



Page 1 of 1

HENGTGEN CONSULTING TIMESHEET

Name: John Hengtgen Month Ending: March, 2014

Date Hours Day Total ICC Reference Project # Description
Pending 2014 Formula Rate Update

3/1/14 7.25 7.25 Continue work on lead lag study
3/2/14 6.00 6.00 Continue work on lead lag study
3/3/14 1.75 1.75 Continue work on lead lag study and email to BH, SM, MF, CB, CD and FF regarding final lead and lag calculations
3/4/14 0.25 0.25 Emails to/from ML regarding first draft of testimony
3/5/14 1.00 1.00 Emails to/from BH regarding pass through taxes, emails to/from ML regarding first draft of testimony
3/6/14 2.50 2.50 CC and emails with BH regarding pass through taxes and emails to/from ML regarding first draft of testimony, work on first draft of testimony
3/7/14 0.00
3/8/14 3.00 3.00 Continue work on direct testimony
3/9/14 5.00 5.00 Continue work on direct testimony and Ex. 4.01, emails to/from CB, SM and ML regarding testimony scope
3/10/14 0.00
3/11/14 2.50 2.50 Emails to/from ML regarding testimony, continue working on testimony, finalize first draft
3/12/14 1.50 1.50 Emails to ML with first draft of testimony and Ex. 4.01. email to BH regarding status of testimony, CC with ML regarding first draft of testimony
3/13/14 0.00
3/14/14 2.50 2.50 Work on revised draft of testimony incorporating comments, email to ML with revised draft
3/15/14 0.00
3/16/14 0.00
3/17/14 0.00
3/18/14 0.00
3/19/14 0.25 0.25 Email to ML regarding testimony
3/20/14 0.00
3/21/14 0.00
3/22/14 0.00
3/23/14 3.25 3.25 Research questions and comments on first draft ot testimony, email to ML responding to comments on testimony
3/24/14 0.50 0.50 Review email from BH and research and respond to email regarding final leads and lags
3/25/14 0.25 0.25 Emails to/from BH regarding discovery meeting
3/26/14 0.00
3/27/14 4.25 4.25
3/28/14 0.75 0.75 Emails to/from ML regarding draft of testimony
3/29/14 4.00 4.00 Work on finalizing lead lag study into ComEd Ex. 4.02
3/30/14 3.50 3.50 Continue work on finalizing lead lag study into ComEd Ex. 4.02
3/31/14 0.50 0.50 Emails to/from FF regarding billing request

SUBTOTAL 50.50 250.00$ 12,625.00$

Abbreviation Key:
CC conference call, WPs workpapers, DRR Data Request Response

Totals CWC cash working capital
Hours 50.50
Rate 250.00 MF Marty Fruehe, CB Chris Brinkmann, FF Fran Fleming, DS David Stahl, BH Bill Hayden, ST Susan Tracy, JW Jim Weibel, HT Hau Thach

Totals 12,625.00 BH Bill Hayden, CD Chris Dunn, LC Lakeeta Colon. SM Sandeep Menon; ML Michael Lee

Expenses incurred NONE

Total 0

Monthly Total 12,625.00

Travel to/from and attendance at Discovery training session, review and finalize final draft of testimony for distribution
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