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SFIO CONSULTING TIMESHEET 

Name: John Hengtgen Month Ending: 

II 
Rate Description 

1---....::..:..:::..~1------'=+-----IReview 2-29 email from BH with final RR model/calculation and other attachments and impact on CWC. Update of ' . 2S.1 and WP 3 
to agree with final ewe calculation and respond to BH and FF. I 

3/1/12 2.SO 

3/1/12 1.00 Prepare final draft of Surrebuttal testimony incorporating changes to the ewe calculation from BH model. I 
3/1/12 0.25 Review emails from JR regarding cross availability and witness preperation meeting and respond. I 
3/1/12 o.so Exchange of emails with FF regarding Ex. 2S.1 and WP 3 II 
3/1/U o.so Review of email from JR regarding final draft of testimony and pending comments and respond. 

3/2/12 0.7S Review final draft of Surrebuttal with changes from JR and respond. 

3/2/12 0.2S Review emails regarding proposed cross schedule. 

3/4/U 2.00 Witness preperation - review DR responses and re-read rebuttal and surrebuttal. 
3/S/12 2.SO Witness preperation and conference call with JR, BP, MF, KH and FF. 
3/5/U O.SO Prepare DR for Staff and send to JR for processing. 

3/6/12 1.25 1---...;.:...:.:..-;,-----=+----IReview email from FF and attachments, finalize witness binder with final DRs and staff intervenor rebuttal and ComEil Surrebuttal 
testimonies. I 

3/7/12 o.so Review email and attachment from NC regarding final DR attestation listing. I 
3/7/12 0.2S Review emails from JR including Staff responses to DR 11.01, 12.01 and 12.02.. II 
3/7/12 1.50 Final witness preperation including re-read Kahle, Brosch and Smith testimony. II 
3/8/12 s.oo Attend hearings at ICC including cross examination. II 
3/8/12 0.25 Review email from JR responding Kahle DR and respond. M 
3/9/12 1.00 

3/10/U O.SO 
l---,~:c!..:::=i----:'7:+----+P,.:.r::el::;im=in:::a~ryc.:r:::e:::v;.:ie:::w email from JR regarding Staff motion to file Staff Ex. 1S.1R Instanter and response summarizing i pact. 

Additional review of Staff motion and response to JR, KH, MF and BP. 
3/10/12 . 0.7S Review em ails from JR (from DS) regarding Gorman cross and respond. 
3/12/12 O.SO Review email from JR re: Staff motion and respond regarding question on IEET/CIMG taxes. 
3/12/12 0.25 Review email from JR re: Kahle cross and respond to JR. KH, MF and BP. 
3/16/U 0.2S Review of Outline for Post Hearing Brief and provide comments on CWC section. 
3/20/12 0.7S Review email from JR re: question on ewe and A/P amounts and respond. 
3/21/12 0.2S Review follow up email from JR re: question on ewe and A/P amounts and respond. 
3/22/12 1.2S Review advance copy of initial brief ewe section and provide comments. 

3/23/12 o.so Review first draft of initial brief of ewe section and provide comments. 

SUBTOTAL 25.SO $225 $S,737.SO 

Commonwealth Edison - May 1, 2012 Filing 

3/1243/2012 0.2S Em ails to/from MF and others regarding ewe for May 1st filing. 
3/14/12 0.25 Phone call with MF regarding ewe May 1st filing. 

3/15/12 1.00 Review of data requirements for next ewe filing and email to CD and BH summarizing data/schedules needed. 
3/22/12 0. 7S Review of leasing information needed and emails to MB and CD and BH regarding such for next ewe filing. 
3/28/U 0.25 Review emails from NC regarding schedules C-11.1 and C-11.3. 

3/31/12 0.2S Review emails from BH regarding RR and CWC model and respond. 

3/31/12 o.so Status email to CD, BH, MF, FF and NC regarding outstanding information for next CWC filing. 

SUBTOTAL 3.2S $225 $731.25 

KH- Katie Houtsma, ML- Max Leichtman, NC- Nicole Cypranowski, LF- Laura Ficarra, M_B - Mike Battaglia, WW- We dy Willet, JJ -
1-- ----,1-----+----ilay Joyce, MO - Mary Osterman, JR -John Ratnaswamy, MF - Marty_ Fruehe, RB .- Rick Bernet, JJ - James iohns.on, FF- rands Fleming. 

1--------11-----+-----IJG -Julia Good, CE - Courtney Erickson, CD- Chris Dunn, JC - Jie Chu, RBA - Ron it Bam;tt, BH ~ Bill Hayden, BP- Brad r rkins, OS-

David Stahl ------· ---~-----------+------1 
I . . - ; ;- - ' . ; , 

- -- -- - - ~-

Expenses incurred NONE 

2013CFRU 0004772
CONFIDENTIAL



SFIO CONSULTING TIMESHEET 

Name: Salvatore Fiorella Month Ending: Mar-12 

Date Hours Rate Oesaiption 

Com Ed 

Docl<et 11-0721- ewe 

3/ 1/ 12 1.00 Review Co. Drafts of Surrebuttal 
3/2,4/2012 5.00 Review Cross Schedules/Witness Prep assisitance 

3/5/12 0.75 Review CUB/Staff Motions 
3/6/12 4.00 Meeting with witness 

03/12,13/2012 10.50 Cover Hearings; meetings; strategy sessions 

3/22/12 1.00 Draft of initial Briefs 

3/28,29/2012 2.00 Review Briefs of Parties 

Docl<et 12-0321 -ewe 

3/1/12 1.00 Discuss scheduling and other arrangements 

3/14/15 0.75 Organiztional matters re: work 

3/15/12 0.50 Data requirement review 

I 

I 

Expenses incurred NONE 

2013CFRU 0004773
CONFIDENTIAL



SFIO Consulting, Inc. (FEIN ) INVOICE
Salvatore Fiorella
22560 Home Court DATE: 05/01/12

Frankfort, Illinois 60423-8192 INVOICE # 58

815-469-2405 (Office); 312-907-7220 (Cell) Contract # 01060687

Bill To:
Exelon Corporation
Attn: Accounts Payable For:    Salvatore Fiorella
10 South Dearborn St.
Chicago, IL   60603

(e-mail: A/P-Invoices@ExelonCorp.com)

DESCRIPTION Qty RATE AMOUNT

Services provided during the month of April, 2012:

RE:  May, 2012 Filing

A.  SF - Review/comment on initial 

drafts of Performance Rate Reconciliation testimony 6 150 900.00             

B.  CEB - Same as above 5 $250 1,250.00          

C.  JH - (Pending determination of Fixed contract proposal)

SUBTOTAL  2,150.00$        

OTHER  -                   

TOTAL  2,150.00$        

THANK YOU FOR YOUR BUSINESS!THANK YOU FOR YOUR BUSINESS!

REDACTED

RCE 00638
CONFIDENTIAL AND PROPRIETARY

Docket No. 13-xxxx 
ComEd Ex. 8.06 (CONFIDENTIAL AND PROPRIETARY)

2013CFRU 0004774
CONFIDENTIAL
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REDACTED
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