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From:   Drewes, Dan
Sent:   Monday, August 05, 2013 10:07 AM
To:     Leka, Kathy
Cc:     Toliver, Aaron
Subject:        FW: Commission Docket T13-0028 (Stipulated Agreement 1684)
Attachments:    T13-0028 1980714_1.pdf

Kathy, this is the 1st (3 month) progress report in T13-0028.

From: Parker, Daniel C. [mailto:daniel.parker@nscorp.com]  
Sent: Tuesday, July 30, 2013 7:11 AM 
To: Drewes, Dan 
Cc: Tumpane, Corey A.; Toliver, Aaron; Parker, Daniel C. (daniel.parker@nscorp.com) 
Subject: RE: Commission Docket T13-0028 (Stipulated Agreement 1684)

Dan, 

Here is the status:  

Kent & Sterling  Milepost: KS-152.85       DOT# 534490V is complete
Main Street        Milepost: KS-165.71        DOT# 534522Y is not complete - material is being ordered -
were waiting on funding approval 
County Road 6   Mileposts: KS-104.42      DOT# 534398V is not complete - material is being ordered -
were waiting on funding approval

Thank you, 

Daniel C. Parker
Norfolk Southern Corp.
Engineer Public Improvements
Bridges and Structures
Office: 404-529-1256
Cell: 423-802-3563

From: Tumpane, Corey A.  
Sent: Tuesday, July 30, 2013 7:49 AM 
To: Parker, Daniel C. 
Subject: RE: Commission Docket T13-0028 (Stipulated Agreement 1684)

The crossing at MP KS 152.85 is complete.  

The other two are not and we do not have any material for these crossings yet.  Has the funding for 
these two been released and can we order the material for them?

Corey Tumpane
Track Supervisor
Kankakee, IL
630-310-7248

From: Parker, Daniel C.  
Sent: Tuesday, July 30, 2013 7:06 AM 
To: Tumpane, Corey A. 
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Cc: Parker, Daniel C. (daniel.parker@nscorp.com); Reiner, James E. 
Subject: FW: Commission Docket T13-0028 (Stipulated Agreement 1684)

Do you know if the crossings have been installed at Mileposts: KS-104.42, KS-152.85, KS-165.71

Daniel C. Parker
Norfolk Southern Corp.
Engineer Public Improvements
Bridges and Structures
Office: 404-529-1256
Cell: 423-802-3563

From: Drewes, Dan [mailto:dandrewe@icc.illinois.gov]  
Sent: Monday, July 29, 2013 3:46 PM 
To: daniel.parker@nscorp.com 
Cc: Toliver, Aaron 
Subject: FW: Commission Docket T13-0028 (Stipulated Agreement 1684)

Has this project commenced yet?  Please give us a status report. 

From: Drewes, Dan  
Sent: Monday, July 08, 2013 12:03 PM 
To: 'daniel.parker@nscorp.com' 
Cc: Toliver, Aaron; 'cayela.wimberly@nscorp.com'; 'clay.whittingham@aecom.com' 
Subject: RE: Commission Docket T13-0028 (Stipulated Agreement 1684)

Mr. Parker, I’m tracking the progress made in this project and am led to believe you may be the 
“Project Manager”.  If so, could you update us?  If someone else in the NS organization is responsible 
for submitting this report as required by Commission Order T13-0028, please forward this to 
appropriate personnel.  This project involves surface renewals at CH 6 (AAR/DOT 534 398V) near 
Kankakee; Kent/Sterling Street (AAR/DOT 534 490V) in Streator; Main Street (AAR/DOT 534 522Y) in 
Lostant.

                                Thanks,
                                                Dan Drewes  
  

From: Whittingham, Clay [mailto:Clay.Whittingham@aecom.com]  
Sent: Wednesday, June 26, 2013 6:02 AM 
To: Drewes, Dan 
Subject: RE: Commission Docket T13-0028 (Stipulated Agreement 1684)

Dan,

I am not sure how my name keeps getting placed on these project, but I will speak with Cayela 
Wimberly at Norfolk Southern and see if I can get you the name of the project manager for this 
project.  

Clay Whittingham
AECOM
404-946-9520

From: Drewes, Dan [mailto:dandrewe@icc.illinois.gov]  
Sent: Monday, June 24, 2013 5:30 PM 
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To: Whittingham, Clay 
Subject: Commission Docket T13-0028 (Stipulated Agreement 1684)

Clay, the 1st   (3 month) progress report was due in this case on 6/20/13.  How are things coming along?
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