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OT Base OT Beeline Payment Payment Ledger Charge
Date Docket Task Detail Hours Hours Rate Rate Cost Admn Fee Total for the week Payment Reference 12-0321

04/30/12 12-0321 Prepare Schedules Taxes for CWC 4
05/01/12 Transm Review Schedules Referencing schedules 8
05/02/12 Transm Review Schedules Referencing schedules 9.5 421351300000  
05/03/12 Transm Review Schedules Referencing schedules 8
05/04/12 Transm Review Schedules Referencing schedules 5.5

05/07/12 12-0321 Prepare Schedules Referencing schedules 4.5
05/08/12 12-0321 Prepare Schedules Referencing schedules 5
05/09/12 12-0321 Prepare Schedules Referencing schedules 5 653551300000  
05/10/12 12-0321 Prepare Schedules Referencing schedules 5
05/11/12 12-0321 Prepare Schedules Referencing schedules 5.5

05/14/12 Transm Review Schedules Referencing schedules 5
05/15/12 12-0321 Prepare Schedules Referencing schedules 4 084951300000  

05/29/12 12-0321 Discovery DRs RWB 2.02-2.11 (Accrued Vac); RWB 2.12-2.23 (Accrued Incentive) 8.5
05/30/12 12-0321 Discovery DRs RWB 2.02-2.11 (Accrued Vac); RWB 2.12-2.23 (Accrued Incentive) 9.5 664761300000  
05/31/12 12-0321 Discovery DRs RWB 2.02-2.11 (Accrued Vac); RWB 2.12-2.23 (Accrued Incentive) 8
06/01/12 12-0321 Discovery DRs RWB 2.02-2.11 (Accrued Vac); RWB 2.12-2.23 (Accrued Incentive) 8

06/04/12 12-0321 Discovery DRs RWB 2.02-2.11 (Accrued Vac); RWB 2.12-2.23 (Accrued Incentive) 8
06/05/12 12-0321 Discovery DRs RWB 2.02-2.11 (Accrued Vac); RWB 2.12-2.23 (Accrued Incentive) 8
06/06/12 12-0321 Discovery DRs RWB 2.02-2.11 (Accrued Vac); RWB 2.12-2.23 (Accrued Incentive) 8 158171300000  
06/07/12 12-0321 Discovery DRs RWB 2.02-2.11 (Accrued Vac); RWB 2.12-2.23 (Accrued Incentive) 8
06/08/12 12-0321 Discovery DRs RWB 2.02-2.11 (Accrued Vac); RWB 2.12-2.23 (Accrued Incentive) 8 1

06/11/12 12-0321 Discovery DRs RWB 2.02-2.11 (Accrued Vac); RWB 2.12-2.23 (Accrued Incentive) 8
06/12/12 12-0321 Discovery DRs RWB 2.02-2.11 (Accrued Vac); RWB 2.12-2.23 (Accrued Incentive) 8
06/13/12 12-0321 Discovery DRs AG 2.11 (Defd Inc Tax Rate Change); AG 2.19 & 2.20 (Rentals); RWB 6.08 (Tax Acctg) 8 802671300000  
06/14/12 12-0321 Discovery DRs AG 2.11 (Defd Inc Tax Rate Change); AG 2.19 & 2.20 (Rentals); RWB 6.08 (Tax Acctg) 8
06/15/12 12-0321 Discovery DRs AG 2.11 (Defd Inc Tax Rate Change); AG 2.19 & 2.20 (Rentals); RWB 6.08 (Tax Acctg) 8

06/18/12 12-0321 Discovery DRs AG 2.11 (Defd Inc Tax Rate Change); AG 2.19 & 2.20 (Rentals) 11
06/19/12 12-0321 Discovery DRs AG 2.11 (Defd Inc Tax Rate Change) 8
06/20/12 12-0321 Discovery DRs AG 3.01 (ADIT on Reg Asset); AG 3.02-3.04 (WP 5, Deferred Debits) 8 899381300000  
06/21/12 12-0321 Discovery DRs AG 3.01 (ADIT on Reg Asset); AG 3.02-3.04 (WP 5, Deferred Debits) 7.5
06/22/12 12-0321 Discovery DRs AG 3.02-3.04 (WP 5 Deferred Debits) 5.5

06/25/12 12-0321 Discovery DRs AG 3.02-3.04 (WP 5 Deferred Debits) 5
06/26/12 12-0321 Discovery DRs AG 3.03-3.04 (WP 5 Deferred Debits) 4 899381300000  
06/27/12 12-0321 Discovery DRs AG 3.03-3.04 (WP 5 Deferred Debits) 7
06/28/12 12-0321 Discovery DRs AG 3.03-3.04 (WP 5 Deferred Debits) 4.5

07/02/12 12-0321 Discovery DRs RWB 8.02-8.08 (Accrued Vacation and associated Deferred Debit) 6
07/03/12 12-0321 Discovery DRs RWB 8.02-8.08 (Accrued Vacation and associated Deferred Debit) 6 064781300000  
07/05/12 12-0321 Discovery DRs RWB 8.02-8.08 (Accrued Vacation and associated Deferred Debit) 6.5
07/06/12 12-0321 Discovery DRs RWB 8.02-8.08 (Accrued Vacation and associated Deferred Debit) 8

07/09/12 12-0321 Discovery DRs RWB 8.02-8.08 (Accrued Vacation and associated Deferred Debit) 8
07/10/12 12-0321 Discovery DRs RWB 8.06-8.08 (Accrued Vacation Deferred Debit) 6.5
07/11/12 12-0321 Discovery Drs RWB 8.06-8.08 (Accrued Vacation Deferred Debit) 7 141191300000  
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OT Base OT Beeline Payment Payment Ledger Charge
Date Docket Task Detail Hours Hours Rate Rate Cost Admn Fee Total for the week Payment Reference 12-0321

07/12/12 12-0321 Discovery DRs RWB 8.06-8.08 (Accrued Vacation Deferred Debit) 8.5
07/13/12 12-0321 Discovery DRs RWB 8.06-8.08 (Accrued Vacation Deferred Debit) 3

07/16/12 12-0321 Discovery Reviewed App 5 8
07/17/12 12-0321 Discovery Reviewed App 5 7 353691300000  
07/18/12 12-0321 Discovery Reviewed App 5 8
07/19/12 12-0321 Discovery Reviewed App 5 7.5

09/04/12 12-0321 Surrebuttal DRs RWB 11.01-11.05 (Accrued Vacation ADIT) 5.5
09/05/12 12-0321 Surrebuttal DRs RWB 11.01-11.05 (Accrued Vacation ADIT) 9.5 810422300000  
09/06/12 12-0321 Surrebuttal DRs RWB 11.01-11.05 (Accrued Vacation ADIT) 9
09/07/12 12-0321 Surrebuttal DRs RWB 11.01-11.05 (Accrued Vacation ADIT) 7

09/10/12 12-0321 Surrebuttal Updated WP 5 and App 5 for Surrebuttal 8
09/13/12 12-0321 Surrebuttal Reviewed M. Fruehe Surrebuttal Testimony 8 064822300000  
09/14/12 12-0321 Surrebuttal Reviewed M. Fruehe Surrebuttal Testimony 8

09/17/12 12-0321 Surrebuttal Reviewed M. Fruehe Surrebuttal Testimony 8
09/18/12 12-0321 Surrebuttal Reviewed M. Fruehe Surrebuttal Testimony 8 603332300000  
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INVOICE NUMBER: 222010541
JOB NUMBER: B28583000900010000000
(Please include on payment)

Mr. David Stahl
Partner
Eimer Stahl, LLP
224 S. Michigan Ave, Ste 1100
Chicago, IL 60604

Electronic Payment
Instructions:
(preferred method of
payment)
JP Morgan Chase
ABA:
Acct.

REMIT CHECKS TO:
Booz & Company
PO Box 88917
Chicago, IL 60695-1917

Payable within 10 days of receipt Invoice Date: 03/16/2012

Please fine the invoice amounts below for the professional fees
and expenses associated with the work as described in the
February 16, 2012 Engagement Letter.

If you have any questions, please give me a call at 214-746-6571.
It was a pleasure working with you on this matter.

Professional Fees

Expenses

Total Due:

Sincerely,

Earl Simpkins
Vice President
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ComEd 2012 Rate Proceedings Support - Booz & Company

Summary table
Consultant Classification Hours Rate Total
Todd Jirovec Vice President 137 $
David Mondrus Principal 66 $
Zachary Cheaney Sr Consultant 165 $
Brittany Raetzman Sr Consultant 16 $

Total 384

Weekly Activities List
Week Of Consultant Hours Classification Activity Description

23-Jul Todd Jirovec 20 Vice President Developed outline and initial draft of rebuttal testimony

David Mondrus 12 Principal Provided oversight and guidance to Sr Consultant executing synergies and CTA analysis

Zachary Cheaney 55 Sr Consultant
Analyzed synegies and CTA included in 2012-2016 budgets; reconciled to Synergies Tracking
Tool

30-Jul Todd Jirovec 20 Vice President Reviewed preliminary synergy & CTA findings; refined draft of rebuttal testimony

David Mondrus 8 Principal

Provided oversight and guidance to Sr Consultant executing synergies and CTA analysis;
coordinated with ComEd personnel developing testimony for other witnesses, primarily Joe
Trpik

Zachary Cheaney 55 Sr Consultant
Analyzed synegies and CTA included in 2012-2016 budgets; reconciled to Synergies Tracking
Tool; incorporated guidance from testimony reviews

6-Aug Todd Jirovec 15 Vice President
Refined rebuttal testimony; reviewed with ComEd and BSC stakeholders and incorporated
input

David Mondrus 16 Principal

Provided oversight and guidance to Sr Consultant executing synergies and CTA analysis;
coordinated with ComEd personnel developing testimony for other witnesses, primarily Joe
Trpik

Zachary Cheaney 55 Sr Consultant
Analyzed synegies and CTA included in 2012-2016 budgets; reconciled to Synergies Tracking
Tool; incorporated guidance from testimony reviews

13-Aug Todd Jirovec 10 Vice President Refined rebuttal testimony; reviewed with ComEd and BSC stakeholders and incorporate input

David Mondrus 6 Principal Refined rebuttal testimony; reviewed with ComEd and BSC stakeholders and incorporate input

20-Aug Todd Jirovec 6 Vice President
Reviewed responses to DRs contained in AG 7th Set and socialized with ComEd and BSC
subject matter experts

David Mondrus 16 Principal
Worked with ComEd and BSC subject matter experts to determine responses to DRs
contained in AG 7th Set; Led analyses required by responses

Brittany Raetzman 8 Sr Consultant Conducted analyses in support of responses to DRs contained in AG 7th Set

27-Aug Todd Jirovec 10 Vice President
Reviewed responses to DRs contained in AG 7th Set and socialized with ComEd and BSC
subject matter experts

David Mondrus 4 Principal Led analyses required by DRs contained in AG 7th Set; drafted responses
Brittany Raetzman 8 Sr Consultant Conducted analyses in support of responses to DRs contained in AG 7th Set

3-Sep Todd Jirovec 16 Vice President Developed outline and initial draft of surrebuttal testimony
David Mondrus 4 Principal Supported analysis contained in surrebuttal testimony

10-Sep Todd Jirovec 16 Vice President Finalized and reviewed surrebuttal testimony
17-Sep Todd Jirovec 16 Vice President Finalized surrebuttal testimony; prepared for cross-examination

24-Sep Todd Jirovec 8 Vice President Prepared for surrebuttal testimony with regulatory attorneys; testified to ICC on Sep 25th
Total 384
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Cardholder Card Type Transaction Date Posted Date Download Date  Expense 
Amount  

Expense Type Merchant/Vendor Business Purpose Personal Transaction Status Report Name Department Business Unit Project Paid Date

JONES, BETTY J Supply Card Jun 10, 2012 Jun 11, 2012 Jun 14, 2012 19000 - Courier Services - Air Grnd FEDEX 793648580031 L. Coggeshall Fedex to S. Satter re 2012 rate case N Approved Regulatory Supply, July, 2012 00402-Legal Ext. Srvcs . COMED 10601-Commonwealth Edison Company 12RPDFR11-Dist Formula Rate Jul 24, 2012

JONES, BETTY J Supply Card Jun 10, 2012 Jun 11, 2012 Jun 14, 2012 19000 - Courier Services - Air Grnd FEDEX 793648603768 L. Coggeshall Fedex to S. Rubin re 2012 rate case N Approved Regulatory Supply, July, 2012 00402-Legal Ext. Srvcs . COMED 10601-Commonwealth Edison Company 12RPDFR11-Dist Formula Rate Jul 24, 2012

JONES, BETTY J Supply Card Jun 10, 2012 Jun 11, 2012 Jun 14, 2012 19000 - Courier Services - Air Grnd FEDEX 793648612074 L. Coggeshall Fedex to K. Munsch re 2012 rate case N Approved Regulatory Supply, July, 2012 00402-Legal Ext. Srvcs . COMED 10601-Commonwealth Edison Company 12RPDFR11-Dist Formula Rate Jul 24, 2012

JONES, BETTY J Supply Card Jun 10, 2012 Jun 11, 2012 Jun 14, 2012 19000 - Courier Services - Air Grnd FEDEX 793655159953 L. Coggeshall Fedex to K. Munsch re 2012 rate case N Approved Regulatory Supply, July, 2012 00402-Legal Ext. Srvcs . COMED 10601-Commonwealth Edison Company 12RPDFR11-Dist Formula Rate Jul 24, 2012

JONES, BETTY J Supply Card Jun 10, 2012 Jun 11, 2012 Jun 14, 2012 19000 - Courier Services - Air Grnd FEDEX 793655174004 L. Coggeshall Fedex to M. Brosch re 2012 rate case N Approved Regulatory Supply, July, 2012 00402-Legal Ext. Srvcs . COMED 10601-Commonwealth Edison Company 12RPDFR11-Dist Formula Rate Jul 24, 2012

JONES, BETTY J Supply Card Jun 10, 2012 Jun 11, 2012 Jun 14, 2012 19000 - Courier Services - Air Grnd FEDEX 793655193113 L. Coggeshall Fedex J. Feeley re 2012 Rate Case N Approved Regulatory Supply, July, 2012 00402-Legal Ext. Srvcs . COMED 10601-Commonwealth Edison Company 12RPDFR11-Dist Formula Rate Jul 24, 2012

JONES, BETTY J Supply Card Jun 21, 2012 Jun 22, 2012 Jun 27, 2012 19000 - Courier Services - Air Grnd FEDEX 793692906853 L. Coggeshall Fedex to S. Satter re  Rate Case N Approved Regulatory Supply, July, 2012 00402-Legal Ext. Srvcs . COMED 10601-Commonwealth Edison Company 12RPDFR11-Dist Formula Rate Jul 24, 2012

JONES, BETTY J Supply Card Jun 21, 2012 Jun 22, 2012 Jun 27, 2012 19000 - Courier Services - Air Grnd FEDEX 793692939855 L. Coggeshall Fedex to K. Munsch re 2012 Rate Case N Approved Regulatory Supply, July, 2012 00402-Legal Ext. Srvcs . COMED 10601-Commonwealth Edison Company 12RPDFR11-Dist Formula Rate Jul 24, 2012

JONES, BETTY J Supply Card Jun 10, 2012 Jun 11, 2012 Jun 14, 2012 19000 - Courier Services - Air Grnd FEDEX 798479139153 L. Coggeshall Fedex to M. Brosch re 2012 rate case N Approved Regulatory Supply, July, 2012 00402-Legal Ext. Srvcs . COMED 10601-Commonwealth Edison Company 12RPDFR11-Dist Formula Rate Jul 24, 2012

JONES, BETTY J Supply Card Jun 10, 2012 Jun 11, 2012 Jun 14, 2012 19000 - Courier Services - Air Grnd FEDEX 798479146203 L. Coggeshall Fedex D. Effron re 2012 rate case N Approved Regulatory Supply, July, 2012 00402-Legal Ext. Srvcs . COMED 10601-Commonwealth Edison Company 12RPDFR11-Dist Formula Rate Jul 24, 2012

JONES, BETTY J Supply Card Jun 10, 2012 Jun 11, 2012 Jun 14, 2012 19000 - Courier Services - Air Grnd FEDEX 798479167679 L. Coggeshall Fedex to S. Struck re 2012 Rate Case N Approved Regulatory Supply, July, 2012 00402-Legal Ext. Srvcs . COMED 10601-Commonwealth Edison Company 12RPDFR11-Dist Formula Rate Jul 24, 2012

JONES, BETTY J Supply Card Jun 10, 2012 Jun 11, 2012 Jun 14, 2012 19000 - Courier Services - Air Grnd FEDEX 798479175416 L. Coggeshall Fedex to J. Feeley re 2012 rate case N Approved Regulatory Supply, July, 2012 00402-Legal Ext. Srvcs . COMED 10601-Commonwealth Edison Company 12RPDFR11-Dist Formula Rate Jul 24, 2012

JONES, BETTY J Supply Card Jun 10, 2012 Jun 11, 2012 Jun 14, 2012 19000 - Courier Services - Air Grnd FEDEX 798485708156 L. Coggeshall Fedex to S. Satter re 2012 Rate Case N Approved Regulatory Supply, July, 2012 00402-Legal Ext. Srvcs . COMED 10601-Commonwealth Edison Company 12RPDFR11-Dist Formula Rate Jul 24, 2012

JONES, BETTY J Supply Card Jun 10, 2012 Jun 11, 2012 Jun 14, 2012 19000 - Courier Services - Air Grnd FEDEX 798485719679 L. Coggeshall Fedex to D. Effron re 2012 Rate Case N Approved Regulatory Supply, July, 2012 00402-Legal Ext. Srvcs . COMED 10601-Commonwealth Edison Company 12RPDFR11-Dist Formula Rate Jul 24, 2012

JONES, BETTY J Supply Card Jun 10, 2012 Jun 11, 2012 Jun 14, 2012 19000 - Courier Services - Air Grnd FEDEX 798485724071 L. Coggeshall Fedex to S. Rubin re 2012 rate case N Approved Regulatory Supply, July, 2012 00402-Legal Ext. Srvcs . COMED 10601-Commonwealth Edison Company 12RPDFR11-Dist Formula Rate Jul 24, 2012

JONES, BETTY J Supply Card Jun 10, 2012 Jun 11, 2012 Jun 14, 2012 19000 - Courier Services - Air Grnd FEDEX 798485728239 L. Coggeshall Fedex to S. Struck re 2012 rate case N Approved Regulatory Supply, July, 2012 00402-Legal Ext. Srvcs . COMED 10601-Commonwealth Edison Company 12RPDFR11-Dist Formula Rate Jul 24, 2012

JONES, BETTY J Supply Card Jun 15, 2012 Jun 18, 2012 Jun 21, 2012 19000 - Courier Services - Air Grnd FEDEX 798502837840 C. Tenoria Fedex to C. Scarsella re 2012 Rate Case N Approved Regulatory Supply, July, 2012 00402-Legal Ext. Srvcs . COMED 10601-Commonwealth Edison Company 12RPDFR11-Dist Formula Rate Jul 24, 2012

JONES, BETTY J Supply Card Jun 20, 2012 Jun 21, 2012 Jun 26, 2012 19000 - Courier Services - Air Grnd FEDEX 798518627923 L. Coggeshall Fedex to R. Bridal re 2012 Rate Case N Approved Regulatory Supply, July, 2012 00402-Legal Ext. Srvcs . COMED 10601-Commonwealth Edison Company 12RPDFR11-Dist Formula Rate Jul 24, 2012

JONES, BETTY J Supply Card Jun 21, 2012 Jun 22, 2012 Jun 27, 2012 19000 - Courier Services - Air Grnd FEDEX 798523478972 L. Coggeshall Fedex to S. Struck re 2012 Rate Case N Approved Regulatory Supply, July, 2012 00402-Legal Ext. Srvcs . COMED 10601-Commonwealth Edison Company 12RPDFR11-Dist Formula Rate Jul 24, 2012

JONES, BETTY J Supply Card Jun 21, 2012 Jun 22, 2012 Jun 27, 2012 19000 - Courier Services - Air Grnd FEDEX 798523487256 L. Coggeshall Fedex to J. Feeley re 2012 Rate Case N Approved Regulatory Supply, July, 2012 00402-Legal Ext. Srvcs . COMED 10601-Commonwealth Edison Company 12RPDFR11-Dist Formula Rate Jul 24, 2012

JONES, BETTY J Supply Card Jun 21, 2012 Jun 22, 2012 Jun 27, 2012 19000 - Courier Services - Air Grnd FEDEX 798523507012 L. Coggeshall Fedex to M. Brosch re 2012 Rate Case N Approved Regulatory Supply, July, 2012 00402-Legal Ext. Srvcs . COMED 10601-Commonwealth Edison Company 12RPDFR11-Dist Formula Rate Jul 24, 2012

JONES, BETTY J Supply Card Jun 21, 2012 Jun 22, 2012 Jun 27, 2012 19000 - Courier Services - Air Grnd FEDEX 798523516061 L. Coggeshall Fedex to D. Effron re 2012 Rate Case N Approved Regulatory Supply, July, 2012 00402-Legal Ext. Srvcs . COMED 10601-Commonwealth Edison Company 12RPDFR11-Dist Formula Rate Jul 24, 2012

JONES, BETTY J Supply Card Jun 15, 2012 Jun 18, 2012 Jun 21, 2012 19000 - Courier Services - Air Grnd FEDEX 800046399085 B. Dodds Fedex to D. Kowalewski re 2012 formula rate N Approved Regulatory Supply, July, 2012 00402-Legal Ext. Srvcs . COMED 10601-Commonwealth Edison Company 12RPDFR11-Dist Formula Rate Jul 24, 2012

JONES, BETTY J Supply Card Jun 19, 2012 Jun 20, 2012 Jun 23, 2012 19000 - Courier Services - Air Grnd FEDEX 800046399096 B. Dodds Fedex to D. Kowalewski re ComED formula 2012 N Approved Regulatory Supply, July, 2012 00402-Legal Ext. Srvcs . COMED 10601-Commonwealth Edison Company 12RPDFR11-Dist Formula Rate Jul 24, 2012

JONES, BETTY J Supply Card Jun 19, 2012 Jun 20, 2012 Jun 23, 2012 19000 - Courier Services - Air Grnd FEDEX 800046399100 B. Dodds Fedex to C. Baranowski re 2012 rate case N Approved Regulatory Supply, July, 2012 00402-Legal Ext. Srvcs . COMED 10601-Commonwealth Edison Company 12RPDFR11-Dist Formula Rate Jul 24, 2012

JONES, BETTY J Supply Card Jun 20, 2012 Jun 21, 2012 Jun 26, 2012 19000 - Courier Services - Air Grnd FEDEX 800046399111 B. Dodds Fedex to J. Lipinski re 2012 rate case N Approved Regulatory Supply, July, 2012 00402-Legal Ext. Srvcs . COMED 10601-Commonwealth Edison Company 12RPDFR11-Dist Formula Rate Jul 24, 2012

JONES, BETTY J Supply Card May 6, 2012 May 7, 2012 May 10, 2012 19000 - Courier Services - Air Grnd FEDEX 800135953052 Julia Good Fedex to Martin Fruehe re formula rate N Approved Regulatory Supply, May 2012 00402-Legal Ext. Srvcs . COMED 10601-Commonwealth Edison Company 12RPDFR11-Dist Formula Rate May 29, 2012

JONES, BETTY J Supply Card May 9, 2012 May 10, 2012 May 15, 2012 19000 - Courier Services - Air Grnd FEDEX 800135953063 Brian Dodds Fedex to Damon Xenopoulos re formula rate N Approved Regulatory Supply, May 2012 00402-Legal Ext. Srvcs . COMED 10601-Commonwealth Edison Company 12RPDFR11-Dist Formula Rate May 29, 2012

JONES, BETTY J Supply Card May 20, 2012 May 21, 2012 May 24, 2012 19000 - Courier Services - Air Grnd FEDEX 800135953085 Julia Good Fedex to Steven Brahwest re rate case N Approved Regulatory Supply, June, 2012 00402-Legal Ext. Srvcs . COMED 10601-Commonwealth Edison Company 12RPDFR11-Dist Formula Rate Jun 26, 2012

JONES, BETTY J Supply Card May 20, 2012 May 21, 2012 May 24, 2012 19000 - Courier Services - Air Grnd FEDEX 800135953096 Julia Good Fedex to Richard Toole re 2012 rate case N Approved Regulatory Supply, June, 2012 00402-Legal Ext. Srvcs . COMED 10601-Commonwealth Edison Company 12RPDFR11-Dist Formula Rate Jun 26, 2012

JONES, BETTY J Supply Card May 3, 2012 May 4, 2012 May 9, 2012 19000 - Courier Services - Air Grnd FEDEX 872857964729 Julia Good Fedex to Karen Lesson re formula rate N Approved Regulatory Supply, May 2012 00402-Legal Ext. Srvcs . COMED 10601-Commonwealth Edison Company 12RPDFR11-Dist Formula Rate May 29, 2012

JONES, BETTY J Supply Card May 3, 2012 May 4, 2012 May 9, 2012 19000 - Courier Services - Air Grnd FEDEX 873586228760 Julia Good Fedex to Edward Fitzhenry re forumula rate N Approved Regulatory Supply, May 2012 00402-Legal Ext. Srvcs . COMED 10601-Commonwealth Edison Company 12RPDFR11-Dist Formula Rate May 29, 2012

JONES, BETTY J Supply Card May 3, 2012 May 4, 2012 May 9, 2012 19000 - Courier Services - Air Grnd FEDEX 873586228770 Julia Good Fedex to Kristin Murisch re formula rate N Approved Regulatory Supply, May 2012 00402-Legal Ext. Srvcs . COMED 10601-Commonwealth Edison Company 12RPDFR11-Dist Formula Rate May 29, 2012

JONES, BETTY J Supply Card May 3, 2012 May 4, 2012 May 9, 2012 19000 - Courier Services - Air Grnd FEDEX 873586228781 Julia Good Fedex to Michael Munson re formula rate N Approved Regulatory Supply, May 2012 00402-Legal Ext. Srvcs . COMED 10601-Commonwealth Edison Company 12RPDFR11-Dist Formula Rate May 29, 2012

JONES, BETTY J Supply Card May 6, 2012 May 7, 2012 May 10, 2012 19000 - Courier Services - Air Grnd FEDEX 873586228807 Julia Good Fedex to John Hengtgen re formula rate N Approved Regulatory Supply, May 2012 00402-Legal Ext. Srvcs . COMED 10601-Commonwealth Edison Company 12RPDFR11-Dist Formula Rate May 29, 2012

JONES, BETTY J Supply Card May 3, 2012 May 4, 2012 May 9, 2012 19000 - Courier Services - Air Grnd FEDEX 873591381887 Julia Good Fedex to Susan Sitter re formula rate N Approved Regulatory Supply, May 2012 00402-Legal Ext. Srvcs . COMED 10601-Commonwealth Edison Company 12RPDFR11-Dist Formula Rate May 29, 2012

JONES, BETTY J Supply Card May 3, 2012 May 4, 2012 May 9, 2012 19000 - Courier Services - Air Grnd FEDEX 873591381902 Julia Good Fedex to Janice Dale re formula rate N Approved Regulatory Supply, May 2012 00402-Legal Ext. Srvcs . COMED 10601-Commonwealth Edison Company 12RPDFR11-Dist Formula Rate May 29, 2012

JONES, BETTY J Supply Card May 3, 2012 May 4, 2012 May 9, 2012 19000 - Courier Services - Air Grnd FEDEX 873591381913 Julia Good Fedex to Howard Learner re forumula rate N Approved Regulatory Supply, May 2012 00402-Legal Ext. Srvcs . COMED 10601-Commonwealth Edison Company 12RPDFR11-Dist Formula Rate May 29, 2012

JONES, BETTY J Supply Card May 3, 2012 May 4, 2012 May 9, 2012 19000 - Courier Services - Air Grnd FEDEX 873591381924 Julia good Fedex to Arthur Bruder re formula rate N Approved Regulatory Supply, May 2012 00402-Legal Ext. Srvcs . COMED 10601-Commonwealth Edison Company 12RPDFR11-Dist Formula Rate May 29, 2012

JONES, BETTY J Supply Card May 3, 2012 May 4, 2012 May 9, 2012 19000 - Courier Services - Air Grnd FEDEX 873591381946 Julia Good Fedex to Gerard Fox re formula rate N Approved Regulatory Supply, May 2012 00402-Legal Ext. Srvcs . COMED 10601-Commonwealth Edison Company 12RPDFR11-Dist Formula Rate May 29, 2012

JONES, BETTY J Supply Card May 3, 2012 May 4, 2012 May 9, 2012 19000 - Courier Services - Air Grnd FEDEX 873591381957 Julia Good Fedex to Cynthia Brady re formula rate N Approved Regulatory Supply, May 2012 00402-Legal Ext. Srvcs . COMED 10601-Commonwealth Edison Company 12RPDFR11-Dist Formula Rate May 29, 2012

JONES, BETTY J Supply Card May 6, 2012 May 7, 2012 May 10, 2012 19000 - Courier Services - Air Grnd FEDEX 873591381968 L. Coggeshall Fedex to Eric Robertson re Forumula rate case N Approved Regulatory Supply, May 2012 00402-Legal Ext. Srvcs . COMED 10601-Commonwealth Edison Company 12RPDFR11-Dist Formula Rate May 29, 2012

JONES, BETTY J Supply Card May 4, 2012 May 7, 2012 May 10, 2012 19000 - Courier Services - Air Grnd FEDEX 873591381980 Julia Good Fedex to Sharon Moy re formula rate N Approved Regulatory Supply, May 2012 00402-Legal Ext. Srvcs . COMED 10601-Commonwealth Edison Company 12RPDFR11-Dist Formula Rate May 29, 2012

JONES, BETTY J Supply Card May 4, 2012 May 7, 2012 May 10, 2012 19000 - Courier Services - Air Grnd FEDEX 873591381990 Julia Good Fedex to Sammy Florella re formula rate N Approved Regulatory Supply, May 2012 00402-Legal Ext. Srvcs . COMED 10601-Commonwealth Edison Company 12RPDFR11-Dist Formula Rate May 29, 2012

JONES, BETTY J Supply Card May 3, 2012 May 4, 2012 May 9, 2012 19000 - Courier Services - Air Grnd FEDEX 873591384187 Julia Good Fedex to David Kolata re formula rate N Approved Regulatory Supply, May 2012 00402-Legal Ext. Srvcs . COMED 10601-Commonwealth Edison Company 12RPDFR11-Dist Formula Rate May 29, 2012

JONES, BETTY J Supply Card May 3, 2012 May 4, 2012 May 9, 2012 19000 - Courier Services - Air Grnd FEDEX 873591384202 Julia Good Fedex to Eric Robertson re formula rate N Approved Regulatory Supply, May 2012 00402-Legal Ext. Srvcs . COMED 10601-Commonwealth Edison Company 12RPDFR11-Dist Formula Rate May 29, 2012

JONES, BETTY J Supply Card May 3, 2012 May 4, 2012 May 9, 2012 19000 - Courier Services - Air Grnd FEDEX 873591384213 Julia Good Fedex to Ryan Robertson re formula rate N Approved Regulatory Supply, May 2012 00402-Legal Ext. Srvcs . COMED 10601-Commonwealth Edison Company 12RPDFR11-Dist Formula Rate May 29, 2012

JONES, BETTY J Supply Card May 3, 2012 May 4, 2012 May 9, 2012 19000 - Courier Services - Air Grnd FEDEX 874642882400 Julia Good Fedex to Ronald Jolly re formula rate N Approved Regulatory Supply, May 2012 00402-Legal Ext. Srvcs . COMED 10601-Commonwealth Edison Company 12RPDFR11-Dist Formula Rate May 29, 2012

JONES, BETTY J Supply Card May 3, 2012 May 4, 2012 May 9, 2012 19000 - Courier Services - Air Grnd FEDEX 874642882410 Julia Good Fedex to Alan Jenkins re formula rate N Approved Regulatory Supply, May 2012 00402-Legal Ext. Srvcs . COMED 10601-Commonwealth Edison Company 12RPDFR11-Dist Formula Rate May 29, 2012

JONES, BETTY J Supply Card May 3, 2012 May 4, 2012 May 9, 2012 19000 - Courier Services - Air Grnd FEDEX 874642882421 Julia Good Fedex to Balay re formula rate N Approved Regulatory Supply, May 2012 00402-Legal Ext. Srvcs . COMED 10601-Commonwealth Edison Company 12RPDFR11-Dist Formula Rate May 29, 2012

JONES, BETTY J Supply Card May 3, 2012 May 4, 2012 May 9, 2012 19000 - Courier Services - Air Grnd FEDEX 874642882443 Julia Good Fedex to David Fein re formula rate N Approved Regulatory Supply, May 2012 00402-Legal Ext. Srvcs . COMED 10601-Commonwealth Edison Company 12RPDFR11-Dist Formula Rate May 29, 2012

JONES, BETTY J Supply Card May 3, 2012 May 4, 2012 May 9, 2012 19000 - Courier Services - Air Grnd FEDEX 874642882454 Julia Good Fedex to Christopher Thomas re formula rate N Approved Regulatory Supply, May 2012 00402-Legal Ext. Srvcs . COMED 10601-Commonwealth Edison Company 12RPDFR11-Dist Formula Rate May 29, 2012

JONES, BETTY J Supply Card May 3, 2012 May 4, 2012 May 9, 2012 19000 - Courier Services - Air Grnd FEDEX 874642882465 Julia Good Fedex to Julie Sodema re formula rate N Approved Regulatory Supply, May 2012 00402-Legal Ext. Srvcs . COMED 10601-Commonwealth Edison Company 12RPDFR11-Dist Formula Rate May 29, 2012

RATES COMED, RETAIL Supply Card May 3, 2012 May 7, 2012 May 10, 2012 14070 - Communication/Publication Services ROCKFORD REGISTER Rate Case Public Notice in the Rockford Register N Approved May, 2012 08522-Regulatory Department 10601-Commonwealth Edison Company 12RPDFR11-Dist Formula Rate May 22, 2012

RATES COMED, RETAIL Supply Card May 22, 2012 May 23, 2012 May 26, 2012 14070 - Communication/Publication Services SUN TIMES MEDIA ADVERT Public Notice in the Sun Times Media N Approved June, 2012 08522-Regulatory Department 10601-Commonwealth Edison Company 12RPDFR11-Dist Formula Rate Jun 19, 2012

RATES COMED, RETAIL Supply Card Jun 12, 2012 Jun 13, 2012 Jun 16, 2012 14070 - Communication/Publication Services SUN TIMES MEDIA ADVERT Public Notices in the Sun Times N Approved June, 2012 08522-Regulatory Department 10601-Commonwealth Edison Company 12RPDFR11-Dist Formula Rate Jun 19, 2012

RATES COMED, RETAIL Supply Card Jun 27, 2012 Jun 28, 2012 Jul 3, 2012 14070 - Communication/Publication Services TRIBUNE MEDIA GROUP Public Notices N Approved July, 2012 08522-Regulatory Department 10601-Commonwealth Edison Company 12RPDFR11-Dist Formula Rate Jul 24, 2012

edEx total

ublications (Invoice copies included)
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Classified Ads - 815-962-2400     Rockford Register Star 
Employment Ads - 815 962-9400    99 E. State St 
Classified Fax - 815-962-6578     Rockford, IL 61104 

 
To: William Mueller    Firm: COM ED 

From:   28 

Subject:  Register Star Ad number  RRP1849575   
Order: RRP1849575 Pubs: 1,5 Rate: LR 

Phone: (630)576-6753 Class: 2006   
Account: RRP5766753Ret Start Date: 05/04/2012 Total Price:  

Name: Accounts Payable, Retail Stop Date: 05/11/2012 Payments: $ 0.00 

Sales 28 Taken by 28 Taken On 05/02/2012 

Firm: COM ED   Balance:  
Columns: 1 Inches: 15.292 Lines: 214 

PUBLIC NOTICE 
 
To patrons of Commonwealth 
Edison Company  
 
Commonwealth Edison Com-
pany (“ComEd”) hereby gives 
notice to the public that on 
April 30, 2012, it filed with the 
Illinois Commerce Commis-
sion (“ICC” or “Commission”) 
updated cost inputs, a reve-
nue requirement reconcilia-
tion, and supporting testi-
mony and other information, 
all for the purpose of deter-
mining, pursuant to Section 
16-108.5 of the Illinois Public 
Utilities Act (the “Act”), up-
dated charges for delivery 
services applicable through-
out ComEd’s service territory 
in northern Illinois.  These up-
dated charges will take effect 
beginning with the first day of 
the January 2013 monthly bill-
ing period.  The  updated de-
livery service charges include 
ComEd’s updated costs of de-
livering electricity through its 
distribution system and apply 
to all ComEd customers inde-
pendent of whether electricity 
supply is procured and pro-
vided by ComEd or by a third 
party (i.e., a Retail Electric 
Supplier).  
 
The filing updates data that is 
input into the performance 
based formula rate that re-
covers ComEd’s ICC-
jurisdictional costs of provid-
ing delivery service.  Those 
costs result in a distribution 
revenue requirement of 
$2,131,121,000 based on final 
historical cost data for calen-
dar year 2011 reflected in 
ComEd’s most recently filed 
annual FERC Form 1, as well 
as projected plant additions 
and correspondingly updated 
depreciation reserve and ex-
pense for calendar year 2012, 
and a reconciliation of the 
weighted revenue require-
ments upon which delivery 
service charges applied in 
2011 were based with a reve-
nue requirement for calendar 
year 2011 calculated based on 
actual costs.  Costs that Co-
mEd incurs to deliver electric-
ity to its customers (i.e., the 
delivery component) are only 
a portion of the total bill that 

customers receive from Co-
mEd for bundled price electric 
service.  The remaining por-
tion, the price of the electric-
ity supply and other services, 
is subject to the procurement 
process established by Sec-
tion 1-75 of the Illinois Power 
Agency Act and the provisions 
of Section 16-111.5 of the Pub-
lic Utilities Act, and/or to 
regulation by the Federal En-
ergy Regulatory Commission 
that has jurisdiction over re-
gional market prices.  Using 
current charges for such 
other components, the esti-
mated total bill impacts of 
changes in the delivery com-
ponent are provided herein.  
Increases are denoted by a + 
sign and decreases are de-
noted by a – sign.   
 
For residential customers re-
ceiving bundled fixed price 
electric service, the delivery 
portion of electric bills repre-
sents approximately 39% of 
the total electric bill, on aver-
age, while the supply portion 
makes up about 55% and the 
transmission portion makes 
up the remaining approxi-
mately 6% .  As a result, all 
other things being equal, the 
updated charges for the de-
livery portion result in an 
overall change in the total bill 
of residential customers, on 
average, of +$0.97 per month 
or an estimated  +1.2%.  Total 
bill impacts for residential 
customers vary by delivery 
class and electric usage.  For 
example, the estimated total 
bill impact, on average, for 
multi-family residential cus-
tomers utilizing on average 
360 kilowatt-hours (“kWhs”) 
per month, is +$1.37 per 
month or +2.8%.  Likewise, 
the estimated total bill im-
pact, on average, for single 
family residential customers 
utilizing on average 781 kWhs 
per month, is +$1.05 per 
month or +1.1%.  Similarly, 
the estimated total bill im-
pact, on average, for multi-
family residential customers 
with electric space heat, util-
izing on average 847 kWhs per 
month, is -$1.87 per month or 
-2.5%.  Additionally, the esti-
mated total bill impact, on 
average, for single family 

residential customers with 
electric space heat, utilizing 
on average 1809 kWhs per 
month, is -$2.80 or -1.9%.     
 
The updated delivery service 
charges for nonresidential 
customers in the Watt-Hour 
and Small Load delivery 
classes (100 kilowatts (“kW”) 
or less of demand ), with 
varying usages result in an 
overall percentage change in 
the total bill in the range of 
+0.3% to +1.5%.  Nonresiden-
tial customers with larger 
electric loads (greater than 
100 kW) have a wide range of 
electric load characteristics in 
addition to electricity supply 
costs that cannot be esti-
mated; therefore, the overall 
effect of the updated delivery 
service charges on an electric 
bill for such customers cannot 
be determined.  
 
A copy of the filing and sup-
porting data and documents 
may be inspected by any in-
terested party at ComEd’s of-
fice located at Three Lincoln 
Centre in Oakbrook Terrace, 
Illinois.  In addition, Com-
monwealth Edison Company 
will place an electronic ver-
sion of this Public Notice with 
estimated bill impacts on its 
Internet website 
www.ComEd.com.  Customers 
are advised that the Commis-
sion may alter or amend the 
updated charges after hear-
ings held pursuant to Section 
16-108.5 of the Act and 83 Illi-
nois Administrative Code Part 
200, and may increase or de-
crease individual charges in 
amounts other than  those re-
flected in the charges up-
dated by ComEd.  All parties 
interested in this matter may 
obtain information with re-
spect thereto either directly 
from ComEd or by addressing 
the Chief Clerk of the Illinois 
Commerce Commission, 527 
East Capitol Avenue, Spring-
field, Illinois 62706.    
 
COMMONWEALTH EDISON 
COMPANY  
 
By:  Anne R. Pramaggiore 
President and CEO 
RRS May 4, 11, 2012 
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Detail

TOTAL:

Invoice and Statement

Billed Account #

Client Name

TOTAL AMOUNT DUE

30 Day Balance
60 Day Balance

Current

To ensure proper credit, please detach and return with remittance.

Client Account #
Statement #

Billing Period

Over 90
Unapplied Credits

Billing Date
Payment Term

Billed Period Billed Account # Billed Account Name Client Account NameClient Account #

Current 30 Days Unapplied Amount90+ Days60 Days

Page 1/1

0.00

CU00032790

Date Tribune
Reference #

Advertiser/
Agency PO #

Description Ad Size/
Units

Rate Gross
Amount

Net
Amount

05/01/12 − 05/31/12

0.00 0.00 0.00

0.00

000524925

0.00

Net 15

05/01/12−05/31/12 CU00032790 COMMONWEALTH EDISON

IMPORTANT MESSAGE:

Please contact Tribune Customer Service at the email above if you have any questions or comments. Thank you.

05/31/12

00003279000003279001000524925 00301400 00301400 5

0.00

0.00

COMMONWEALTH EDISON

3 LINCOLN CTR E
FL 3
VILLA PARK, IL 60181−4204

Gail MacMillan

 

14839 Collections Center Drive Chicago, IL 60693−0148

adbilling@tribune.com     866−536−2718

FEIN: 36−2643437

05/03/12

05/10/12

#529929
CTC−INV−0269302

Classified Listings
1625981 PUBLIC NOTICE TO PATRONS OF COMM

Total Current Advertising

RCE 01661

REDACTED

REDACTED

REDACTED

REDACTED REDACTED

Archive Information

jlipinski
Sticky Note
None set by jlipinski

jlipinski
Sticky Note
MigrationNone set by jlipinski

jlipinski
Sticky Note
Unmarked set by jlipinski



REDACTED
REDACTED

REDACTED

RCE 01662

REDACTED

jlipinski
Sticky Note
None set by jlipinski

jlipinski
Sticky Note
MigrationNone set by jlipinski

jlipinski
Sticky Note
Unmarked set by jlipinski



RCE 01663

REDACTED

REDACTED

jlipinski
Sticky Note
None set by jlipinski

jlipinski
Sticky Note
MigrationNone set by jlipinski

jlipinski
Sticky Note
Unmarked set by jlipinski



REDACTED

RCE 01664

REDACTED REDACTED

REDACTED

REDACTED

jlipinski
Sticky Note
None set by jlipinski

jlipinski
Sticky Note
MigrationNone set by jlipinski

jlipinski
Sticky Note
Unmarked set by jlipinski



REDACTED
REDACTED

REDACTED

RCE 01665

REDACTED

jlipinski
Sticky Note
None set by jlipinski

jlipinski
Sticky Note
MigrationNone set by jlipinski

jlipinski
Sticky Note
Unmarked set by jlipinski



RCE 01666

REDACTED

REDACTED

jlipinski
Sticky Note
None set by jlipinski

jlipinski
Sticky Note
MigrationNone set by jlipinski

jlipinski
Sticky Note
Unmarked set by jlipinski



REDACTED

RCE 01667

REDACTED REDACTED

REDACTED

jlipinski
Sticky Note
None set by jlipinski

jlipinski
Sticky Note
MigrationNone set by jlipinski

jlipinski
Sticky Note
Unmarked set by jlipinski



REDACTED

RCE 01668

REDACTED REDACTED

REDACTED

jlipinski
Sticky Note
None set by jlipinski

jlipinski
Sticky Note
MigrationNone set by jlipinski

jlipinski
Sticky Note
Unmarked set by jlipinski



REDACTED

RCE 01669

REDACTED REDACTED

REDACTED

jlipinski
Sticky Note
None set by jlipinski

jlipinski
Sticky Note
MigrationNone set by jlipinski

jlipinski
Sticky Note
Unmarked set by jlipinski



SFIO Consulting, Inc. (FEIN ) INVOICE
Salvatore Fiorella
22560 Home Court DATE: 05/01/12

Frankfort, Illinois 60423-8192 INVOICE # 58

815-469-2405 (Office); 312-907-7220 (Cell) Contract # 01060687

Bill To:
Exelon Corporation
Attn: Accounts Payable For:    Salvatore Fiorella
10 South Dearborn St.
Chicago, IL   60603

(e-mail: A/P-Invoices@ExelonCorp.com)

DESCRIPTION Qty RATE AMOUNT
Services provided during the month of April, 2012:

RE:  May, 2012 Filing

A.  SF - Review/comment on initial 

drafts of Performance Rate Reconciliation testimony 6   

B.  CEB - Same as above 5   

C.  JH - (Pending determination of Fixed contract proposal)

SUBTOTAL  

OTHER  

TOTAL  

THANK YOU FOR YOUR BUSINESS!THANK YOU FOR YOUR BUSINESS!

REDACTED

RCE 01670

REDACTED REDACTED

REDACTED

jlipinski
Sticky Note
None set by jlipinski

jlipinski
Sticky Note
MigrationNone set by jlipinski

jlipinski
Sticky Note
Unmarked set by jlipinski



REDACTED
REDACTED

REDACTED

RCE 01671

REDACTED

jlipinski
Sticky Note
None set by jlipinski

jlipinski
Sticky Note
MigrationNone set by jlipinski

jlipinski
Sticky Note
Unmarked set by jlipinski



RCE 01672

REDACTED

REDACTED

jlipinski
Sticky Note
None set by jlipinski

jlipinski
Sticky Note
MigrationNone set by jlipinski

jlipinski
Sticky Note
Unmarked set by jlipinski



REDACTED

RCE 01673

REDACTED REDACTED

REDACTED

jlipinski
Sticky Note
None set by jlipinski

jlipinski
Sticky Note
MigrationNone set by jlipinski

jlipinski
Sticky Note
Unmarked set by jlipinski



REDACTED
REDACTED

REDACTED

RCE 01674

REDACTED

jlipinski
Sticky Note
None set by jlipinski

jlipinski
Sticky Note
MigrationNone set by jlipinski

jlipinski
Sticky Note
Unmarked set by jlipinski



RCE 01675

REDACTED

REDACTEDREDACTED

jlipinski
Sticky Note
None set by jlipinski

jlipinski
Sticky Note
MigrationNone set by jlipinski

jlipinski
Sticky Note
Unmarked set by jlipinski



REDACTED

RCE 01676

REDACTED
REDACTED

REDACTED

jlipinski
Sticky Note
None set by jlipinski

jlipinski
Sticky Note
MigrationNone set by jlipinski

jlipinski
Sticky Note
Unmarked set by jlipinski



SFIO Consulting, Inc. (FEIN ) INVOICE
Salvatore Fiorella
22560 Home Court DATE: 09/01/12

Frankfort, Illinois 60423-8192 INVOICE # 76

815-469-2405 (Office); 312-907-7220 (Cell) Contract # 01060687

Bill To:
Exelon Corporation
Attn: Accounts Payable For:    Salvatore Fiorella
10 South Dearborn St.
Chicago, IL   60603

(e-mail: A/P-Invoices@ExelonCorp.com)

DESCRIPTION Qty RATE AMOUNT
Services provided during the month of August, 2012:

RE:  Docket 12-0321 (May, 2012 Filing, Perf. Rate Rec. filing) 0

A.  SF - 

    Various calls/discussions with Client and outside Counsel 20   

re: Testimony and strategic considerations;

    Review and comment on Rebuttal Testimony of all Parties    Review and comment on Rebuttal Testimony of all Parties

B.  JH - 

    Respond to numerous Client e-mails re: Staff/Int tty and scope of

Rebuttal; Review change in City tax ordinance; Submit numerous

draft of Rebuutal TTY; Prepare responses to numerous data requests

(primarily, AG-4.05 and AG-7.20) 35   

 

SUBTOTAL  

OTHER  

TOTAL  

THANK YOU FOR YOUR BUSINESS!THANK YOU FOR YOUR BUSINESS!
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From: Fleming, Frances:(ComEd)
Sent: Monday, June 11, 2012 12:52 PM
To: Bashqawi, Roxana:(BSC)
Subject: FW: Copy of Invoice 1010822

10601‐00402‐515050‐12RPDFR11 
 

From: Bashqawi, Roxana:(BSC)  
Sent: Monday, June 11, 2012 11:59 AM 
To: Fleming, Frances:(ComEd) 
Subject: FW: Copy of Invoice 1010822 
 
Fran 
 
Please provide codeblocks for the attached invoice. 
 
Thanks! 
 

From: Bashqawi, Roxana:(BSC)  
Sent: Monday, June 11, 2012 10:33 AM 
To: Bashqawi, Roxana:(BSC) 
Subject: Copy of Invoice 1010822 
 
 

 

Invoice Header Details  

Vendor Details              Vendor ID EIMER  

Client Details              

Invoice Header Details  

Vendor Name Eimer Stahl, LLP Primary Address 224 S. Michagan Avenue Chicago, IL 60604    Vendor ID EIMER  

 

Invoice Matter Invoice Totals 

Invoice No 1010822 Matter Name 2012 Formula Rate Filing  Fees    

Invoice 
Date 5/25/2012 Matter No  2012-000126  

Fee 
Discount  

Invoice 
Start / End 2/23/2012 - 4/30/2012   Expenses    

Received 5/25/2012   Expense 
Discount  

Allocated 
to Fiscal 
Period  

5/2012   Invoice 
Total    

Invoice 
Type  

Invoice    Adjustments

RCE 01684
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2

Currency USD   

    Invoice Net  67,719.70 
USD

      

     

     

      

      

  Firm Billing 
Arrangement Exelon Team Rate    

  Firm Actual 
(YTD)  

    

  Firm Actual 
(LOM)  

    

      

      

Invoice 
Description    

 
 
 
 
 
 

Workflow Details / Comments 

 

    Reviewer Start Date Due Date Action 
Action 
Date Comment 

 

 ShareDoc    Warning   invoice start date 2/23/2012 must be the first 
day of the month, invoice end date 
4/30/2012 must be the last day of the same 
month.  

 

 ShareDoc    Warning   inv_start_date 2/23/2012 is more than 60 
days old  

  O'Brien, Anastasia  5/25/2012  6/4/2012  Approved  5/26/2012  

  O'Neill, Thomas  5/26/2012  5/31/2012 Expired  6/2/2012   

  Bashqawi, Roxana  6/2/2012  6/6/2012  Viewed  6/11/2012  

 
 
 
 
 

 All Line Item Details 
 

 

Currency = USD  

 

  Type Date TK Task Act Description Hrs/Units Rate Disc
Cash 

Adj Net

 

Fee 2/23/2012  DMS    Conference call to discuss issues. 
WARNING - 2/23/2012 outside date range Invoice Date = 
5/25/2012  

0.70  
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 Fee 3/28/2012  RCB    Attend telephone conference with R. Bernet, G. Rippie, A. O 
Brien, M. Johnson, and B. Perkins re Part 285 and other 
issues for upcoming filing; telephone conference with R. 
Bernet re draft testimony of M. Fruehe and K. Houtsma re 
same 

0.80 

 Fee 3/28/2012  mrj    Participate in telephone conference with R. Bernet, S. O 
Brien, B. Perkins, G. Rippie, D. Stahl and R. Barrett re: Part 
285 requirements; telephone conferences with R. Barrett and 
J. Wier re: witness assignments; telephone conferences and 
email correspondence with S. Vogt re: direct testimony and 
begin drafting same 

1.50 

 Fee 3/29/2012  RCB    Telephone conference with D. Stahl re K. Houtsma and M. 
Fruehe testimony 

0.10 

 Fee 3/29/2012  mrj    Draft initial version of Vogt direct testimony and circulate for 
comment 

2.60 

 Fee 4/2/2012  mrj    Telephone conferences and email correspondence with K. 
Houtsma and D. Stahl re: initial draft of Houtsma direct 
testimony; telephone conferences and email correspondence 
with J. Wier re: preparation of direct testimony for R. 
Hemphill; review outline of reconciliation for same; draft 
initial draft of Houtsma direct, edit and circulate to K. 
Houtsma and D. Stahl for review and comment; review initial 
draft of Fruehe direct. 

5.90 

 Fee 4/2/2012  DMS    Work on Fruehe testimony. 1.40 

 Fee 4/3/2012  DMS    Work on M. Fruehe testimony. 0.90 

 Fee 4/5/2012  vm    Review responsive Part 285 minutes from last proceeding 
and draft correspondence to B. Perkins 

0.20 

 Fee 4/6/2012  vm    Prepare folder of material needed for 285 review 1.20 

 Fee 4/9/2012  vm    Prepare for, review and follow-up from review of ComEd 
board minutes; review task list and schedule for formula rate 
reconciliation proceeding 

1.80 

 Fee 4/10/2012  mrj    Email correspondence with S. Vogt re: direct testimony draft; 
review comments on same; email correspondence with R. 
Bernet re: same; revise S. Vogt s direct per comments 
received and circulate to R. Bernet for distribution; meet with 
D. Stahl re: status of testimony and issues. 

1.30 

 Fee 4/10/2012  vm    Prepare for and review ComEd board minutes and materials 2.90 

 Fee 4/11/2012  mrj    Email correspondence with K. Houtsma re: draft direct 
testimony; email correspondence with M. Fruehe re: same; 
review and revise K. Houtsma s direct and circulate to R. 
Bernet for distribution. 

1.40 

 Fee 4/11/2012  vm    Prepare for and review ComEd board materials and Exelon 
audit committee minutes 

2.50 

 Fee 4/11/2012  JMW    Review draft testimony of R. Hemphill 0.50 

 Fee 4/11/2012  DMS    Emails re testimony. 0.10 

 Fee 4/12/2012  mrj    Begin reviewing drafts of direct testimony; participate in 
attorney telephone conference re: same and themes of case; 

1.70 

 Fee 4/12/2012  vm    Prepare for and review Exelon audit committee minutes and 
board materials and Exelon board minutes 

6.40 

 Fee 4/12/2012  RCB    Attend telephone conference re theme development 1.00 

 Fee 4/13/2012  mrj    Participate in Steering Committee telephone conference re: 
themes. 

0.50 

 Fee 4/13/2012  vm    Draft email to B. Perkins regarding status of review; review 
Exelon Board minutes and materials and follow up from 
review 

5.40 

 Fee 4/13/2012  JMW    Review R. Hemphill direct testimony and comments from L. 5.20 
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Alongi and others; correspondence regarding same; provide 
comments to testimony and review correspondence 
regarding same 

 Fee 4/16/2012  JMW    Review comments to direct testimony;  

 office conference 
with F. Fleming regarding brief on exceptions; review section 

4.20 

 Fee 4/16/2012  DMS    Emails re testimony. 0.20 

 Fee 4/16/2012  RCB    Attend telephone conferences re upcoming filing, themes, 
risks, and bridge analysis 

1.40 

 Fee 4/16/2012  vm    Draft 2012 Part 285 review protocol document; confer with J. 
Lipinski and J. McGovern; prepare and supervise organization 
of responsive 285 materials 

1.90 

 Fee 4/16/2012  jml    Confer with V. McClinton and J. McGovern regarding the 
review pertaining to Part 285.150, including ComEd Board of 
Director Minutes and Materials, Exelon Audit Committee 
Minutes and Materials, and Exelon Board of Director Minutes 
and Materials; review, redact, and organize various 
documentation related and responsive to Part 285.150 

3.50 

 Fee 4/16/2012  mrj    Participate in telephone conferences with attorneys and 
witnesses re: themes, revenue requirement and testimony 
development; review S. Kelly s comments on R. Hemphill 
direct; email correspondence and meeting with J. Wier re: 
same; email correspondence with S. Vogt, R. Bernet, J. Trpik 
and R. Brown re: change in witness assignments; revise J. 
Trpik direct testimony to reflect change and circulate for 
review and comment. 

3.30 

 Fee 4/16/2012  jmg    Review documents related to Part 285 filing and redact for 
confidentiality per V. McClinton s instructions; gather 
supplies for redaction project; create various labels for 
redaction project 

4.00 

 Fee 4/16/2012  EMR    Compile and forward documents requested by M. Johnson 0.30 

 Fee 4/17/2012  JMW    Review testimony 1.40 

 Fee 4/17/2012  DMS    Review, revise Hemphill testimony; conference call re filing 
issues. 

2.30 

 Fee 4/17/2012  jml    Work in coordination with J. McGovern to quality-check and 
organize documents pertaining to Part 285.150, including 
ComEd Board of Director Minutes and Materials, Exelon Audit 
Committee Minutes and Materials, and Exelon Board of 
Director Minutes and Materials 

2.00 

 Fee 4/17/2012  mrj    Participate in telephone conference with attorneys and 
witnesses re: filing update; review current drafts of Hemphill 
and Fruehe testimony; email correspondence with K. 
Houtsma re: status of testimony. 

3.10 

 Fee 4/17/2012  RCB    Attend telephone conference re CMC feedback 0.50 

 Fee 4/17/2012  jmg    Review redacted documents related to Part 285 filing with J. 
Lipinski; create labels for each redwell in preparation of V. 
McClinton review 

2.50 

 Fee 4/17/2012  vm    Revise 2012 Part 285 review protocol document;  
check organization of 

affiliate transaction boxes; confer with B. Perkins regarding 
follow-up review 

2.20 

 Fee 4/17/2012  vm     
prepare for discovery talk 

1.80 

 Fee 4/18/2012  JMW    Correspondence regarding filing review 1.00 

 Fee 4/18/2012  mrj    Review, edit and finalize next drafts of Trpik and Houtsma 
direct testimony; email correspondence with R. Brown and K. 
Houtsma re: same. 

1.80 

 Fee 4/18/2012  RCB    Review and revise draft direct testimony 1.30 
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5

 Fee 4/18/2012  DMS    Conference with M. Fruehe re testimony. 0.70 

 Fee 4/18/2012  vm     
 prepare for discovery talk 

2.00 

 Fee 4/19/2012  JMW    Review testimony; correspondence regarding Hemphill 
testimony 

3.50 

 Fee 4/19/2012  jml    Confer with J. Good regarding upcoming file preparation 0.70 

 Fee 4/19/2012  RCB    Review and revise draft direct testimony 2.00 

 Fee 4/19/2012  DMS    Review, revise draft Fruehe testimony. 1.30 

 Fee 4/20/2012  JMW    Review comments to direct testimony; comment on direct 
testimony of R. Hemphill; correspondence regarding same 
and review of filing 

3.80 

 Fee 4/20/2012  RCB    Review and revise draft direct testimony; e-mail 
correspondence re same 

3.60 

 Fee 4/20/2012  DMS    Teleconference with M. Fruehe re testimony. 0.40 

 Fee 4/20/2012  vm    Prepare for and attend Part 285 review meeting with B. 
Perkins;  

 
 

3.00 

 Fee 4/20/2012  jml    Meet and confer with V. McClinton and J. McGovern 
regarding documents pertaining to Part 285.150, including 
ComEd Board of Director Minutes and Materials, Exelon Audit 
Committee Minutes and Materials, and Exelon Board of 
Director Minutes and Materials 

0.80 

 Fee 4/21/2012  mrj    Review email correspondence re: testimony and filing dates; 
review comments on Trpik testimony and email 
correspondence with J. Trpik and R. Brown re: same; review 
comments on K. Houtsma testimony. 

0.90 

 Fee 4/21/2012  RCB    Review and revise draft direct testimony; e-mail 
correspondence re same 

1.90 

 Fee 4/21/2012  DMS    Review, revise draft Fruehe testimony. 0.60 

 Fee 4/22/2012  RCB    E-mail correspondence re direct testimony 0.20 

 Fee 4/22/2012  DMS    Review draft Hemphill testimony; review, revise draft Fruehe 
testimony. 

2.00 

 Fee 4/23/2012  JMW    Review testimony; provide comments to direct testimony of 
R. Hemphill 

2.60 

 Fee 4/23/2012  RCB    E-mail correspondence re direct testimony; telephone 
conference with D. Stahl re same 

0.20 

 Fee 4/23/2012  DMS    Revisions to Fruehe testimony; teleconference with M. 
Fruehe re same. 

1.50 

 Fee 4/23/2012  vm    Draft email regarding Part 285 responsive documents to B. 
Perkins; confer with J. Lipinski regarding Part 285 final 
exhibit and review final exhibit 

2.10 

 Fee 4/23/2012  vm    Draft correspondence regarding EIMA presentation; 
 

1.70 

 Fee 4/23/2012  jml     
 

0.20 

 Fee 4/23/2012  jml    Finalize documents pertaining to Part 285.150, including 
ComEd Board of Director Minutes and Materials, Exelon Audit 
Committee Minutes and Materials, and Exelon Board of 
Director Minutes and Materials per V. McClinton s 
instructions; email correspondence with R3 regarding 
workpapers for various witnesses testimonies; locate various 
citations for incorporation into the direct testimony of J. Trpik 
per M. Johnson 

5.00 

 Fee 4/23/2012  mrj    Email correspondence with R. Brown and S. Rubner re: 
upcoming filing and contact information; review comments 

2.90 
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on Trpik direct testimony; incorporate same and circulate 
revised draft to Trpik team for review and comment. 

 Fee 4/24/2012  JMW    Review of direct testimony; correspondence regarding same 1.00 

 Fee 4/24/2012  vm    Follow-up with T. Garza regarding training logistics;  

 
follow-up from training 

4.30 

 Fee 4/24/2012  jml    Email correspondence with various attorneys regarding draft 
testimony; compile copies of all draft testimony and organize 
binders for D. Stahl, M. Johnson, and R. Barrett to review 

3.00 

 Fee 4/24/2012  mrj    Email correspondence with R. Brown and K. Houtsma re: 
direct testimony status and edits; coordinate with J. Lipinski 
re: pulling cites; review and finalize next drafts of Trpik and 
Houtsma direct, and circulate to R. Bernet for further 
distribution. 

2.80 

 Fee 4/24/2012  DMS    Emails re Trpik testimony. 0.10 

 Fee 4/25/2012  JMW    Review direct testimony; attend meeting to discuss all rate 
case testimony and issues 

5.20 

 Fee 4/25/2012  mrj    Begin reviewing and commenting on next round of direct 
testimony; participate in final testimony review meeting at 
OFP; begin revising Trpik testimony per comments received. 

7.40 

 Fee 4/25/2012  RCB    Review final drafts of testimony; prepare for and attend final 
testimony review session 

5.70 

 Fee 4/25/2012  vm    Draft email to Susan Rubner of R3 regarding Part 285 
documents; follow-up in phone call with S. Rubner 

0.40 

 Fee 4/25/2012  jml    Prepare materials to bring to R3 for preparation of Initial 
Filing of the 2012 Formula Rate Case 

0.60 

 Fee 4/25/2012  DMS    Testimony review call. 2.70 

 Fee 4/26/2012  JMW    Review direct testimony; provide comments to R. Hemphill 
testimony;  

 office conference with F. 
Fleming regarding update filing review 

2.80 

 Fee 4/26/2012  mrj    Email correspondence with R. Bernet, M. Fruehe, R. Brown 
and E. Long re: addition of Q A to Trpik direct testimony; 
revise Trpik testimony per comments received at final 
testimony review meeting and circulate to team for review 
and comment; email correspondence with R. Bernet, K. 
Houtsma, J. Ratnaswamy and G. Rippie re: preparation of 
officer certification for filing; research and draft same; 
circulate for comment. 

4.40 

 Fee 4/26/2012  jmg    Review, compile, and quality-check various required copy 
sets of the finalized Part 285.150, 285.305, 285.310, 
Schedules, Workpapers, Testimony and Exhibits of Initial 
Reconciliation Filing; confer with production team regarding 
various requirements and compilation logistics 

8.00 

 Fee 4/26/2012  RCB    Draft, review, and revise testimony re rate case expenses; e-
mail correspondence re same; review and revise other draft 
testimony 

3.00 

 Fee 4/26/2012  jml    Review, compile, and quality-check various required copy 
sets of the finalized Part 285.150, 285.305, 285.310, 
Schedules, Workpapers, Testimony and Exhibits of Initial 
Reconciliation Filing; confer with production team regarding 
various requirements and compilation logistics 

7.00 

 Fee 4/27/2012  JMW    Review R. Hemphill testimony and comments; telephone 
conference with G. Rippie and others regarding testimony; 
telephone conference with S. Rubner regarding review of 
filing; office conference with F. Fleming regarding same; 
office 

 

6.70 

 Fee 4/27/2012  mrj    Review comments on Trpik direct and incorporate same; 7.40 
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circulate revised draft to D. Stahl for comment; telephone 
conference with D. Stahl re: same;  

 and prepare draft for review during 
telephone conference; circulate same; participate in 
telephone conference re: same;  
coordinate with J. Trpik and H. Tiberghien re: execution of 
same; telephone conferences and email correspondence with 
G. Rippie and S. Rubner re: same and final versions of Trpik 
and Houtsma direct; telephone conferences with K. Houtsma 
and G. Rippie re: changes to K. Houtsma direct. 

 Fee 4/27/2012  jmg    Review, compile, and quality-check various required copy 
sets of the finalized Part 285.150, 285.305, 285.310, 
Schedules, Workpapers, Testimony and Exhibits of Initial 
Reconciliation Filing; confer with production team regarding 
various requirements and compilation logistics 

7.50  

 Fee 4/27/2012  RCB    Review and revise testimony of M. Fruehe; e-mail 
correspondence re same 

1.50  

 Fee 4/27/2012  jml    Review, compile, and quality-check various required copy 
sets of the finalized Part 285.150, 285.305, 285.310, 
Schedules, Workpapers, Testimony and Exhibits of Initial 
Reconciliation Filing; confer with production team regarding 
various requirements and compilation logistics 

9.00  

 Fee 4/27/2012  DMS    Work on Fruehe testimony. 1.80  

 Fee 4/27/2012  EMR    Confer with J. Lipinski re project status and correspondence 
received 

0.30  

 Fee 4/28/2012  JMW    Perform legal review of rate case testimony at R3 law firm 9.80  

 Fee 4/28/2012  mcho    Review, compile, and quality check testimony re 2012 
Formula Rate Case per J. Lipinski 

5.00  

 Fee 4/28/2012  mrj    Telephone conferences and email correspondence with G. 
Rippie, D. Stahl, J. Wier and R. Barrett re: testimony and 
filing. 

0.50  

 Fee 4/28/2012  jml    Review, compile, and quality-check various required copy 
sets of the finalized Part 285.150, 285.305, 285.310, 
Schedules, Workpapers, Testimony and Exhibits of Initial 
Reconciliation Filing; confer with production team regarding 
various requirements and compilation logistics 

9.50  

 Fee 4/28/2012  EMR    Review and cite check testimony and exhibits re 2012 
Formula Rate Case per J. Lipinski 

6.50  

 Fee 4/29/2012  jmg    Review, compile, and quality-check various required copy 
sets of the finalized Part 285.150, 285.305, 285.310, 
Schedules, Workpapers, Testimony and Exhibits of Initial 
Reconciliation Filing; confer with production team regarding 
various requirements and compilation logistics 

7.30  

 Fee 4/29/2012  jml    Review, compile, and quality-check various required copy 
sets of the finalized Part 285.150, 285.305, 285.310, 
Schedules, Workpapers, Testimony and Exhibits of Initial 
Reconciliation Filing; confer with production team regarding 
various requirements and compilation logistics 

5.50  

 Fee 4/30/2012  JMW    Office conference with J. Lipinski regarding rate case filing 0.50  

 Fee 4/30/2012  mrj    Review and file email correspondence re: filing and drafts of 
testimony; meet with J. Wier re: status of filing. 

1.00  

 Fee 4/30/2012  jml    Set up electronic file organization; search files for Discovery 
Overview PowerPoint presentation and discovery reference 
cheat sheet and forward to D. Kowalewski 

3.00  

 Exp 4/23/2012  DMS  E101   Duplicating Charges 1,840.00  0.10  0.00 0.00 184.00 

 Exp 4/23/2012  DMS  E101   Duplicating Charges 1.00  0.10  0.00 0.00 0.10 

 Exp 4/24/2012  RCB  E107   Delivery services/messengers - Velocity Courier (4/19/12) 1.00     
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Tax Summary 

 

Currency = USD 

 

Tax Code Tax Rate Pretax Total Tax Total Total Including Taxes

(no taxes found) 
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From: Fleming, Frances:(ComEd)
Sent: Thursday, June 28, 2012 11:23 AM
To: Bashqawi, Roxana:(BSC)
Subject: FW: Copy of Invoice 1010859 (ES 2012 FR filing)

10601‐00402‐515050‐12RPDFR11 

From: Bashqawi, Roxana:(BSC)  
Sent: Thursday, June 28, 2012 10:32 AM 
To: Bashqawi, Roxana:(BSC) 
Subject: Copy of Invoice 1010859 
 
 

 

Invoice Header Details  

Vendor Details              Vendor ID EIMER  

Client Details              

Invoice Header Details  

Vendor Name Eimer Stahl, LLP Primary Address 224 S. Michagan Avenue Chicago, IL 60604    Vendor ID EIMER  

 

Invoice Matter Invoice Totals 

Invoice No 1010859 Matter Name 2012 Formula Rate Filing  Fees   

Invoice 
Date 6/20/2012 Matter No  2012-000126  

Fee 
Discount  

Invoice 
Start / End 5/1/2012 - 5/31/2012   Expenses    

Received 6/20/2012   Expense 
Discount  

Allocated 
to Fiscal 
Period  

6/2012   Invoice 
Total    

Invoice 
Type  

Invoice    Adjustments .00 %

Currency USD   

    Invoice Net  

      

     

     

      

      

  Firm Billing 
Arrangement Exelon Team Rate    

  Firm Actual 
(YTD)  

    

RCE 01692
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  Firm Actual 
(LOM)  

    

      

      

Invoice 
Description    

 
 
 
 
 
 

Workflow Details / Comments 

 

    Reviewer Start Date Due Date Action 
Action 
Date Comment 

  O'Brien, Anastasia  6/20/2012  6/28/2012 Approved  6/26/2012  

  O'Neill, Thomas  6/26/2012  7/2/2012     

  Bashqawi, Roxana       

 
 
 
 
 

 All Line Item Details 
 

 

Currency = USD  

 

  Type Date TK Task Act Description Hrs/Units Rate Disc 
Cash 

Adj Net

 Fee 5/31/2012  DMS    Monthly Flat Fee - May 2012 1.00   

 

Exp 5/7/2012  jml  E128   Federal Express - 4/24/12, 4/26/12 
WARNING - E128 is not in the defined list for 
acca_expense  

1.00      

 Exp 5/8/2012  shl  E109   Local travel - Parking 4/29/12 1.00 6.00  0.00 0.00 6.00 

 Exp 5/9/2012  jmg  E109   Local travel - Cab Fare 4/29/12 1.00 19.81  0.00 0.00 19.81 

 Exp 5/14/2012  DMS  E106   Online research - Westlaw (April 2012) 1.00 66.27  0.00 0.00 66.27 

 Exp 5/22/2012  jml  E109   Local travel - Cab Fare/Parking/Gas (4/26/12, 
4/27/12, 4/29/12, 5/20/12) 

1.00 94.99  0.00 0.00 94.99 

 

Exp 5/22/2012  jml  E128   Federal Express - 5/11/12 
WARNING - E128 is not in the defined list for 
acca_expense  

1.00      

 

 

Tax Summary 

 

Currency = USD 

 

Tax Code Tax Rate Pretax Total Tax Total Total Including Taxes
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(no taxes found) 
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From: Fleming, Frances:(ComEd)
Sent: Thursday, August 02, 2012 2:28 PM
To: Bashqawi, Roxana:(BSC)
Subject: FW: Copy of Invoice 1010906

Please charge this as follows: 
10601‐00402‐515050‐12RPDFR11 
 
Thank you! 
 

From: Bashqawi, Roxana:(BSC)  
Sent: Thursday, August 02, 2012 2:22 PM 
To: Fleming, Frances:(ComEd) 
Subject: FW: Copy of Invoice 1010906 
 
Hi Fran 
 
Please provide codeblocks for the attached invoice. 
 
Thanks! 
 

From: Bashqawi, Roxana:(BSC)  
Sent: Thursday, August 02, 2012 2:21 PM 
To: Bashqawi, Roxana:(BSC) 
Subject: Copy of Invoice 1010906 
 
 

 

Invoice Header Details  

Vendor Details              Vendor ID EIMER  

Client Details              

Invoice Header Details  

Vendor Name Eimer Stahl, LLP Primary Address 224 S. Michagan Avenue Chicago, IL 60604    Vendor ID EIMER  

 

Invoice Matter Invoice Totals 

Invoice No 1010906 Matter Name 2012 Formula Rate Filing  Fees   

Invoice 
Date 7/20/2012 Matter No  2012-000126  

Fee 
Discount  

Invoice 
Start / End 6/1/2012 - 6/30/2012   Expenses    

Received 7/20/2012   Expense 
Discount  

Allocated 
to Fiscal 
Period  

7/2012   Invoice 
Total    

RCE 01695
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Invoice 
Type  

Invoice    Adjustments .00 % 0.00 USD

Currency USD   

    Invoice Net  106,777.16 USD

      

     

     

      

      

  Firm Billing 
Arrangement Exelon Team Rate    

  Firm Actual 
(YTD)  

    

  Firm Actual 
(LOM)  

    

      

      

Invoice 
Description    

 
 
 
 
 
 

Workflow Details / Comments 

 

    Reviewer Start Date Due Date Action 
Action 
Date Comment 

  O'Brien, Anastasia  7/20/2012  7/30/2012 Approved  7/24/2012  

  O'Neill, Thomas  7/24/2012  7/30/2012 Expired  8/1/2012   

  Bashqawi, Roxana  8/1/2012  8/6/2012  Approved  8/2/2012   

 
 
 
 
 

 All Line Item Details 
 

 

Currency = USD  

 

  Type Date TK Task Act Description Hrs/Units Rate Disc 
Cash 

Adj Net

 Fee 6/30/2012  DMS    Monthly Flat Fee - June 2012 1.00   

 Exp 6/13/2012  DMS  E106   Online research - Westlaw (May 2012) 1.00 15.71  0.00 0.00 15.71 

 

Exp 6/14/2012  jmg  E126   Ground Transportation - Rental Car/Gas/Tolls 
(5/11/12 - 5/19/12) 
WARNING - E126 is not in the defined list for 
acca_expense  

1.00 304.24  0.00 0.00 304.24 

 

Exp 6/21/2012  jml  E126   Ground Transportation - Rental Car/Gas 
(5/13/12 - 6/13/12) 

1.00 1,317.85  0.00 0.00 1,317.85 

RCE 01696

REDACTED

REDACTED

REDACTED

jlipinski
Sticky Note
None set by jlipinski

jlipinski
Sticky Note
MigrationNone set by jlipinski

jlipinski
Sticky Note
Unmarked set by jlipinski



3

WARNING - E126 is not in the defined list for 
acca_expense  

 

Exp 6/30/2012  jmg  E128   Federal Express - 6/22/12 
WARNING - E128 is not in the defined list for 
acca_expense  

1.00      

 

 

Tax Summary 

 

Currency = USD 

 

Tax Code Tax Rate Pretax Total Tax Total Total Including Taxes

(no taxes found) 
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From: Fleming, Frances:(ComEd)
Sent: Wednesday, August 29, 2012 9:21 AM
To: Bashqawi, Roxana:(BSC)
Subject: FW: Copy of Invoice 1010926 (ES 12-0321)

Please charge to: 
10601‐00402‐515050‐12RPDFR11 
Thanks! 
 

From: Bashqawi, Roxana:(BSC)  
Sent: Tuesday, August 28, 2012 3:15 PM 
To: Fleming, Frances:(ComEd) 
Subject: FW: Copy of Invoice 1010926 
 
Fran 
 
Please provide codeblocks for the attached invoice. 
 
Thanks! 
 
 

From: Bashqawi, Roxana:(BSC)  
Sent: Tuesday, August 28, 2012 3:10 PM 
To: Bashqawi, Roxana:(BSC) 
Subject: Copy of Invoice 1010926 
 
 

 

Invoice Header Details  

Vendor Details              Vendor ID EIMER  

Client Details              

Invoice Header Details  

Vendor Name Eimer Stahl, LLP Primary Address 224 S. Michagan Avenue Chicago, IL 60604    Vendor ID EIMER  

 

Invoice Matter Invoice Totals 

Invoice No 1010926 Matter Name 2012 Formula Rate Filing  Fees   

Invoice 
Date 8/13/2012 Matter No  2012-000126  

Fee 
Discount  

Invoice 
Start / End 7/1/2012 - 7/31/2012   Expenses    

Received 8/13/2012   Expense 
Discount  

Allocated 
to Fiscal 
Period  

8/2012   Invoice 
Total    

RCE 01698

REDACTED

REDACTED

REDACTED

REDACTED

REDACTED

jlipinski
Sticky Note
None set by jlipinski

jlipinski
Sticky Note
MigrationNone set by jlipinski

jlipinski
Sticky Note
Unmarked set by jlipinski



2

Invoice 
Type  

Invoice    Adjustments .00 % 0.00 USD

Currency USD   

    Invoice Net  107,923.78 USD

      

     

     

      

      

  Firm Billing 
Arrangement Exelon Team Rate    

  Firm Actual 
(YTD)  

    

  Firm Actual 
(LOM)  

    

      

      

Invoice 
Description    

 
 
 
 
 
 

Workflow Details / Comments 

 

    Reviewer Start Date Due Date Action 
Action 
Date Comment 

  O'Brien, Anastasia  8/13/2012  8/21/2012 Approved  8/16/2012  

  O'Neill, Thomas  8/16/2012  8/22/2012 Expired  8/24/2012  

  Bashqawi, Roxana  8/24/2012  8/29/2012 Approved  8/24/2012  

 
 
 
 
 

 All Line Item Details 
 

 

Currency = USD  

 

  Type Date TK Task Act Description Hrs/Units Rate Disc 
Cash 

Adj Net

 Fee 7/31/2012  DMS    Monthly Flat Fee - July 2012 1.00   

 

Exp 7/5/2012  jmg  E126   Ground Transportation - Rental Car/Gas/Tolls 
(6/4/12 - 7/5/12) 
WARNING - E126 is not in the defined list for 
acca_expense  

1.00 1,508.64  0.00 0.00 1,508.64 

 

Exp 7/9/2012  jmg  E128   Federal Express - 6/22/12 
WARNING - E128 is not in the defined list for 
acca_expense  

1.00      
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 Exp 7/12/2012   E109   Local travel - Cab Fare to and from meeting 
(6/13/12) 

1.00 12.00  0.00 0.00 12.00 

 

Exp 7/18/2012  jml  E126   Ground Transportation - Rental Car/Gas 
(6/13/12 - 7/13/12) 
WARNING - E126 is not in the defined list for 
acca_expense  

1.00 1,343.78  0.00 0.00 1,343.78 

 

Exp 7/25/2012  npe  E128   Federal Express - 7/13/12 
WARNING - E128 is not in the defined list for 
acca_expense  

1.00      

 

 

Tax Summary 

 

Currency = USD 

 

Tax Code Tax Rate Pretax Total Tax Total Total Including Taxes

(no taxes found) 
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From: Fleming, Frances:(ComEd)
Sent: Wednesday, November 14, 2012 2:54 PM
To: Marquez, Michelle:(BSC)
Subject: FW: Copy of Invoice 1010975 ES 12-0321

And lastly, this s/b charged to:  10601‐00402‐515050‐12PRDFR11. 
Thanks,  
Fran 
 

From: Marquez, Michelle:(BSC)  
Sent: Wednesday, November 14, 2012 12:09 PM 
To: Fleming, Frances:(ComEd) 
Subject: FW: Copy of Invoice 1010975 
 
Hi Fran, 
  
Can you please provide code block for the attached invoice? 
  
Thank you 
 
 

From: Marquez, Michelle:(BSC)  
Sent: Wednesday, November 14, 2012 12:03 PM 
To: Marquez, Michelle:(BSC) 
Subject: Copy of Invoice 1010975 

 

Invoice Header Details  

Vendor Details             Vendor ID EIMER  

Client Details            

Invoice Header Details  

Vendor Name Eimer Stahl, LLP Primary Address 224 S. Michagan Avenue Chicago, IL 60604    Vendor ID EIMER  

Invoice Matter Invoice Totals 

Invoice No 1010975 Matter Name 2012 Formula Rate Filing  Fees   

Invoice 
Date 9/7/2012 Matter No  2012-000126  Fee 

Discount  

Invoice 
Start / End 7/23/2012 - 8/31/2012 Expenses    

Received 9/7/2012 Expense 
Discount  

Allocated 
to Fiscal 
Period  

9/2012  
 

Invoice 
Total    

Invoice Invoice  Adjustments

RCE 01701

REDACTED

REDACTED

REDACTED

REDACTED

REDACTED

REDACTED

jlipinski
Sticky Note
None set by jlipinski

jlipinski
Sticky Note
MigrationNone set by jlipinski

jlipinski
Sticky Note
Unmarked set by jlipinski



2

Type  

Currency USD 

Invoice Net 110,440.00 USD

Firm Billing 
Arrangement Exelon Team Rate  

Firm Actual 
(YTD)    

Firm Actual 
(LOM)    

Invoice 
Description 

 
 
 
 
 

Workflow Details / Comments 

    Reviewer Start Date Due Date Action Action Date Comment 

 

 ShareDoc    Warning   invoice start date 7/23/2012 must be the 
first day of the month, invoice end date 
8/31/2012 must be the last day of the same 
month.  

Bernet, Richard  9/7/2012  9/17/2012  Expired  9/19/2012  

O'Neill, Thomas  9/19/2012  9/25/2012  Expired  9/26/2012  

 Marquez, Michelle  9/26/2012  10/1/2012  Routed by Marquez, 
Michelle  

9/26/2012   

 O'Neill, Thomas  9/26/2012  10/1/2012  Routed by Marquez, 
Michelle  

10/26/2012  

Bernet, Richard  10/26/2012  10/31/2012 Approved  11/12/2012 

Marquez, Michelle  11/12/2012  11/15/2012 Approved  11/14/2012 

 
 
 
 
 
 

 All Line Item Details  

Currency = USD

  Type Date TK Task Act Description Hrs/Units Rate Disc 
Cash 

Adj Net

Fee 8/31/2012  DMS  Monthly Flat Fee - August 2012 1.00   

 

Exp 8/9/2012  jmg  E126   Ground Transportation - Rental Car/Gas/Tolls 
(7/9/12 - 8/8/12) 
WARNING - E126 is not in the defined list for 
acca_expense  

1.00 1,790.27  0.00 0.00 1,790.27 

 

Exp 8/9/2012  jml  E126   Ground Transportation - Gas/Parking/Cabs 
(7/17/12 - 8/6/12) 
WARNING - E126 is not in the defined list for 

1.00 482.66  0.00 0.00 482.66 

RCE 01702
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acca_expense  

Exp 8/9/2012  vm  E106  Online research - LexisNexis (July 2012) 1.00 39.96  0.00 0.00 39.96 

Exp 8/9/2012  DMS  E101  Duplicating Charges 865.00 0.10  0.00 0.00 86.50 

 

Exp 8/10/2012  jml  E128   Federal Express - 7/30/12, 8/1/12 
WARNING - E128 is not in the defined list for 
acca_expense  

1.00      

 

Exp 8/16/2012  jml  E126   Ground Transportation - Rental Car (July/August 
2012) 
WARNING - E126 is not in the defined list for 
acca_expense  

1.00 1,302.70  0.00 0.00 1,302.70 

 

Exp 8/23/2012  jmg  E126   Ground Transportation - Rental Car/Gas (8/9/12 
- 8/23/12) 
WARNING - E126 is not in the defined list for 
acca_expense  

1.00 1,145.68  0.00 0.00 1,145.68 

Exp 8/23/2012  jmg  E109  Local travel - Cab Fare home (8/13/12) 1.00 23.15  0.00 0.00 23.15 

Exp 8/31/2012  DMS  E106  Online research - Westlaw (July 2012) 1.00 399.59  0.00 0.00 399.59 

 

Tax Summary 

Currency = USD 

Tax Code Tax Rate Pretax Total Tax Total Total Including Taxes

(no taxes found) 

  
 

 

 

 

RCE 01703

REDACTED

jlipinski
Sticky Note
None set by jlipinski

jlipinski
Sticky Note
MigrationNone set by jlipinski

jlipinski
Sticky Note
Unmarked set by jlipinski



1

From: Fleming, Frances:(ComEd)
Sent: Tuesday, October 23, 2012 7:33 AM
To: Marquez, Michelle:(BSC)
Subject: FW: Copy of Invoice 1011038 (ES 12-0321)

Please charge 10601-00402-515050-12RPDFR11 
 

From: Marquez, Michelle:(BSC) 
Sent: Mon 10/22/2012 3:45 PM 
To: Fleming, Frances:(ComEd) 
Subject: FW: Copy of Invoice 1011038 

Please provide code block for the attached invoice. 
  
Thank you 
  

From: Marquez, Michelle:(BSC)  
Sent: Monday, October 22, 2012 3:41 PM 
To: Marquez, Michelle:(BSC) 
Subject: Copy of Invoice 1011038 
  
  

 

Invoice Header Details   

Vendor Details               Vendor ID EIMER  

Client Details                

Invoice Header Details  

Vendor Name Eimer Stahl, LLP Primary Address 224 S. Michagan Avenue Chicago, IL 60604    Vendor ID EIMER   

  

Invoice Matter Invoice Totals 

Invoice No 1011038 Matter Name 2012 Formula Rate Filing Fees   

Invoice 
Date 10/12/2012 Matter No  2012-000126  Fee 

Discount  

Invoice 
Start / End 9/4/2012 - 9/30/2012     Expenses    

Received 10/15/2012     Expense 
Discount  

Allocated 
to Fiscal 
Period  

10/2012    Invoice 
Total    

Invoice 
Type  Invoice      Adjustments 

RCE 01704
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Currency USD       

        Invoice Net   98,590.48 USD

             

            

            

            

            

    Firm Billing 
Arrangement Exelon Team Rate      

    Firm Actual 
(YTD) 

      

    Firm Actual 
(LOM) 

      

            

            

Invoice 
Description        

 
 
 
 

 

Workflow Details / Comments  

  

    Reviewer Start Date Due Date Action Action Date Comment 

 

  ShareDoc      Warning   invoice start date 9/4/2012 must be the first 
day of the month, invoice end date 
9/30/2012 must be the last day of the same 
month.  

    Bernet, Richard  10/15/2012  10/23/2012 Approved 10/15/2012   

    O'Neill, Thomas  10/15/2012  10/19/2012 Expired 10/21/2012   

    Marquez, Michelle  10/21/2012  10/24/2012 Approved 10/22/2012   
 
 
 
 
 

 

 All Line Item Details   
 

  

Currency = USD   

  

  Type Date TK Task Act Description Hrs/Units Rate Disc
Cash 

Adj Net
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REDACTED

REDACTED

jlipinski
Sticky Note
None set by jlipinski

jlipinski
Sticky Note
MigrationNone set by jlipinski

jlipinski
Sticky Note
Unmarked set by jlipinski



3

  Fee 9/30/2012  DMS      Monthly Flat Fee - September 2012 1.00   

 

Exp 9/10/2012  jml  E128    Federal Express - 8/28/12
WARNING - E128 is not in the defined list for 
acca_expense 

1.00      

 

Exp 9/13/2012  jml  E126    Ground Transportation - e-tolls (May 2012 - 
August 2012) 
WARNING - E126 is not in the defined list for 
acca_expense 

1.00 357.50  0.00 0.00 357.50 

  Exp 9/17/2012  DMS  E107    Delivery services/messengers - Velocity Courier 
(9/11/12) 

1.00      

  Exp 9/19/2012  DMS  E106    Online research - Westlaw (August 2012) 1.00 55.24  0.00 0.00 55.24 

 

Exp 9/20/2012  jmg  E126    Ground Transportation - Mileage/Cab (8/27/12, 
9/19/12) 
WARNING - E126 is not in the defined list for 
acca_expense 

1.00 51.84  0.00 0.00 51.84 

  Exp 9/20/2012  DMS  E101    Duplicating Charges 1.00 0.10  0.00 0.00 0.10 

  Exp 9/27/2012  jmg  E109    Local travel 1.00 30.83  0.00 0.00 30.83 

  Exp 9/27/2012  jml  E118    Litigation support vendors - C2 Legal 1.00      

  Exp 9/27/2012  jml  E118    Litigation support vendors - C2 Legal 1.00      

  Exp 9/27/2012  jml  E118    Litigation support vendors - C2 Legal 1.00      

  

 

Tax Summary  

  

Currency = USD 

  

Tax Code Tax Rate Pretax Total Tax Total Total Including Taxes

(no taxes found)
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From: Fleming, Frances:(ComEd)
Sent: Wednesday, December 12, 2012 2:45 PM
To: Marquez, Michelle:(BSC)
Subject: FW:  Copy of Invoice 1011121

And this one to: 
10601‐00402‐515050‐12RPDFR11 
 

From: Marquez, Michelle:(BSC)  
Sent: Wednesday, December 12, 2012 10:20 AM 
To: Fleming, Frances:(ComEd) 
Subject: Copy of Invoice 1011121 
 
Can you please provide code block? 
  
Thankyou 
 

From: Marquez, Michelle:(BSC)  
Sent: Wednesday, December 12, 2012 10:19 AM 
To: Marquez, Michelle:(BSC) 
Subject: Copy of Invoice 1011121 

 

Invoice Header Details  

Vendor Details             Vendor ID EIMER  

Client Details            

Invoice Header Details  

Vendor Name Eimer Stahl, LLP Primary Address 224 S. Michagan Avenue Chicago, IL 60604    Vendor ID EIMER  

Invoice Matter Invoice Totals 

Invoice No 1011121 Matter Name 2012 Formula Rate Filing  Fees   

Invoice 
Date 11/19/2012 Matter No  2012-000126  Fee 

Discount  

Invoice 
Start / End 9/12/2012 - 10/31/2012 Expenses    

Received 11/19/2012 Expense 
Discount  

Allocated 
to Fiscal 
Period  

11/2012  
 

Invoice 
Total    

Invoice 
Type  Invoice  Adjustments

Currency USD 

Invoice Net 

RCE 01707
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Firm Billing 
Arrangement Exelon Team Rate  

Firm Actual 
(YTD)  3  

Firm Actual 
(LOM)    

Invoice 
Description 

 
 
 
 
 

Workflow Details / Comments 

    Reviewer Start Date Due Date Action Action Date Comment 

 

 ShareDoc    Warning   invoice start date 9/12/2012 must be the 
first day of the month, invoice end date 
10/31/2012 must be the last day of the same 
month.  

 

 ShareDoc    Warning   inv_start_date 9/12/2012 is more than 60 
days old  

Bernet, Richard  11/19/2012  11/27/2012 Expired  11/29/2012 

O'Neill, Thomas  11/29/2012  12/5/2012  Expired  12/7/2012  

 Marquez, Michelle  12/7/2012  12/11/2012 Routed by Marquez, 
Michelle  

12/7/2012   

Bernet, Richard  12/7/2012  12/12/2012 Approved  12/10/2012 

Marquez, Michelle  12/10/2012  12/12/2012 Approved  12/11/2012 

 
 
 
 
 
 

 All Line Item Details  

Currency = USD

  Type Date TK Task Act Description Hrs/Units Rate Disc
Cash 

Adj Net

Fee 10/31/2012  DMS  Monthly Flat Fee - October 2012 1.00   

 

Exp 10/4/2012  DMS  E126   Ground Transportation - Mileage to and from 
Oakbrook (M. Fruehe testimony) 
WARNING - E126 is not in the defined list for 
acca_expense  

1.00 27.97  0.00 0.00 27.97 

 Exp 10/4/2012  DMS  E107   Delivery services/messengers - Velocity Courier 
(9/19/12) 

1.00      

 

Exp 10/4/2012  jmg  E128   Federal Express - 9/20/12 
WARNING - E128 is not in the defined list for 
acca_expense  

1.00      

Exp 10/12/2012  DMS  E106  Online research - Westlaw (September 2012) 1.00 665.60  0.00 0.00 665.60 

Exp 10/17/2012  mrj  E105  Telephone - Conference Call (9/24/12) 1.00 40.05  0.00 0.00 40.05 
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Exp 10/24/2012  jml  E118  Litigation support vendors - C2 Legal 1.00     0 

Exp 10/31/2012  agc  E109  Local travel - Parking (10/13/12) 1.00 14.00  0.00 0.00 14.00 

Exp 10/31/2012  jmg  E109  Local travel - Cab Fare home (10/11/12) 1.00 21.25  0.00 0.00 21.25 

 

Tax Summary 

Currency = USD 

Tax Code Tax Rate Pretax Total Tax Total Total Including Taxes

(no taxes found) 
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From: Fleming, Frances:(ComEd)
Sent: Monday, December 17, 2012 1:17 PM
To: Marquez, Michelle:(BSC)
Subject: FW: Copy of Invoice 1011158A - ES 12-0321

And this to:  10601‐00402‐515050‐12RPDFR11 
 

From: Marquez, Michelle:(BSC)  
Sent: Monday, December 17, 2012 9:03 AM 
To: Fleming, Frances:(ComEd) 
Subject: Copy of Invoice 1011158A 
 
Fran,  
  
Can you please provide codeblock for the attached invoice? 
  
Thank you 
 

From: Marquez, Michelle:(BSC)  
Sent: Monday, December 17, 2012 8:39 AM 
To: Marquez, Michelle:(BSC) 
Subject: Copy of Invoice 1011158A 

 

Invoice Header Details  

Vendor Details             Vendor ID EIMER  

Client Details            

Invoice Header Details  

Vendor Name Eimer Stahl, LLP Primary Address 224 S. Michagan Avenue Chicago, IL 60604    Vendor ID EIMER  

Invoice Matter Invoice Totals 

Invoice No 1011158A Matter Name 2012 Formula Rate Filing  Fees   

Invoice 
Date 12/7/2012 Matter No  2012-000126  Fee 

Discount  

Invoice 
Start / End 11/1/2012 - 11/30/2012 Expenses    

Received 12/7/2012 Expense 
Discount  

Allocated 
to Fiscal 
Period  

12/2012  
 

Invoice 
Total    

Invoice 
Type  Invoice  Adjustments 

Currency USD 

Invoice Net 

RCE 01710
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Firm Billing 
Arrangement Exelon Team Rate  

Firm Actual 
(YTD)  3  

Firm Actual 
(LOM)    

Invoice 
Description 

 
 
 
 
 

Workflow Details / Comments 

    Reviewer Start Date Due Date Action Action Date Comment 

Bernet, Richard  12/7/2012  12/12/2012 Approved  12/10/2012 

O'Neill, Thomas  12/10/2012  12/12/2012 Expired  12/14/2012 

Marquez, Michelle  12/14/2012  2/22/2013  Approved  12/14/2012 

 
 
 
 
 
 

 All Line Item Details  

Currency = USD

  Type Date TK Task Act Description Hrs/Units Rate Disc Cash Adj Net

Fee 11/30/2012  DMS  Monthly Flat Fee - November 2012 1.00    

Exp 11/5/2012  jml  E109  Local travel - Cab Fare home (8/14/12 - 10/25/12) 1.00 283.88  0.00  0.00 283.88 

Exp 11/5/2012  jml  E109  Local travel - Cab Fare to and from ICC (9/25/12) 1.00 19.65  0.00  0.00 19.65 

Exp 11/5/2012  jml  E118  Litigation support vendors - 1 binders (Garveys) 1.00       

Exp 11/5/2012  jml  E118  Litigation support vendors - 2 binders (Garveys) 1.00       

Exp 11/19/2012  JMW  E105  Telephone - Conference Call (10/10/12) 1.00 14.70  0.00  0.00 14.70 

Exp 11/20/2012  DMS  E106  Online research - Westlaw (October 2012) 1.00 336.79  0.00  0.00 336.79 

 

Tax Summary 

Currency = USD 

Tax Code Tax Rate Pretax Total Tax Total Total Including Taxes

(no taxes found) 
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From: Fleming, Frances:(ComEd)
Sent: Thursday, June 28, 2012 11:30 AM
To: Bashqawi, Roxana:(BSC)
Subject: FW: Copy of Invoice 1010860 (FR2012 exp wit)

Please charge this one to: 
10601‐08522‐515060‐12RPDFR12 
 
Would you have a copy of the invoice from Booz? 
Thanks,  
Fran 

From: Bashqawi, Roxana:(BSC)  
Sent: Thursday, June 28, 2012 10:32 AM 
To: Bashqawi, Roxana:(BSC) 
Subject: Copy of Invoice 1010860 
 
 

 

Invoice Header Details  

Vendor Details              Vendor ID EIMER  

Client Details              

Invoice Header Details  

Vendor Name Eimer Stahl, LLP Primary Address 224 S. Michagan Avenue Chicago, IL 60604    Vendor ID EIMER  

 

Invoice Matter Invoice Totals 

Invoice No 1010860 Matter Name 2012 Formula Rate Experts  Fees   

Invoice 
Date 6/20/2012 Matter No  2012-000127  

Fee 
Discount 

Invoice 
Start / End 5/1/2012 - 5/31/2012   Expenses   

Received 6/20/2012   Expense 
Discount 

Allocated 
to Fiscal 
Period  

6/2012   Invoice 
Total   

Invoice 
Type  

Invoice    Adjustments 

Currency USD   

    Invoice Net  
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  Firm Billing 
Arrangement Exelon Team Rate    

  Firm Actual 
(YTD)  

    

  Firm Actual 
(LOM)  

    

      

      

Invoice 
Description    

 
 
 
 
 
 

Workflow Details / Comments 

 

    Reviewer Start Date Due Date Action 
Action 
Date Comment 

  O'Brien, Anastasia  6/20/2012  6/28/2012 Approved  6/26/2012  

  O'Neill, Thomas  6/26/2012  7/2/2012     

  Bashqawi, Roxana       

 
 
 
 
 

 All Line Item Details 
 

 

Currency = USD  

 

  Type Date TK Task Act Description Hrs/Units Rate Disc Cash Adj Net

 Exp 5/31/2012  DMS  E119   Expert Fees Expenses - Booz Company 1.00       

 

 

Tax Summary 

 

Currency = USD 

 

Tax Code Tax Rate Pretax Total Tax Total Total Including Taxes

(no taxes found) 
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