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From:   Drewes, Dan
Sent:   Monday, August 27, 2012 3:40 PM
To:     Leka, Kathy
Cc:     Toliver, Aaron
Subject:        FW: T11-0061 (TZPR LED's) and T11-0062 (IMRR LED's)

Kathy, FYI re TZPR (T11-0061).

From: Brent Weatherford [mailto:bweatherford@gwrr.com]  
Sent: Monday, August 27, 2012 3:23 PM 
To: Drewes, Dan 
Subject: Re: T11-0061 (TZPR LED's) and T11-0062 (IMRR LED's)

Work completed. I owe you completion report. Think accounts receivable has already sent invoice.  
 
From: Drewes, Dan [mailto:dandrewe@icc.illinois.gov]  
Sent: Monday, August 27, 2012 04:19 PM 
To: Brent Weatherford  
Subject: FW: T11-0061 (TZPR LED's) and T11-0062 (IMRR LED's)  
 
Brent, what is the latest on the TZPR work?

From: Brent Weatherford [mailto:bweatherford@gwrr.com]  
Sent: Monday, July 16, 2012 4:12 PM 
To: Drewes, Dan 
Subject: RE: T11-0061 (TZPR LED's) and T11-0062 (IMRR LED's)

Still in progress, we completed the IMRR and trying to finish the ones on TZPR.  I can give you exactly 
how many we have left tomorrow morning when the signal guys are on site.
Appreciate your patients with this issue, we are trying things have just not been going well.

Thanks

Brent Weatherford  
Chief Engineer  
Illinois Region  
Genesee & Wyoming Inc.  
217-788-8652            Office  
217-788-8654            Fax  
217-801-1578            Cell 

From: Drewes, Dan [mailto:dandrewe@icc.illinois.gov]  
Sent: Monday, July 16, 2012 4:10 PM 
To: Brent Weatherford 
Subject: FW: T11-0061 (TZPR LED's) and T11-0062 (IMRR LED's)

Brent, what is the latest regarding your completion of work in T11-0061?

From: Brent Weatherford [mailto:bweatherford@gwrr.com]  
Sent: Wednesday, June 06, 2012 3:35 PM 
To: Drewes, Dan 
Subject: RE: T11-0061 (TZPR LED's) and T11-0062 (IMRR LED's)
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Mr. Drewes,
We had some procurement issues with the LED replacements.  We are almost completed, and will 
send in completion report as soon as possible.

Thanks,

Brent Weatherford  
Chief Engineer  
Illinois Region  
Genesee & Wyoming Inc.  
217-788-8652            Office  
217-788-8654            Fax  
217-801-1578            Cell 

From: Drewes, Dan [mailto:dandrewe@icc.illinois.gov]  
Sent: Monday, June 04, 2012 1:22 PM 
To: Brent Weatherford 
Subject: T11-0061 (TZPR LED's) and T11-0062 (IMRR LED's)

Brent, by Order requirements, the work in these 2 cases was to have been completed 6/2/12.  Please 
submit your completion reports as soon as possible. 
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