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From:                              Drewes, Dan
Sent:                               Monday, April 02, 2012 3:30 PM
To:                                   Leka, Kathy
Cc:                                   Toliver, Aaron
Subject:                          FW: FW: FW: FW: T10-0176
 
John, thanks for the completion report.  We await submittal of the DOT Forms as required by the Order.
 

From: John Wiehn [mailto:johnwiehn@coe-rr.com] 
Sent: Monday, April 02, 2012 3:12 PM
To: Drewes, Dan
Subject: Re: FW: FW: FW: T10-0176
 
Hi Dan, I wanted to follow up with you on our crossbuck project. All crossbucks have been placed as of 3/1/2012.
Thanks for your help and patience in this matter, John

On Thu, Feb 2, 2012 at 10:56 AM, John Wiehn <johnwiehn@coe-rr.com> wrote:
Hi Dan, sorry for the delay. We are experiencing backhole problems here. We have a 1972 Case tractor and are
constantly having to rehab it, thus the delay in getting the rest of new sign posts up. We still have around 10 to
complete in Marion and all of Herrin. I apoligise again for the delays in completing this project and will finish this
when we get the parts in for our backhole. Thanks, john
 

On Tue, Jan 31, 2012 at 3:10 PM, Drewes, Dan <dandrewe@icc.illinois.gov> wrote:
John, I’m doing my monthly follow-up on this.  Could you give me an update?
 

From: John Wiehn [mailto:johnwiehn@coe-rr.com] 
Sent: Wednesday, December 21, 2011 12:20 PM
To: Drewes, Dan
Subject: Re: FW: FW: T10-0176
 
All of the Yield signs have been placed, we are currently replacing some of the old steel/aluminum post with wooden
ones as time allows us

On Mon, Dec 19, 2011 at 11:15 AM, Drewes, Dan <dandrewe@icc.illinois.gov> wrote:
John, I received your fax Project Status Report with the COMPLETION box checked.  However, I note that in the STATUS OF
WORK paragraph, you state: “Ongoing upgrades to signs at crossings in progress”.  Does this mean only the YIELD sign portion
of the project is completed?
 

From: Drewes, Dan 
Sent: Thursday, December 08, 2011 8:59 AM
To: 'John Wiehn'
Subject: RE: FW: T10-0176
 
Our fax number is (217) 524-4637.  Just send to my attention.  Thanks, Dan.
 

From: John Wiehn [mailto:johnwiehn@coe-rr.com] 
Sent: Tuesday, December 06, 2011 9:43 AM
To: Drewes, Dan
Subject: Re: FW: T10-0176
 
Please send me your fax number and I will send this out ommediately, Thanks John
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On Mon, Dec 5, 2011 at 4:52 PM, Drewes, Dan <dandrewe@icc.illinois.gov> wrote:
John, what is the status of your DOT Form submittals for these crossings as required by the Commission Order?
 

From: John Wiehn [mailto:johnwiehn@coe-rr.com] 
Sent: Monday, July 25, 2011 12:53 PM
To: Drewes, Dan
Subject: Re: T10-0176
 
Could I get your fax number and I will send this info. to you immediately, thanks john

On Mon, Jul 25, 2011 at 11:03 AM, Drewes, Dan <dandrewe@icc.illinois.gov> wrote:
John, how many crossings remain to be completed and what is the status of material ordered/received for the remaining
crossings?
 
From: John Wiehn [mailto:johnwiehn@coe-rr.com] 
Sent: Tuesday, July 12, 2011 1:48 PM
To: Drewes, Dan
Subject: Re: T10-0176
 
Mr. Drews, im sorry to inform you that we have dropped the ball in this matter, the situation is that I ordered half of all
the materials needed to complete half the project, get reinbursed than order the remaining material and finish the
project. I was not informed that we had received the reinbursement until today, although I am aware I should have
filed a an extension when I realized the due date was approaching. If there is anyway I could possibly still apply for
that extension I give you my word that this will be a top priority and be finished immediately. Thank you for any help
you may provide, john

On Mon, Jul 11, 2011 at 1:10 PM, Drewes, Dan <dandrewe@icc.illinois.gov> wrote:
John, the subject Commission Order requires that this xbuck/YIELD sign project be completed by 7/1/11, and that
DOT Forms and a completion notice be submitted 5 days following completion.  Please let us know as to the status of
the project.
 
                Thanks
                                                Dan Drewes
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