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RE: Phil Gomez Billing History - 847 N Maplewood Ave 
From: gomzfugl@netscape.net 
To: john.parise@ComEd.com 
Date: Fri, Sep 4, 20092:45 pm 
John: 1. With regard to 847 N. Maplewood 

on .llrllntly,on the fax you sent me that over 1,800 is due, however my 
numbers came up significantly lower than yours ... ue '.. in ltO your apparemoversightinnQt 
applying the credits listed on the payment history. Also, the second page of your printout 
duplicates the last 2 charges from page 1, which charges you added in twice (8/8107 - 10/5107) 
here is my breakdown by year: 

A. 10/2/06 to 1015107 

Charges: 1,1163.93 
Paid: 688.14 
Credits: 337.48 

Balance 138.31 

B. 10/5/07-1017108 

Charges: 1,219.85 
Paid: 750.00 
Credits: 0 

Balance: 469.85 

C. 1017108 to 8/10/09 

Charges: 1,186.73 
Paid: 500.00 . 
Credits: 0 

Balance: 686.73 

Total: 1,294.~9 

As you can see, on a yearly basis, I did not totally neglect or refuse to pay on the account, but 
rathl<r paid nearly $2,000 in attempt to keep the yearly balance as low as possible despite being 
Uf1d~ severr.~n01DiC distrissl~uring the l~st 2 years. 
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Also. please know that I recently received a notice dated 8/24/09 that I have at least $85.00 on 
deposit on this account (#638333717), bringing the total actual balance down to $1,209.89. I did 
not find this deposit in the printout you sent me, and I also believe that there are additional as of 
yet uncredited deposits in excess of the recently "discovered" $85.00 deposit. 

Notwithstanding and reserving the, deposit(s) issue, if we can agree that the total outstanding on 
. 'is $ 209.8~LlIIJ1 pre~~ to make an immediate payment of$300, with an 

additional, $500 per month for 2 mont SOT c.-, . onthl . billillg 
amounts in the interim), to bring this account current (or leave it with a slight credit) by the end of 
November 2009. 

2. Claimed Past Due 

I note and acknowledge your position that this dispute should proceed to formal hearing, and 
your e-mail stating that Comed has no detailed documentation of the basis for the claimed past 
due. If this is true, it may be difficult if not impossible to resolve the dispute if there are no billing 
records to allow us to perfonn the analysis as done above on 847 Maplewood. 

Thus, I again request any and all records and documents Comed has with regard to all my past 
accounts going back to 2128 W. Barry. Based upon what documentation you have reflecting 
where the claimed past due came from (and how much is for actual service versus late fees and 
deposit charges) I am willing to discuss methodology to attempt to resolve the claimed and 
disputed past due, issue without proceeding to formal hearing. 

I await your reply, please have a nice weekend. 

Sincerely, FNG 

j~----ofiginal Message----­
:Frow:john.p~se@ComEd.co.m 
!To:gomzfugi@netscape.net 
Sent:Thu, Sep 3, 2009 2:27 pm 
Subject: RE: Phil Gomez Billing History - 847 N Maplewood Ave 

,Wekeep 2-years of billing records so I do not have that information, all I have is the billing ~ates 
• and dollars owed. call me to discuss .. ,Thanks! ' , F. I ! 

; . ': i i ~' '!, I, -} 

, HaV~.?\. Safe ~ay.;. ~ .,' 
Jolni'Parise :)1 .. ,.'", , 
Scmi~; Adm{;n~trat()t: •. " • ' 
Reg#latory$t~ateW~s and SeN:~s 
3126943806 1' • '}! 
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312 394 8693 Fax 
john.parise@exeloncorp.com 

-----Original Message-----
From: gomzfiIg1@netsc;ape.net [mailto:gomzfiIg1@netscape.net] 
Sent: Thursday, September 03, 2009 2: 10 PM 
To: Parise, John Jr:(ComEd) 

. Subject- Re' fhiLGomez Billing History - 847 N Maplewood Ave 

Dear John: Just got this & will go over it this afternoon after my 2:00 
appt. (w\lo is here now waiting) and call you then. However, it would 
be helpfill to have a similar prifliouf for eilch of the addresses 
begituJing with 2128 Barry to break down the balance brought forward to 
this account. Tx. FNG 

************************************************** 
This e-mail and any of its attachments may contain Commonwealth 
Edison Company proprietary information, which is privileged, 
confidential, or subject to copyright belonging to Commonwealth 
Edison Company or its affiliates. 
This e-mail is intended solely for the use of the individual or 
entity to which it is addressed. 1f you are not the intended 
recipient of this e-mail, you are hereby notified that any 
dissemination, distribution, copying, or action taken in relation 
to the contents of and attachments to this e-mail is strictly 
prohibited and may be unJawfill. 1f you have received this e-mail 
in error, please notify the sender immediately and permanently 
delete the original and any copy of this e-mail and any printout. 
Thank You. 
****,,********************************************** 

I!' . 

Go .~f>!the nexj: message control+alt+pageup Close message escape i 
. Statllfurd VersionTerms of Service Privacy PolicyTrademarksContext S<;:nsitive iShortcuts 
© 2909 AOL'LLC. All RightsReserved ' 

,I, 

.. 
004E 


