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Christopher Canter

From: Heather Shuler [heather@omnilec.com]
Sent: Friday, May 11, 2007 12:50 PM

To: '‘Christopher Canter'

Subject: FW: Collocation

Payment was made for the colo.

From: Michael Shuler [mailto:mike@amnilec.com]
Sent: Friday, August 26, 2005 4:35 PM

To: 'CORUDD@aol.com’

Subject: RE: Cotiocation

The payment has been dropped off at the Pekin business office.

Michael Shuter, C.E.C.

OmniLEC And BitWise Communications, Inc.
682 High Point Lane

East Peona, L 61611

OmniNumber: (309) 670-0575

Fax: (309) 213-3500

E-Mail: Mike@OmniLEC.com

Customer Service: (877) 976-0711

—---Original Messaga---—-

From: Michael Shuler fmailto:mike@omnilec.com]
Sent: Friday, August 26, 2005 3:18 PM

To: 'CORUDD@ao!.com’

Subject: RE: Callacation

Sony about the lack of responise, | was out of the office for a few days. | will head cver [0 see Karen Lewis
today with a check for 35,816.59 and | wil! fax the signed sheets to you.

o

Michael Shuler, C.E.O.

OmnilLEC And BitWise Communications, Inc.
682 High Point Lane

East Pearig, iL 61611

OmniNurnber; (308) 670-0575

Fax: (309) 213-3500

E-Mail: Mike@OmniLEC.com

Customer Service: (877) 976-0711

————— Criginal Message--—-

From: DORUDD®@aol.com [mailto: DORUDD@acl.com]
Sent: Tuesday, August 23, 2005 1(:33 AM

To: mike@omnilec.com

6/22/2007
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