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Christopher Canter

From: Stephen Murray [murrays@madisonriver.net]
Sent:  Tuesday, January 23, 2007 9:57 AM

To: sm@commiawgroup.com’

Cec: ‘Michael Shuler’; Karen Lewis

Subject: RE: Order Suspension

Jonathan, sorry that | did not gel back to you yesterday. The Order suspension has been lifted and GRC is
processing Bitwise Orders.

There is one outstanding issue and that has to do with a minor amount of $200.00, which is the cutstanding
amount refevant to the 911 circuits.

Mike, please make payment for the $200.00 as soon as you can... Also, | believe that Karen Lewis will be making
a follow up call to you..

Stephen V. Murray

Director, Regulatory Affairs

Madison River Communications, LLC
103 So. 5th Street

Mebane, NC 27302

019-563-8109

202-258-1657 cel
murrays@madisonriver.net

----- Criginal Message~----

From: Jonathan S. Marashlian [mailto:jsm@commiawgroup.com]
Sent: Monday, January 22, 2007 12:40 PM

To: 'Stephen Murray'

Cc; 'Michael Shuler'

Subject: Order Suspension

Importance: High

Stephen -

It appears GRC is maintaining its suspension of BitWise's ability to process orders for service to this day,
despite my client's goad faith payment of $24,000 last week. | thought we had an agreement that if
BitWise made goad faith payment (which it has), that you would make sure the suspension was lifted and
would also refrain from demanding a deposit. We held up our end of this bargain and | know that you will
hold up yours, despite what | imagine is some resistance from Mr. Miri. Perhaps, as a lawyer, you can
explain to Fred the consequences of the order suspension in light of the existence of an ICA whose terms
have not been adhered to by GRC. | know that Fred would like to view the situation as a continuous 13-
month relationship, but in reality (and that's all the law cares about), we're dealing with a new ICA that
was only recently appraved by the ICC; an ICA whose terms are being flaunted by GRC at this very
moament, GRC's actions can only be viewed one way -- retaliatory.

Let's get the ordering suspension lifted immediately. If my client cannot process orders by COB today, |
will have no option but to contact the ICC first thing in the morning to lodge a complaint.

Thank you. |look forward to your update to this matter [ater today.

Regards,
Jonathan

6/22/2007
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Jonathan 8. Marashlian

Helein & Marashlian, LLC

The Commiaw Group

1483 Chain Bridge Road, Suite 301 :
MeLean, Virginia 22101
Tel: 703-714-1313 i
Fax; 703-714-1330

E-Fax: Y03-291-2557

E-mail: jsm@CommlawGroup.com
Web: www,CommlLawGroup.com

Pursuant to Treasury Regulations, any U.S. federal tax advice contained in this communication, unless ctherwise stated, is not intended and
cannot ba used for the purpose of avoiding tax-related penalties.

This message contains confidential information belonging te the sender, which is intended io be fegally priviieged and confidential and/or a
purely private communication between the sander and the recipientis). The information contained herein, including any atlachments, is
intended only for the use of the recipient{s). If you are nat a named recipientis}, or an employee or agent responsible for delivering it to a
narned recipient, you are advised and placed on notice that any disclosure, copying, distributlon, the taking of any action or refraining from an
action in refiance on the contents or information contained in this message and any aftachmest is stictly prohiibited and may be legally
actionable. If you have received this message or any pertion of it in erros, please immediately advise the sender by return emait to
ism@CommLawGroup.com, with a capy to mail@CommLawGroup.com and delete the message and any attachments and destroy any
hardeopies made by you or others. If you have forwarded this message or any portion of it ta anothet or others, you must notify us
immediately of their proper email or other addresses and you are to notify them of the privileged and confidential nature of this message and
to take action to delete the message and its attachmenis and 10 destroy any hardcopies. Thank you.
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