Christopher Canter

From: Michael Shuler [mike@omnilec.com]
Sent: Tuesday, December 12, 2006 2:47 PM
To: 'Stephen Murray'

Subject: Reciprocal Compensation

BitWise is seeing more than 100,000 minutes per month of wire-line local traffic onginated by Gallatin in addition to & traffic
exchange in excess of a 80/40 ratio in excess of three months. Par our ICA we are requesting to apply the "Usage Rate”
stated below. Since the CDR records are too farge for email | have not included them. If needed we can provide verifiable
traffic information as stated below via FTP or CD-ROM.

5. Reciprocal Compensation: The Parties reserve the right to apply the

Reciprocal Compensation Transport and Termination Usage Rate {"Usage Rate") of $0.015 per Minute of Use in the event
that A) a Party terminates 100,000 or more minutes per month of wire-line local traffic originated by the other Party for a
period af three (3) consecutive months, and B} the representative proportion of total wire-line focal traffic exchanged
between the Parties exceeds 60440 ratio. When such threshold is met, either Party may provide the other Parly a written
request, along with verifiable traffic information supporting such request, to establish the application of the Usage Rate.
Notwithstanding the language above, neither party shall compensate each other for Internet Bound traffic, and for Internet
Service Provider (ISP) traffic, except as otherwise provided for in this agreement.

Michael Shuler, C.E.O.

OmniLEC And BitWise Communications, Inc,
331 Fulton Suite 300

Peoria, IL 61602

OmniNumber: (309) 670-0575

Fax; (309) 689-1897

E-Mail: Mike@QOmniLEC.com

Customer Service: (877) NEW-OMNI



mailto:Mlke@OinniLEC.com

Christopher Canter

From: Michael Shuler [mike@omnilec.comj]
Sent: Tuesday, December 19, 2006 1:38 PM
To: "'Stephen Murray'

Cc: jsm@thiglaw.com

Subject: FW: Gazllatin River CDRs - 11302008-0
Attachments: ATTOD270 dat

-
=
ATT00270.dat (6
MB)
This is a simplified CDR CSY for 11/2008 (for

aasy import into Excel)

Michael Shuler, C.E.O.

OmniLEC And Bitwise Communications, Inc.
331 Fulton Suite 300

Peoria, IL 81602

OmniNumber: (309) 670-0575

Fax: (309) 689-1897

E-Mail; Mike@OmniLEC.com

Customer Service: (B77) NEW-OMNI

~——-0riginal Message---—

From: OmnilLEC - Bitwise Communications Support [matilto:suppart@omnilec.cam]
Sent: Tuesday, December 19, 2006 12:08 PM

To: mike@omnilec.com; monica@omniisc.com

Subject: Galiatin River CORs - 11302006-0

Attached is the CSV file for Gallatin River's CDR's.
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Christopher Canter

From: Michael Shuter [mike@omnilec.com]
Sent: Tuesday, December 12, 2006 1.26 PM
To: 'Stephen Murray'

Cc: jsm@thiglaw.com

Subject: FW: Gallatin River CDRs - 09302006-0
Attachments: ATTO0246 dat

ATT00246.dat (5

MB)

This 1s a simplified CDR CSV for 972008 (for easy import into Excel)

Michael Shuler, C.E.O.

OmniLEC And BitWise Communications, Inc.
331 Fuiton Suite 200

Peoria, IL 61602

OmniNumber: (308} 670-0575

Fax: (309) 689-1897

E-Mail: Mike@OmniLEC.com

Custormer Service: (877) NEW-OMNI

-—--Qriginal Message-—--

From: Omnil.EC - Bitwise Communications Support mailto:support@omnilec.com]
Sent: Tuesday, December 18, 2006 11:57 AM

To: mike@omnilec.com; monica@omnilec.com

Subject: Gallatin River CDRs - 08302008-0

Attached is the CSV file for Gallatin River's CDR's.
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Christopher Canter

From: Michael Shuler [mike@omnilec.com]
Sent: Tuesday, December 19, 2006 1:37 PM
To: ‘Stephen Murray'

Ce: jsm@thiglaw.com

Subject: FW: Gallatin River CDRs - 10312006-C

Attachments: ATTQ0261 dat

ATTO0261.dat (7
MB)
This is a simplified CDR CSV for 10/2006 (for easy import into Excel)

Michaet Shuler, C.E.O.

CmnilLEC And BitWise Communications, Inc.
331 Fulton Suite 300

Peoria, IL 81602

OmnriNumber: (309) 670-0575

Fax: (309) 689-1897

E-Mail: Mike@Omnit EC.com

Customer Service: {877} NEW-OMNI

-—-QOriginal Message--—-

From: OmniLEC - Bitwise Communications Support [mailte: support@omnilec.com]
Sent: Tuesday, December 19, 2006 12:04 PM

To. mike@omnilec.com; monica@omnilec.com

Subject: Gallatin River CDRs - 10312006-0

Attached is the CSV file for Galiatin River's CDR's.
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Christopher Canter

From: Michael Shuler [mike@omnilec.com]
Sent: Tuesday, December 19, 2006 2:22 PM
To: ‘Stephen Murray'

Ce: jsm@thiglaw.com

Subject: BifWwWise CDR's

Follow Up Flag: Follow up

Flag Status: Red

| tried emailing them to you but they bounced back. They can be downloaded from the folowing URL:

hitp-/fwww.omnilec.com/Gallatin/

Michael Shuler, C.E.O.

OmniLEC And BitWise Communicaticns, Inc.
331 Fulton Suite 300

Peoria, IL 681602

OmniNumber: (309} 670-0575

Fax: (309) 689-1897

E-Mait: Mike@OmnilLEC.com

Customer Service: (877) NEW-OMNI
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Christopher Canter

From: Michael Shuler [mike@omnitec.com]
Sent: Tuesday, December 19, 2006 5:36 PM
To: _ "Stephen Murray'

Cc: jsm@thiglaw.com

Subject: Gallatin Summary Bills

Follow Up Flag: Follow up
Flag Status: Red
Attachments: Bitwise Communications - Gallitin River INVOICE - September 2006.htm; Bitwise

Communications - Gallitin River INVOICE - Movember 2006 .htm; Bitwise Cormmunications -

Gallitin River INVOICE - October 2008 htm

Here are the summary bills of the 3 CDR files available for download.

Michael Shuler, CE.Q.

OmniLEC And BitWise Communications, Inc.
331 Fulton Suite 300

Peoria, IL 61602

OmniNumber; (309) 670-0575

Fax: (309) 689-1897

E-Mail: Mike@OmniLEC.com

Customer Service: (§77) NEW-OMNI

6/24/2007
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Bitwise Communications - Gallitin River INVOICE file:///C:/Documents%20and%20Settings/ccanter/Local%%20Settings...

BitWise Communications

331 Fulton Street, Suite 300 INVOICE
Peoria, IL 61602 # 09302006
Phone (309) 689 0711 Toll Free (877) New-Omni Fax: (309) 689 1897
BILL TO SERVICE DATE DUE BEFORE
Gallatm R.IVE:I’

Attn: Reciprocal Compensation Accounts Payable |

200 Enterprise Drive ! F 09/(1/2006 - 09/30/2006 ~ 10/15/2006
Riverway Business Park I[ 1

Pekin, IL 61554 :”' ‘ :

S = tmmme S

DESCRIPTION AMOUNT ‘

——

S

Total Inbound Mm 71(}269 min. and 16 sec.
Total Outbound Min.: 52008 min. and 42 sec.
Total Under 3:1 Billing Rule Minutes @ $0.015 Per Min.: 156026 min.

and 6 sec.
Total Over 3:1 Billing Rule Minutes @ $0.0000 Per Min.: 554243 min. $2,340.39 1
and 10 sec. $0.00

Charges For {)9/01}‘2006 09/30/2006 $2,340.39}

6/24/2007 2:08 PM

loft




Bitwise Communications - Gallitin River INVOICE file:/{/C:/Documents%20and%20Settings/ccanter/Local%20Settings...

BitWise Communications
331 Fulton Street, Suite 300 INVOICE
Peoria, 1L 61602 #10312006

Phone (309) 689 0711 Toll Free (877) Ncw~0mn1 Fax: (309) 689 1897
BILL TO SERVICE DATE DUE BEF ORE
Gailatm River
Attn: Reciprocal Compensation Accounts Payable
200 Enterprise Drive 10/01/2006 - 10/31/2006 ; 11/15/2006
Riverway Business Park '
Pekin, IL 61554

DESCRIPTION AMOUNT

Total Tnbound Mm 960017 min. and 7 sec.

Total Outhound Min.: 74587 min. and 56 sec.
Total Under 3:1 Billing Rule Minutes @ $0.015 Per Min.: 223763 min.

and 48 sec.

Total Over 3:1 Billing Rule Minutes @ $0.0000 Per Min.: 736253 min. $3,356.46

and ]9 sec. $0.00
P Charges For 10/01/2006 - 1073 L/2006 $3 356 46

0 Ml 0L e e

lofl ' 6/24/2007 2:08 PM




Bitwise Communications - Gallitin River INVOICE

BitWise Communications
331 Fulion Street, Suite 300
Peoria, IL 61602

Phone: (309) 689-0711

Toll Free (877) New—Omm

file:///C:/Mocuments%20and%620Settings/ccanter/Local%20Settings. .

INVOICE
# 11302006

Fax: (309) 639-1897

BILL TD SERVICE DATE DUE BEFORE
Gallatm ijer i
Attn: Reciprocal Compensation Accounts Paya ble r
200 Enterprise Drive 11/01/2006 | 1/30/2006 12/15/2006
Riverway Business Park
Pekin, IL 61554 ‘%

DESCRIP i lON AMOUNT
Total Inbound Min.: 956014 min. and 23 sec.
Total Outbound Min.: Y1771 min. and 6 sec.
Total Under 3:1 Billing Rule Minutes @ $0.015 Per Min.: 215313 min.
and 18 sec.
Total Over 3:1 Billing Rule Minutes (@ $0.0000 Per Min.: 740701 min. $3,229.70
and 5 sec. $0 00 |
Chalges Eor 11!01/2006 11/30/’)006 $3,229.70

lofl

6/24/2007 2.08 PM




