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David Apps

From: BRADFORD, WALTER G (ASI-AIT) [wb1632@att.com]
Sent:  Monday, July 31, 2006 3:57 PM
To: INDYBILLING (AIT)

Cc: Davea@appscorp.net; ZUBER, CHARLES D (ASI-AIT); CAMPBELL, KATRINA (ASI-AIT); BUSCH,
SARAH N (ASI-AIT)

Subject: FW: Verizon Part of Gjvoick
indy Bitling,

Please confirm pricing for the circuit referenced in the correspondence below and per the attached contract for
reference. The circuit is a meet point with Verizon (9% BIF) and legacy SBC (91% BIP). Customer is now
receiving Invoices from both AT&T & Verizon. Customer also indicates that Verizon received a contract indicating
service was signed by customer at 60 month term (how wouid this be possible?).

Thanks in advance for your assistance in this matter,
Walter
847-248-2105

From: David Apps [mailto:davea@appscorp.net]

Sent: Monday, July 31, 2006 2:20 PM

To: BRADFORD, WALTER G (ASI-AIT); GILSON, MANDY M (ASI-AIT)
Cc: Alif #2

Subject; Verizon Part of Gjvoick

Altn: Waiter Bradford,
Re: Circuit ordered for Gjoivik Auto in Sandwich IL in May of 2005

In regards to the discussion we had last week about the Verizon bill | received on the Gjovik circuit {(SBC circuit ID
# HCGS.929718). I've had time to pull all the backups of Erik’s email and review them. There is no Verizon
contract with the order and the SBC contract lists the customer address as the Z end of the circuit. | do see where
you listed that the iast 9% of the circuit was Verizon but never said it was not included in the contract. If in fact you
were only providing transport to the last SBC POP that should have been stated on the contract. 'm sure your
legal department will tell you that it is the reasonability of the party drafting the contract to specify clearly what is
included. Anything left open to interpretation will be ruled in favor of the other party.

I've contacted Verizon on the bill we received from them and they tell me that a contract for 80 months was
signed by or for Apps Communications in July of this year. | have signed no such contract. The contract was
requested in May of 2006 by Mandy and returned in July of 2006 by Mandy. | have requested a copy of the
contract be sent to me.

Walter when | asked you last week why if the Verizon portion of this circuit was not included in the SBC contract |
was not given a Verizon contract back in May of 2005 with the SBC contract. Your response was that the Verizon
portion of the circuit was my responsibility and that you could supply a Verizon contract. If that is the case why is
Mandy requesting a Verizon Contract for this circuit now and who signed the contract for Apps Communications?

There seems to be a problem with this circuit. | never signed a contract with Verizon in 2005 and | did not sign the
contract with Verizon in May, June or July of this year.

| would suggest we get to the bottom of this before it gets to a point were Lawyers are brought in.

| have sent a copy of this email to United Forensics; | will be working with them and handwriting experts to
analyze the Verizon contract,
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Thank You

David R. Apps

Phone: 800-861-0540
Fax: 708-873-1310
davea(@appscorp.net
http://www.appscorp.net

10/13/2006
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David Apps

From: jennifer.wootten@verizon.com

Sent: Tuesday, September 05, 2006 3:41 PM
To: davea@appscorp.net

Subject: AAPS Communications

;

—

AAPS to Dave.doc
(33 KB)

Hi Dave -

It would be a capitel B for Business.

(See attached file: AAPS to Dave.doc)

Thank you for choosing Verizon, we appreciate your business!

Jenny Wootten

Verizon Business Collections Center - Hershey
1135 E. Chocolate Avenue

Hershey, PA 17033

1-800-440-8052

1-866-237-0645 fax

The information contained in this message and any attachment{s} may be proprietary,
confidential and privileged or subject to the work product doctrine and thus protected
from disclosure. If the reader of this message is not the intended recipient, or an
employee or agent responsible for delivering this message to the intended recipient, you
are hereby notified that any dissemination, distribution or copying of this communication
is strictly prohibited. If you have received this communication in error, please notify
me immediately by replying to this message and deleting it and all copies and backups
thereof. Thank vou.
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To: David
From: Jenny Wootten - Verizon

Subject: AAPS Communication — M106F21025105

Hi Dave -

Per our conversation, I am sending you this email to just confirm with you what I am
doing on your account. While I was on the phone with you, 1 received a message from
Debria. She stated that she does not have a copy of the contract, but has put in a phone
call to the ISP group. So we are waiting on a response from them. Also, below is a
screen print of what I was sent regarding the circuit and who put it in, and where it runs
to and from.

Contact Section

IMP CONT: MANDY GILSON  Tel#: 2189725952
Primary Location: ALLEGIANCE Secondary Location: GIOVIK FORD

TELECOM MERCURY INC

ADDRESS: 111 W FRANKLIN ADDRESS: 2600 US ROUTE 34 EAST
AV

BLDG/FL/RM.: // BLDG/FL/RM.: //

City, ST: NAPA City, ST: SANDWICH,Illinois
VALLEY Illinois

PRI Contact: ERIK SUNDBERG  SEC Contact: ERIC SUNDBERG
Access TEL #: 7084039200 Access TEL #: 7084039200
ALCON: ALCON:

ALCON TEL: ALCON TEL:

ACCESS-INFO: ACCESS INFO:

ACCESS PAGER: ACCESS PAGER:

ACCESS PIN: ACCESS PIN:

EU CONTACT: EU CONTACT:

EU TEL#: EBU TEL#:




It is the IMP Contact that requested the circuit be put in.
Thank you for choosing Verizon, we appreciate your business!

Jenny Wootten

Verizon Business Collections Center - Hershey
1135 E. Chocolate Avenue

Hershey, PA 17033

1-800-440-8052

1-866-237-0645 fax

The information contained in this message and any attachment(s) may be proprietary,
confidential and privileged or subject to the work product doctrine and thus protected
from disclosure. If the reader of this message is not the intended recipient, or an
employee or agent responsible for delivering this message to the intended recipient, you
are hereby notified that any dissemination, distribution or copying of this communication
is strictly prohibited. If you have received this communication in error, please notify me
immediately by replying to this message and deleting it and all copies and backups
thereof. Thank you.




